

*Ehrenhaus v. Baker*, Civ. A. No: 08-CVS-22632

Affidavit of Carl L. Stine, dated February 8, 2013

# EXHIBIT D

**Matter**

<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Date Worked</b>	<b>Hours</b>
<b>1768 / 3253 Irving Ehrenhaus (40) / Ehrenhaus v. John D. Baker II, et al. (Wachovia)</b>		
Anthony Cichocki	9/29/2008	0.50
WACHOVIA- distribute note regarding acquisition of Wachovia's bank assets		
Anthony Cichocki	10/3/2008	1.50
WACHOVIA- review and evaluate bid by Wells Fargo		
Carl L. Stine	10/3/2008	2.00
WACHOVIA -- rev. emails; tel w/CBW; meet w/RMK; meet w/AC; rsch. re vote disenfranchise cases		
Chet B. Waldman	10/3/2008	0.60
WACHOVIA/WELLS FARGO -- Rev'd. numerous articles, e-mails from AC, CLS; p/cs w/CLS, RMK in connection w/case investigation		
Robert M. Kornreich	10/3/2008	0.20
cw CLS, tw CBW re new case		
Anthony Cichocki	10/6/2008	0.50
WACHOVIA- email filed documents to C Stine, C Waldman, A Green		
Anthony D. Green	10/6/2008	6.20
WACHOVIA: Drafting complaint; Investigating case; Emails & conference with CLS, CBW & AC.		
Robert M. Kornreich	10/6/2008	0.60
WACHOVIA -- csw/CBW, CLS, RCF re: new case		
Carl L. Stine	10/6/2008	4.00
WACHOVIA -- read emails; mtgs. w/RCF, CBW, RMK & AG re possible case; rsch. for same; rev. draft complt.		
Chet B. Waldman	10/6/2008	1.70
WACHOVIA -- P/c w/potential pltf., G. Jones; mtgs. w/CLS, EM, ADG, RMK, RCF; rev'd. relevant news articles, AC analysis in connection w/case investigation		
Robert C. Finkel	10/6/2008	1.00
WACHOVIA - confs w/CBW, RMK, CLS re possible new matter		
Anthony D. Green	10/7/2008	1.30
WACHOVIA: Conference with CBW, CLS and Greg Jones; Revising complaint; Emails.		
Robert M. Kornreich	10/7/2008	1.00
WACHOVIA - R&R news stories		
Carl L. Stine	10/7/2008	4.50
WACHOVIA -- Rev. federal complt.; rev. news stories; rev. & edit draft complt.; tel & email w/CBW, ADG re same; send fnal comp. to local counsel; tel & email w/local counsel re filing; research re NC law		
Chet B. Waldman	10/7/2008	1.40
WACHOVIA -- E-mail, p/c w/clients, p/cs w/ADG, CLS, rev'd. & edited draft complt., e-mails to & from G. Jones, CLS re: filing complt.		
Anthony Cichocki	10/7/2008	0.50
WACHOVIA- find and calculate Wachovia/Citi complaint		
Anthony D. Green	10/8/2008	4.60
WACHOVIA: drafting document requests; conference with CLS.		
Chet B. Waldman	10/8/2008	0.90
WACHOVIA -- Rev'd. complt. filed by Citigroup against Wachovia; p/cs w/ADG, RMK, mtgs. w/CLS, EM re: filing complt., drafting doc. request, lit. strategy		

**Matter**

<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Date Worked</b>	<b>Hours</b>
<b>1768 / 3253 Irving Ehrenhaus (40) / Ehrenhaus v. John D. Baker II, et al. (Wachovia)</b>		
Carl L. Stine	10/8/2008	3.30
Emails & tels w/local counsel re filing; meets w/CBW, RMK, ADG re same; review & edit draft complt.; rsch. re NC law & procedure; begin reading First Union decision; tel w/client; email him draft complt.		
Robert M. Kornreich	10/8/2008	0.80
cws CLS, CBW re filing complaint		
Carl L. Stine	10/9/2008	1.00
Finish reading First Union decision		
Shirley Joseph	10/10/2008	0.70
WACHOVIA - prep new matr rpt; rev new case file; prep CLS engagement ltr		
Anthony D. Green	10/10/2008	5.80
WACHOVIA: Drafting document requests, motion for preliminary injunction, motion to expedite proceedings and proposed order; Conference with CLS; Researching North Carolina law.		
Carl L. Stine	10/10/2008	5.60
Rev. emails re merger agmt. & stock exchange agmt.; rev. same; rev. file-stamped complt.; tel w/CBW re same; tel & email w/ADG re expedited motion; rev. draft of same & order & p.i. motion; tel w/ADG re doc. req.; rev. final of same; tel w/other N.C. lawyer re case; review file-stamped complt.		
Chet B. Waldman	10/10/2008	0.40
Rev'd. relevant news articles, p/cs w/CLS re: compl. filing, local counsel, moving for expedited discovery & other issues		
Robert M. Kornreich	10/10/2008	2.00
cw CBW, CLS re filing case and local counsel.		
Anthony Cichocki	10/10/2008	1.90
WACHOVIA- research timing of transaction and distribute note		
Chet B. Waldman	10/11/2008	0.10
Rev'd. news of Citigroup's bid withdrawal		
Carl L. Stine	10/13/2008	0.50
Email w/local counsel re designations & expedition; meet w/RMK re same.		
Anthony Cichocki	10/13/2008	1.00
WACHOVIA- respond to questions regarding Citi deal		
Robert M. Kornreich	10/13/2008	0.50
CW CLS re status, local counsel		
Anthony D. Green	10/14/2008	6.40
Conference with CLS; Revising expedited proceedings motion; Researching North Carolina law.		
Carl L. Stine	10/14/2008	3.20
Revise expedited motion & doc. req. & send to local counsel for comment; tel w/AG re NC law on expedited motion		
Carl L. Stine	10/16/2008	1.40
Tel w/local counsel re status; tel w/J. Tennille's clerk re missing forms; emails re designation forms		
Chet B. Waldman	10/17/2008	0.30
Mtg. w/CLS re: case status update; rev'd. relevant news stories in this connection		
Anthony D. Green	10/17/2008	0.40
Reviewing new SEC filings; conference with CLS		

**Matter**

<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Date Worked</b>	<b>Hours</b>
<b>1768 / 3253 Irving Ehrenhaus (40) / Ehrenhaus v. John D. Baker II, et al. (Wachovia)</b>		
Carl L. Stine	10/17/2008	1.30
	Meet w/CBW re case status; rev. emails from business court; tel w/AG re status of preferred	
Anthony D. Green	10/20/2008	0.40
	Emails with CLS; Reviewing recent SEC filings.	
Chet B. Waldman	10/20/2008	0.70
	P/cs, e-mails w/CLS re: recent events, litig. strategy, assignment of Judge; rev'd. relevant news re: merger	
Carl L. Stine	10/20/2008	2.80
	Emails re notice; rev. same; meet w/AC; tel w/CBW; tel w/local counsel; call w/J. Diaz's clerk re his questions; leave msg. w/lawyer at Boies; talk to same & tel w/N.C. lawyer; tel w/journalist from Charlotte Business Journal; rev. article; met w/RMK re same.	
Anthony Cichocki	10/20/2008	0.10
	Cw CLS re notice	
Robert M. Kornreich	10/20/2008	0.50
	CWs CLS re reporter call and article on web	
Chet B. Waldman	10/21/2008	0.80
	Numerous mtgs. w/CLS to discuss expedited discovery, lit. strategy, his p/cs w/def'ts counsel, class members, news organization	
Anthony D. Green	10/21/2008	4.60
	Speaking with shareholders about the recently filed class action; Conference with CLS; Reading filing re: preferred shares transfer to Wells Fargo.	
Carl L. Stine	10/21/2008	9.00
	Tels & emails from Wachovia shareholders; tel w/Judge's clerk; conf. call w/def's counsel; send doc. req. to R. Fuller; read Business Court Rules; rev. email from Judge's clerk re procedures; emails & meet w/AG re same; meets w/CBW & RMK re same; rev. SEC filing re preferred shares; rev. news stories, including stmts. by Sheila Bair; second call w/def's counsel; draft email re same	
Robert M. Kornreich	10/21/2008	1.50
	CLS re strategy	
Anthony D. Green	10/22/2008	4.30
	Researching change in control agreements; Drafting amended motion to expedite proceedings; Conference with CLS.	
Carl L. Stine	10/22/2008	11.00
	Email w/local counsel re filings; conf. call w/NC Treas, CBW, MB; call w/def's counsel re exped. discovery; meet w/CBW, RMK re same; many calls & emails w/shareholders; locate & watch video of Steel on Cramer; rev. bailout language from Wachovia v. Citigroup complt.; locate & rev. timelines from Charlotte Observer; meets & emails re potential financial adviser; meets w/AG re expedited motion; rev. draft re same; rev. def's draft email to Ct. re schedule.	
Chet B. Waldman	10/22/2008	2.40
	Participated in conf. call w/N.C. Treasurer's office w/CLS, MB; multiple mtgs. w/RMK, CLS re: lit. strategy, expedited discovery, expert; rev'd. e-mails & articles relevant to above	
Anthony Cichocki	10/22/2008	0.50
	Per C Stine request, distribute top 50 holders list for both Wachovia and Wells Fargo	
Robert M. Kornreich	10/22/2008	1.00
	cw CLS re conf. call w/def'ts re expedited discovery, etc.	
Robert M. Kornreich	10/22/2008	0.50
	cw MB, CBW, CLS re NC	
Robert M. Kornreich	10/22/2008	1.50
	cw CBW re: legal theories	
Carl L. Stine	10/23/2008	10.00

**Matter**

<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Date Worked</b>	<b>Hours</b>
<b>1768 / 3253 Irving Ehrenhaus (40) / Ehrenhaus v. John D. Baker II, et al. (Wachovia)</b>		
Rsch. & revise Amended expedited brief; draft Motion & revise prop. Order; emails & tels w/local counsel re same; circulate to CBW; meets w/CBW, RMK re same; revise, finalize & serve & send to Ct.; also, emails re prop. schedule, w/defs' counsel & Judge's clerk; rev. draft consent order; emails & meets w/AC re golden parachutes; emails w/N.C.; rsch. re EESA		
Shirley Joseph Prep rpt	10/23/2008	0.50
Chet B. Waldman	10/23/2008	2.90
Rev'd., edited & drafted portions of pltf's Brief in Supp. of Expedited Discovery motion; cs w/CLS, RMK, rev'd. e-mails & info. from AC, rev'd. & edited e-mails to N.C. Treasurer's office re: above & re: litig. strategy		
Anthony Cichocki	10/23/2008	5.00
research charge in payments of top executives, discuss findings with C. Stine		
Robert M. Kornreich	10/23/2008	2.50
csw CBW and CLS re motion for expedited discovery		
Anthony D. Green	10/24/2008	5.70
Researching Bailout Bill and related provisions of the FDI Act; Reviewing news about the deal and Citigroup's allegations; Conference with CLS.		
Chet B. Waldman	10/24/2008	3.10
Conf. call w/CLS & Charlotte lawyer; rev'd. his firm's website, mtgs., e-mails w/CLS in this regard; rev'd. e-mails b/n CLS & N.C., mtgs. w/CLS re: lit. strategy; rev'd. e-mails re: EESA relevance to case from ADG, CLS; rev'd. relevant case law		
Carl L. Stine	10/24/2008	4.70
Rsch. re Charlotte lawyer; meet w/CBW re same & tel w/CBW re same; meet w/AG re bailout & securities fraud case; rev. sec. fraud complt.; emails re EESA section; rev. Citigroup complt.		
Chet B. Waldman	10/27/2008	0.70
Conf. call w/Charlotte lawyer; sent them relevant case law; mtgs. w/RMK, MB re: calling N.C., p/c w/ADG re: legal rsch., Reply Br. in Further Supp. of Expedited Discovery motion		
Anthony D. Green	10/27/2008	3.70
Research in preparation for opposition to our motion to expedite proceedings; conference with CBW		
Robert M. Kornreich	10/27/2008	0.50
cw CBW re Charlotte lawyer/status		
Christopher Dunleavy	10/27/2008	0.80
Pulled documents.		
Chet B. Waldman	10/28/2008	0.70
Participated in conf. call w/N.C. Treasurer's office w/MB, CLS; subsequent & prior p/cs w/RMK, CLS, MB, e-mails to & from NC office in this connection		
Chet B. Waldman	10/28/2008	2.80
Rev'd. relevant case law on corporate benefit doctrine's applicability in N.C.; e-mails w/ADG, J. Wyatt, p/cs w/CLS in this regard; rev'd. defts' Brief in opp. to Expedited Discovery motion; p/cs w/CLS, RMK, to ADG in this regard		
Anthony D. Green	10/28/2008	10.80
Researching North Carolina appraisal statute; Law in North Carolina on the "Corporate Benefit" doctrine; Reading defendants' opposition to our motion to expedite; Researching requirement of posting a bond before a preliminary injunction may issue; Reviewing cases cited by defendants; Conference with CLS and CBW.		
Robert M. Kornreich	10/28/2008	0.50
cw CBW and CLS		
Robert M. Kornreich	10/28/2008	0.30
cw CBW re: Tell call		

**Matter**

<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Date Worked</b>	<b>Hours</b>
<b>1768 / 3253 Irving Ehrenhaus (40) / Ehrenhaus v. John D. Baker II, et al. (Wachovia)</b>		
Carl L. Stine	10/28/2008	4.40
Read defs' opp. brief; re-read our opening; meets w/CBW, AG & RMK re same; begin blocking out reply		
Anthony Cichocki	10/28/2008	0.50
briefly summarize and distribute news article		
Anthony D. Green	10/29/2008	8.70
Reading through articles, court filings, SEC filings, press releases for evidentiary support for reply brief; Conference with CBW and CLS; Researching requirement of bond for preliminary injunction; Reading through defendants' exhibits; Researching when damages will be assessed on a person who obtains a preliminary injunction.		
Alexander Rand	10/29/2008	3.20
Wachovia research for CBW		
Robert M. Kornreich	10/29/2008	1.00
cw CLS re expedited discovery motion; rev draft		
Chet B. Waldman	10/29/2008	5.60
Began drafting sections of plif's Reply Brief in Further Supp. of Expedited Discovery motion; rev'd. defts' brief, aff'ds. & exhibits thereto, numerous news articles, PRs; mtgs. w/CLS, ADG, AR, MB; p/c w/J. Wyatt in this connection		
Carl L. Stine	10/29/2008	11.00
Draft reply brief; meet w/RMK re same; meets w/CBW & AG		
Christopher Dunleavy	10/29/2008	1.10
Pulled docs..		
Carl L. Stine	10/30/2008	9.00
Draft reply; meets w/CBW about his section & whole brief; meet w/RMK; meets w/AG re rsch. & aff'd.; finalize brief & serve w/aff'd. & sent to Court		
Chet B. Waldman	10/30/2008	4.90
Cont'd. drafting, editing, & finalizing portions of plif's Mem. in Further Supp. of Expedited Discovery motion; rev'd. relevant exhibits, news articles; mtgs. w/CLS, ADG, SJ in this connection		
Shirley Joseph	10/30/2008	2.00
Citecheck, shep, quotecheck, etc brief for CBW, CLS		
Anthony D. Green	10/30/2008	7.60
Drafting affidavit, collecting exhibits and finalizing documents in support of reply brief; Conference with CLS and CBW; Researching requirements of a "fiduciary out" clause; Reading recent SEC filings.		
Christopher Dunleavy	10/30/2008	1.10
Pulled docs.		
Robert M. Kornreich	10/30/2008	1.00
cw CLS re motion papers; rev same		
Anthony D. Green	10/31/2008	0.50
Speaking with shareholders of the company.		
Chet B. Waldman	10/31/2008	0.60
P/cs w/RMK, CLS re: yesterday's brief, upcoming anticipated oral argument on expedited discovery motion; e-mails to & from potential N.C. counsel, rev'd. relevant news articles sent by AC, MB		
Robert M. Kornreich	10/31/2008	0.40
tcw CBW, CLS re oral argument		
Anthony Cichocki	10/31/2008	0.50

**Matter**

<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Date Worked</b>	<b>Hours</b>
<b>1768 / 3253 Irving Ehrenhaus (40) / Ehrenhaus v. John D. Baker II, et al. (Wachovia)</b>		
distribute recent company filings relating to acquisition		
Carl L. Stine	10/31/2008	1.20
Tel w/shareholders re status of suit; tel w/CBW, RMK re arguments		
Carl L. Stine	11/1/2008	1.00
Email w/shareholders; briefly rev. preliminary proxy		
Anthony D. Green	11/3/2008	3.60
Reading court's decision on our motion to expedite; Conference with CLS, CBW, RMK; Drafting timeline of important events; Researching preliminary injunction standards in North Carolina.		
Robert M. Kornreich	11/3/2008	0.40
cw CLS re proxy statement		
Robert M. Kornreich	11/3/2008	0.30
cw CBW and ADG/Treas.		
Robert M. Kornreich	11/3/2008	0.80
R&R court decision; cw CLS re same		
Chet B. Waldman	11/3/2008	1.90
Rev'd. Ct.'s opinion denying expedited discovery motion but granting expedited PI motion, mtgs. w/CLS, ADG, RMK, MB; p/c to NC, rev'd. relevant case law in connection w/above		
Carl L. Stine	11/3/2008	8.20
Meet w/CBW; read preliminary proxy; email to judge's clerk re hearing; read Ct.'s decision; meets w/CBW, RMK, MB; begin blocking out brief		
Anthony Cichocki	11/3/2008	1.50
respond to email regarding R Steel compensation		
Robert M. Kornreich	11/4/2008	2.00
Review proxy statement.		
Robert M. Kornreich	11/4/2008	0.30
tcw CLS re proxy statement		
Anthony D. Green	11/4/2008	8.40
Conference with CLS; Researching various issues in connection with preliminary injunction motion; Reading articles about the deal and the bailout.		
Chet B. Waldman	11/4/2008	1.30
P/cs w/, e-mails from, CLS, rev'd. relevant case law, ADG time-line chart in connection w/prep. pltf's P.I. Motion brief; rev'd. ltrs. angry shareholders filed w/the Ct.; p/cs, e-mails w/MB re: FDIC communication possibility		
Carl L. Stine	11/4/2008	9.00
Rsch. & draft brief; tels w/RMK, CBW; tel w/MB, NC Treas.		
Chet B. Waldman	11/5/2008	1.10
Mtgs. w/CLS, RMK, ADG re: drafting brief in supp. of PI motion, relevant case law, and litig. strategy; e-mails to & from N.C. counsel (JW) in this regard		
Robert M. Kornreich	11/5/2008	0.50
cw CBW re brief on p/i		
Anthony D. Green	11/5/2008	12.30
Researching standards of conduct for directors in the event of an emergency; researching requirements of an effective "fiduciary out" provision; conferences with CLS, CBW; researching directors' ability to delegate duties in a merger context to management and third parties.		

**Matter**

<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Date Worked</b>	<b>Hours</b>
<b>1768 / 3253 Irving Ehrenhaus (40) / Ehrenhaus v. John D. Baker II, et al. (Wachovia)</b>		
Carl L. Stine	11/5/2008	10.20
Rsch. & draft brief; meets w/CBW, AG re same		
Anthony Cichocki	11/5/2008	2.00
research change in control payments made to executives		
Robert M. Kornreich	11/6/2008	0.40
cw CLS re p/i brief		
Chet B. Waldman	11/6/2008	0.30
E-mails to & from CLS, ADG re: sending Op. to pltf.; rev'd. article re: Ct.'s initial decision		
Anthony D. Green	11/6/2008	9.10
Researching whether fiduciary duty standards change during exigent circumstances; Conference with CLS; email from CBW		
Carl L. Stine	11/6/2008	10.00
Rsch. & draft brief; meet w/RMK; emails CBW		
Anthony Cichocki	11/6/2008	1.00
Review & distribute PDF of entire 8-K dated July 10, 2008 (all exhibits)		
Robert M. Kornreich	11/7/2008	1.00
cw CLS re p/i brief; rev same		
Shirley Joseph	11/7/2008	1.50
Research Lexis for various NC statutes, Business Corp Act, Shareholder Protection Act, Control Share Acquisition Act for CBW		
Chet B. Waldman	11/7/2008	4.30
Rev'd. & edited latest draft of Brief in supp. of pltf's P.I. motion; rev'd. relevant N.C. statutes, dep. testimony, Wachovia's by-laws; mtgs. w/CLS, SJ in this connection		
Carl L. Stine	11/7/2008	10.50
Rsch. & draft brief; give draft to CBW & email to RMK; meet w/RMK; revise per CBW		
Carl L. Stine	11/8/2008	6.50
Tel w/RMK re brief; revise brief & re circulate		
Robert M. Kornreich	11/8/2008	2.00
R&R P/I brief; tc CLS re same		
Chet B. Waldman	11/9/2008	3.10
Rev'd. & edited latest draft of pltf's Brief in supp. of P.I. motion; p/cs w/CLS in this regard		
Carl L. Stine	11/9/2008	4.00
Tel w/RMK re brief; revise; tel w/CBW; meet w/CBW & revise brief		
Robert M. Kornreich	11/9/2008	2.50
Revise P/I brief; tc CLS re same		
Shirley Joseph	11/10/2008	4.00
Citecheck, shep, quotecheck, etc brief for CLS; prep TOA to brief		
Anthony D. Green	11/10/2008	8.70
Drafting affidavit and preparing exhibits preliminary injunction brief; Conference with CLS.		



**Matter**

<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Date Worked</b>	<b>Hours</b>
<b>1768 / 3253 Irving Ehrenhaus (40) / Ehrenhaus v. John D. Baker II, et al. (Wachovia)</b>		
Carl L. Stine	11/10/2008	10.00
Meets w/RMK, CBW, AG, & SJ re brief and aff'd.; revise & finalize brief; serve papers on defs. by email; tel w/local counsel re filing; meet w/CBW re draft ltr. for N.C. Treasurer, rev. & edit ltr.; email ltr. & brief to N.C. internal counsel		
Chet B. Waldman	11/10/2008	4.90
Rev'd. & edited latest draft of pltf's Brief in supp. of P.I. motion; mtgs. w/RMK, CLS, MB in this connection & re: ltr. to N.C. which I drafted to be submitted to Ct.		
Alexander Rand	11/10/2008	2.00
Research on Wachovia Deal		
Robert M. Kornreich	11/10/2008	4.00
Revisions to P/I brief; cw/CBW, CLS re same		
Robert M. Kornreich	11/10/2008	0.60
Revise NC Letter draft		
Anthony D. Green	11/11/2008	0.80
Reading prospectus and presentation filed by Wells Fargo discussing the Wachovia deal; conference with CBW		
Chet B. Waldman	11/11/2008	3.40
Mtgs, e-mails among CLS, RMK, ADG & I concerning pltf's PI motion, our reply brief, the oral argument, travel-related thereto, Wells Fargo's SEC filings concerning their recent public offering to raise capital to afford the Wachovia deal (filings I rev'd.), etc.; rev'd. relevant news articles as well		
Christopher Dunleavy	11/11/2008	1.20
Pulled docs..		
Carl L. Stine	11/11/2008	4.20
Meet w/counsel for N.C. treasurer; meets w/RMK, CBW re argument & strategy; read ltr. from shareholder to Ct.; rev. info. re WF stock offering & emails re same		
Robert M. Kornreich	11/11/2008	3.50
R&R final brief; cw counsel for NC Treas w/MB and CLS; csw CLS, CBW and R&R LF		
Anthony D. Green	11/12/2008	3.80
Conference with CLS, CBW & RMK; researching other cases where there were "lock up" provisions; researching SEC filings.		
Chet B. Waldman	11/12/2008	4.20
Mtgs. w/RMK, CLS, ADG; rev'd. N.C. Treasurer corr. to Ct., relevant news article, sections of Wells Fargo public offering supplement to prospectus, in connection w/prep. for oral argument on P.I. motion, potential resolution of the action		
Anthony Cichocki	11/12/2008	0.50
Review & distribute article from local paper on takeover		
Carl L. Stine	11/12/2008	1.80
Emails w/NC Treasurer's office re ltr.; meets w/RMK, CBW, ADG; emails re pro hac motions; emails re tax provisions & rev. articles re same		
Robert M. Kornreich	11/12/2008	1.50
Csw CLS, CBW, ADG re settlement proposal		
Robert M. Kornreich	11/12/2008	0.80
TC PR		
Robert M. Kornreich	11/12/2008	0.10
R&R LF Moore to Ct		
Anthony D. Green	11/13/2008	10.70
Researching cases in which an acquirer was granted shares or options prior to the vote; Conferences with RMK, CLS & CBW; investigating Wells Fargo's total ownership of Wachovia; Email to client.		

**Matter**

<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Date Worked</b>	<b>Hours</b>
<b>1768 / 3253 Irving Ehrenhaus (40) / Ehrenhaus v. John D. Baker II, et al. (Wachovia)</b>		
Chet B. Waldman	11/13/2008	6.10
Began prep. for P.I. motion oral argument by rev'ing. numerous relevant cases, docs.; p/cs w/RMK, ADG, e-mails among RMK, CLS, ADG, p/c w/S. Freiberg, his Chief Admin. Officer, re: P.I. motion related issues; lit. strategy (w/ptrns.)		
Carl L. Stine	11/13/2008	2.20
Emails CBW, AG; meets w/RMK, CBW re possible settlement scenarios; meet w/AG; emails re pro hac motions; tel w/client re case & to set up tomorrow a.m. mtg.; tel w/shareholder; prep. form for pro hac motion		
Robert M. Kornreich	11/13/2008	1.60
csw CBW, CLS re settlement proposal		
Robert M. Kornreich	11/13/2008	0.40
SH communications;		
Robert M. Kornreich	11/13/2008	0.50
cw Pro hac motion		
Robert M. Kornreich	11/13/2008	0.60
tc PR re settlement		
Alberto Rivera	11/14/2008	1.00
Document Review for CLS.		
Anthony D. Green	11/14/2008	7.60
Researching permissible lock-up agreements; Conference with CLS & CBW.		
Chet B. Waldman	11/14/2008	4.90
Rev'd. relevant case law, news articles; conf. call w/RMK, CLS & Citigroup attys.; rev'd. Stip. entered into by Citigroup in other litig. before the Ct., mtgs. w/RMK, CLS re: litig. strategy all in connection w/prep. for MTD oral argument		
Anthony Cichocki	11/14/2008	0.50
Review & distribute news story		
Carl L. Stine	11/14/2008	2.80
Meet w/client re case status & form to file w/Ct.; return to office; tel w/RMK, CBW & Citigrp; meets w/RMK, CBW re status; counsel; send form to local counsel for filing rev. share exchange agmt.; rev. news stories about Citi; email re settlement-related issue		
Robert M. Kornreich	11/14/2008	1.20
Rev defts Answers'		
Robert M. Kornreich	11/14/2008	0.50
cw CBW re same		
Robert M. Kornreich	11/14/2008	0.80
tcw Citigroup counsel w/CBW/CLS and cw CBW and CLS re same		
Chet B. Waldman	11/15/2008	2.80
Prep. for upcoming P.I. motion oral argument and Reply Br. in supp. thereof by rev'ing. numerous relevant cases, articles, SEC filing excerpts		
Chet B. Waldman	11/16/2008	4.20
Prep. for upcoming P.I. motion oral argument and Reply Br. in supp. thereof by rev'ing. numerous relevant cases		
Carl L. Stine	11/16/2008	2.50
Read cases in prep. for drafting reply		
Anthony D. Green	11/17/2008	12.10

**Matter**

<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Date Worked</b>	<b>Hours</b>
<b>1768 / 3253 Irving Ehrenhaus (40) / Ehrenhaus v. John D. Baker II, et al. (Wachovia)</b>		
Researching whether shareholders have appraisal rights here, when new tax law went into effect, the interests of Wachovia's board in the merger, steel's employment agreement, what the proxy says about possible bankruptcy, what amount of ownership counts as "control", whether a board must take a recommendation when presenting a merger from a vote, the terms of the merger agreement with First Union, and when a bond might not be required for preliminary briefs; Conference with CLS and CBW.		
Chet B. Waldman	11/17/2008	8.30
Cont'd. prep. for upcoming oral argument on P.I. motion; rev'd. relevant case law, affidavits & exhibits thereto, including S-4 stmt., as well as defts' briefs filed today in opp. to P.I. motion; p/cs, e-mails w/CLS, ADG, MB, counsel for CII re: above		
Carl L. Stine	11/17/2008	7.60
Tels w/CBW, AG re issues; rev. Merger Agmt.; read Wachovia & WF briefs; meets/tels w/RMK		
Robert M. Kornreich	11/17/2008	2.00
R&R defts brief; cw CLS re same		
Chet B. Waldman	11/18/2008	9.40
Cont'd. prep. for Monday's argument on P.I. motion; mtgs. w/RMK, CLS, ADG; rev'd. relevant case law, statutes, affidavits, SEC filings; began drafting outline in this connection		
Anthony D. Green	11/18/2008	11.30
Researching requirement to post bond for preliminary injunction, shepardizing defendant's cases; researching N.C. laws on share exchange vote requirements; conference with CBW, CLS; drafting insert to brief.		
Anthony Cichocki	11/18/2008	1.00
research news stories for C. Stine		
Carl L. Stine	11/18/2008	11.20
Rsch., draft reply brief; rev. ltrs. filed w/the Ct.; meets w/RMK, CBW, AG; various emails; tel w/Clerk re expanding word limit & emails re same		
Robert M. Kornreich	11/18/2008	4.50
Review defts briefs, read cases and csw CLS, CBW, ADG re reply brief		
Chet B. Waldman	11/19/2008	11.40
Cont'd. prep. for Monday's argument on P.I. motion; p/cs w/CLS, ADG, RMK; rev'd. relevant case law, briefs, SEC filings, articles, statutes, e-mails; cont'd. drafting outline in this connection		
Anthony D. Green	11/19/2008	11.60
Reading amended proxy; Researching applicability of share exchange voting requirements; researching whether EESA is being litigated in Citigroup action; researching usual percentage of voting in shareholder elections; researching requirements and limitations on a reply brief in N.C.; drafting motion and brief to expand word limits of reply brief; drafting brief insert on bond requirement; conference with CLS, CBW, CD; reading recent articles on merger.		
Christopher Dunleavy	11/19/2008	1.20
Conf. w/AG; research at NYSC.		
Carl L. Stine	11/19/2008	10.80
Draft reply brief; emails w/clerk re expanding word limit; tel w/AG re drafting a motion; rev. same; rev. & edit AG; mtgs. & tels w/CBW & RMK		
Robert M. Kornreich	11/19/2008	6.00
work on reply brief; csw CLS, CBW		
Anthony D. Green	11/20/2008	12.30
Researching usual vote turnout in proxy contests and vote turnout in the First Union Wachovia merger; researching in what circumstances a judge may allow raising a new argument on reply; researching proxy statements financial advisor opinions and whether any providing pre-merger financial assistance; researching media's early reports of merger and share exchange; drafting affidavit and collecting exhibits; drafting foot notes to brief on my research; conference with CLS, CBW.		
Chet B. Waldman	11/20/2008	10.10

**Matter**

<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Date Worked</b>	<b>Hours</b>
<b>1768 / 3253 Irving Ehrenhaus (40) / Ehrenhaus v. John D. Baker II, et al. (Wachovia)</b>		
Cont'd. prep. for Monday's P.I. motion oral argument; rev'd. & edited draft pltf's Reply Br.; cont'd. to draft portions of outline; rev'd. relevant case law, articles, e-mails, SEC filings; p/cs w/RMK, CLS, ADG; e-mails w/all of above & AC in connection w/above		
Frank Driscoll	11/20/2008	4.00
Searching for statistics to place in brief-% of shareholders who rooted for merger and % who, voted over all; information given to AG		
Carl L. Stine	11/20/2008	13.00
Revise & finish 1st draft of reply brief; circulate to RMK & CBW; mtgs. re same & revise same		
Robert M. Kornreich	11/20/2008	6.50
work on reply brief in support of p/i; csw CBW, CLS		
Shirley Joseph	11/21/2008	2.50
Citecheck, shep, quotecheck brief for CLS; prep TOA		
Chet B. Waldman	11/21/2008	11.30
Cont'd. prep. for Monday's P.I. motion oral argument; rev'd. & edited latest drafts of pltf's Reply Br., cont'd. to draft & edit outline; rev'd. relevant case law, articles, e-mails, statutes, briefs, affidavits, SEC filings, p/cs w/RMK, CLS, ADG, e-mails w/all of them & AC in connection w/above		
Anthony D. Green	11/21/2008	10.60
Finalizing exhibits and affidavit for filing; Drafting memo on raising arguments in reply brief; Researching ability of judge to take judicial notice of statutes; researching Wachovia's action against Citigroup; editing brief; conference with CLS and CBW; reviewing amended proxy filed today.		
Carl L. Stine	11/21/2008	7.80
Revise reply papers; meets w/AG, SJ, RMK & tel w/CBW re same; finalize same & send to local counsel for filing		
Robert M. Kornreich	11/21/2008	5.00
Work on reply brief; cw CLS and tw CBW re same		
Carl L. Stine	11/22/2008	4.00
Meet w/CBW & conf. call w/RMK re argument; prep. for same		
Chet B. Waldman	11/22/2008	9.10
Cont'd. prep. for Monday's oral argument; rev'd. & edited outline, practiced presentation; rev'd. relevant case law, news articles, SH ltrs.; p/cs w/RMK, ADG, mtgs. w/CLS in this connection		
Carl L. Stine	11/23/2008	8.00
Travel to Charlotte; meets w/RMK & CBW re argument; rev. Definitive Proxy & defs' sur-reply; meets re same		
Chet B. Waldman	11/23/2008	12.30
Cont'd. prep. for tomorrow's PI motion oral argument; rev'd. relevant case law, depts' sur-reply brief, SEC filings, practiced & edited outline, travelled to N.C. w/CLS, RMK; mtgs. w/them in connection w/above		
Robert M. Kornreich	11/23/2008	8.00
Travel to NC for hearing; mtgs CBW, CLS		
Anthony D. Green	11/24/2008	2.30
Conference with CLS: Reading defendants' sur-reply brief and definitive proxy statement.		
Carl L. Stine	11/24/2008	11.00
Meets re argument; attend hearing; return to NYC		
Chet B. Waldman	11/24/2008	12.40
Prep. for & then conducted oral argument on P.I. motion; numerous mtgs. w/CLS, RMK, G. Jones, depts' counsel, news reporters in this regard; travelled from N.C. to N.Y.		
Robert M. Kornreich	11/24/2008	12.00
Attend Ct hearing re p/i motion; confs re same; return NY		

**Matter**

<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Date Worked</b>	<b>Hours</b>
<b>1768 / 3253 Irving Ehrenhaus (40) / Ehrenhaus v. John D. Baker II, et al. (Wachovia)</b>		
Anthony D. Green Conference with CLS and RMK.	11/25/2008	0.70
Robert M. Kornreich csw CBW, AEL re settlement proposal, cw CLS, ADG re same; tc PR re same	11/25/2008	1.50
Chet B. Waldman Mtgs. w/RMK, CLS re: lit. strategy, RMK's p/c w/P. Rowe; mtgs. w/AEL, p/cs w/LLL, PIA, rev'd. news articles, video re: yesterday's PI motion oral arguments	11/25/2008	2.10
Carl L. Stine Meet w/RMK, CBW, ADG re hearing	11/25/2008	0.80
Chet B. Waldman E-mails w/CLS re: fid. out cl.	11/26/2008	0.20
Carl L. Stine Pc w/RMK re PR req for ext.	12/1/2008	0.20
Robert M. Kornreich tc PR re answers -his request for extension	12/1/2008	0.50
Robert M. Kornreich tc CLS re same.	12/1/2008	0.20
Anthony D. Green Drafting amended complaint; Conference with CLS.	12/2/2008	4.30
Carl L. Stine Meets w/RMK & AG re amended complt.; begin rev'ing. Proxy;	12/2/2008	6.70
Robert M. Kornreich R&R email from Clerk.	12/2/2008	0.10
Robert M. Kornreich cw CLS re same	12/2/2008	0.20
Anthony D. Green Researching tax benefits to Wells Fargo from the merger; Conference with EEF & CLS; Drafting amended complaint.	12/3/2008	7.20
Chet B. Waldman P/c w/CLS re: status update	12/3/2008	0.10
Carl L. Stine Rev. proxy; meet w/RMK re ltr. to NC legislator; rsch. & draft same; meet w/RMK re same; revise same; meet w/ADG, EEF re tax issues; pc w/CBW re status	12/3/2008	7.50
E. Elizabeth Robinson research unrealized loss carry forward for tax for acquiring cos; confs w/ADG, CLS	12/3/2008	1.20
Robert M. Kornreich tcs CBW, CLS re amended complaint.	12/3/2008	1.00
Anthony D. Green Drafting amended complaint; Researching tax benefits to Wells Fargo; Researching Wells Fargo's benefits from the bailout and public offering; Conference with EEF and CLS.	12/4/2008	8.30

**Matter**

<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Date Worked</b>	<b>Hours</b>
<b>1768 / 3253 Irving Ehrenhaus (40) / Ehrenhaus v. John D. Baker II, et al. (Wachovia)</b>		
Chet B. Waldman	12/4/2008	0.30
Conf. call w/RMK, CLS re: drafting an amended complt. adding disclosure claims		
Carl L. Stine	12/4/2008	7.00
Meets & emails w/AG re amended complt.; tel w/RMK, CBW re amend complt; revise draft ltr. to representative & send to J. Cohen; meet w/RMK re same; email & meet w/EEF re tax benefit		
E. Elizabeth Robinson	12/4/2008	0.80
review draft of sections in amended complaint relating to taxes; conf w/CLS, ADG re same		
Robert M. Kornreich	12/4/2008	0.50
cw CLS re letter to legislation; tcw CLS, CBW re amend complt		
Robert M. Kornreich	12/4/2008	0.30
revise ltr		
Chet B. Waldman	12/5/2008	0.40
Rev'd. def't's Notice of Supplemental Authority; mtgs., p/cs w/CLS, e-mails w/ADG, LLL, PIA in this regard		
Carl L. Stine	12/5/2008	10.00
Emails & meets w/AG & EEF re amended complt.; read Cahn dismissal order in Bear Stearns; meet w/RMK re same; tel w/clerk re procedure for responding to Notice of New Authority; begin blocking out motion; read Court's p.i. decision & meets re same; rev. D. Fuller doc. re disclosures; tels & emails w/AG re same		
Anthony D. Green	12/5/2008	6.70
Drafting amended complaint; reviewing decision filed by defendants as supplemental authority; research; conference with CLS.		
Robert M. Kornreich	12/5/2008	1.50
cw CLS re extension and BS case; tcw MPR re status		
Marian P. Rosner	12/5/2008	1.00
T/c RMK re: decision in Wachovia and fee application.		
Chet B. Waldman	12/6/2008	1.20
Rev'd. Ct.'s PI motion opinion, CLS e-mails in this regard		
Carl L. Stine	12/7/2008	0.80
Rev. Ct.'s decision & email re same		
Chet B. Waldman	12/8/2008	2.40
Rev'd. & edited draft Amended Complt.; rev'd. portions of Ct's PI motion decision, my oral argument outline; mtgs. w/RMK, CLS in this regard & re: lit. strategy, CLS's p/c w/P. Rowe		
Carl L. Stine	12/8/2008	7.60
Rsch. re derivative cases in N.C.; meets w/RMK & CBW re options; rev. & edit amended complt.; tel & email w/P. Rowe		
Robert M. Kornreich	12/8/2008	1.00
R&R p/i order; csw CBW, CLS re same and call w/P. Rowe		
Chet B. Waldman	12/9/2008	1.60
Rev'd. & edited latest draft of Amended Complt.; numerous mtgs, e-mails w/RMK, CLS in this connection		
Carl L. Stine	12/9/2008	6.20
Revise amended complt.; meets w/RMK, CBW re same		
Robert M. Kornreich	12/9/2008	3.00
Revise am and supp complt draft; csw CBW, CLS re same		

**Matter**

<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Date Worked</b>	<b>Hours</b>
<b>1768 / 3253 Irving Ehrenhaus (40) / Ehrenhaus v. John D. Baker II, et al. (Wachovia)</b>		
Chet B. Waldman	12/10/2008	1.60
Rev'd. & edited latest draft of Amended Supp. Complt.; mtgs. w/CLS, rev'd. N.C. statutes in this connection		
Carl L. Stine	12/10/2008	9.00
Revise amended complt. & draft & revise brief & motion; meets w/RMK, CBW re same		
E. Elizabeth Robinson	12/10/2008	1.10
review draft of Amended Complaint		
Robert M. Kornreich	12/10/2008	4.50
revise draft of supp complt; cw CLS re same.		
Chet B. Waldman	12/11/2008	0.40
Conf. calls w/RMK, CLS to discuss topic of settlement & strategy relating thereto		
Robert M. Kornreich	12/11/2008	3.50
Final edits re amended and supp complt. ; csw CLS; tcw/CBW, CLS; tcw/PR		
Carl L. Stine	12/11/2008	10.60
Revise & finalize amended complt., motion, brief; draft prop. order & notice of dismissal; meets w/RMK re same & possibility of filing a federal action; tel & emails w/local counsel re filing; meets & tels w/RMK & CBW re settlement & rsch. re same		
Chet B. Waldman	12/12/2008	0.90
P/cs w/RMK, CLS; rev'd. relevant briefs, WF presentation, news articles in connection w/settlement negotiations		
E. Elizabeth Robinson	12/12/2008	1.40
provide information to CLS & RMK re: taxes for settlement and discussions		
Carl L. Stine	12/12/2008	10.50
Settlement discussions; meets w/RMK; tels w/CBW; rsch. re tax issue; begin drafting MOU; listen to taped presentations by WF executives		
Robert M. Kornreich	12/12/2008	1.50
Conf. with CLS; tcw CBW; rev tax issue materials from EEF		
Robert M. Kornreich	12/13/2008	6.00
work on MOU, drafts; cw CLS re same		
Carl L. Stine	12/13/2008	6.00
Tels w/RMK & oppos counsel re settlement; draft & revise MOU & send to opposing counsel		
Robert M. Kornreich	12/14/2008	1.50
tcw CLS re MOU and emails; revise MOU		
Carl L. Stine	12/14/2008	0.80
Tel w/RMK re MOU		
Chet B. Waldman	12/15/2008	0.80
Mtg. w/CLS, RMK; p/cs, e-mails w/ADG re: lit. strategy, settlement negotiations		
Anthony D. Green	12/15/2008	0.60
Emails with CBW re strategy and settlement issues		
Robert M. Kornreich	12/15/2008	3.50
Emails w/PR, CLS; csw CBW, CLS re disclosures, settlement		
Carl L. Stine	12/15/2008	7.20

**Matter**

<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Date Worked</b>	<b>Hours</b>
<b>1768 / 3253 Irving Ehrenhaus (40) / Ehrenhaus v. John D. Baker II, et al. (Wachovia)</b>		
Emails re case management conf. & time to respond to doc. req.; emails & meets w/RMK, CBW re settlement		
Robert M. Kornreich	12/16/2008	7.50
Revision/review of MOU and exhibit 1; tcw PR re settlement negotiations; csw CLS, CBW re same		
Carl L. Stine	12/16/2008	12.00
Revisions to MOU & disclosures; many meets & tels w/RMK re same & fee negotiations		
Chet B. Waldman	12/16/2008	0.80
Mtg. w/RMK, CLS, pulled & rev'd. Aramark MOU in connection w/settlement negotiations		
Robert M. Kornreich	12/17/2008	3.50
Emails, cw CLS; revision of MOU and exhibit		
Robert M. Kornreich	12/17/2008	0.50
tcw/def. counsel		
Robert M. Kornreich	12/17/2008	0.50
cw CLS re related case		
Anthony D. Green	12/17/2008	0.40
Conference with CLS; researching security case against Wachovia.		
Carl L. Stine	12/17/2008	7.20
Final revisions to MOU & disclosures; tels & meets w/RMK re same; rsch re fees; tel w/opp counsel re ltr. to court re process; send p.i. decision to client		
Shirley Joseph	12/18/2008	0.50
Prep rpt for CLS		
Chet B. Waldman	12/18/2008	0.50
Mtg. w/CLS, RMK re: settlement & upcoming confirmatory discovery; rev'd. articles re: settlement		
Robert M. Kornreich	12/18/2008	1.00
review, revise LT, and csw CLS, CBW re same.		
Robert M. Kornreich	12/18/2008	0.50
cw CLS re omission of press release in letter		
Carl L. Stine	12/18/2008	7.00
Rsch re fees; begin prep. pared-down doc list; rev. drafts of ltr. to Ct.; meets w/RMK re same		
Robert M. Kornreich	12/19/2008	1.00
csw CLS, CBW re press release and R&R draft letter to Ct and authorized signature		
Chet B. Waldman	12/19/2008	0.50
Mtg. w/CLS, RMK re: settlement & upcoming confirmatory discovery; rev'd. articles re: settlement		
Carl L. Stine	12/19/2008	0.50
Rev. draft & final ltr. to the Ct. & emails re same; meets w/RMK, CBW		
Chet B. Waldman	12/22/2008	0.20
Mtg. w/CLS re: confirmatory discovery		
Robert M. Kornreich	12/22/2008	0.50
R&R draft stay order/edit same, CW CLS re same		



**Matter**

<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Date Worked</b>	<b>Hours</b>
<b>1768 / 3253 Irving Ehrenhaus (40) / Ehrenhaus v. John D. Baker II, et al. (Wachovia)</b>		
Robert M. Kornreich R&R email from clerk, sent 12/19	12/22/2008	0.10
Carl L. Stine Meets w/RMK re Ct.'s response to our ltr., stay order & scheduling order; draft same & circulate; tel w/M. Rifkin re their action in Queens; & email to RMK re same & tel; revise doc list; meet w/CBW re same	12/22/2008	7.50
Chet B. Waldman Rev'd. news of SH vote approving merger; p/cs, e-mails w/CLS in this connection & re: conversation w/pltf's counsel in copycat case; rev'd. & edited draft list of docs. for confirmatory discovery; p/c, e-mails w/CLS in this regard	12/23/2008	0.60
Carl L. Stine Revise pared-down doc request; tel w/CBW re same; revise & send to depts; tels & emails re vote; tel w/M. Rifkin re NY case; tel w/RMK re same; emails re sched. order & confid. agmt.; rev. press release re vote; emails & tels re same	12/23/2008	6.00
Robert M. Kornreich tcw/CLS re Rifkin call re Bklyn case	12/23/2008	0.50
Chet B. Waldman Mtgs. w/RMK, CLS, PE re: announcement of merger approval by SHs, strategy to negotiate w/Wolf Haldenstein case pltf. in connection w/wrapping case up, & arguments to make in support of fee award	12/24/2008	0.60
Carl L. Stine Meet w/RMK & CBW re NY action & legal arguments re fees; rsch re same; tels w/Wachtell re NY action; rev. filings	12/24/2008	3.50
Robert M. Kornreich R&R Brooklyn case complt. and MTD; to PR w/CLS re Brooklyn case; cw CBW, CLS re same	12/24/2008	2.00
Pamela Eriikh-Kaufman Conf w/CBW re upcoming news of merger approval	12/24/2008	0.20
Carl L. Stine Rev. defs' revisions to scheduling order; tel w/RMK re same; revise & re-circulate	12/29/2008	1.20
Robert M. Kornreich R&R proposed scheduling order	12/29/2008	0.50
Robert M. Kornreich tcw CLS re proposed distribution, order	12/29/2008	0.50
Carl L. Stine Emails re scheduling order; tel w/opp counsel re same & tel w/RMK re same	12/30/2008	1.00
Robert M. Kornreich tcw CLS re sched order	12/30/2008	0.50
Robert M. Kornreich tcw MR (LM)	12/30/2008	0.10
Carl L. Stine Tels & emails re Court's request for signatures & NY case; tel w/RMK re same	12/31/2008	0.50
Chet B. Waldman P/c w/RMK, e-mail from ADG re: signing consent order	12/31/2008	0.20

**Matter**

<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Date Worked</b>	<b>Hours</b>
<b>1768 / 3253 Irving Ehrenhaus (40) / Ehrenhaus v. John D. Baker II, et al. (Wachovia)</b>		
Robert M. Kornreich tcw CLS re Scheduling order, tc MR re Brooklyn case email; tcw CBW re con. order	12/31/2008	2.00
Chet B. Waldman Rev'd. PR re: deal closing; mtgs. w/CLS re: confirmatory discovery	1/5/2009	0.40
Carl L. Stine Send consent order to Greg Jones or signature; tel w/RMK re same; emails re same; meet w/CBW re discovery; rev. press release re closing	1/5/2009	2.40
Pamela Erlikh-Kaufman monitor news re merger for CBW	1/5/2009	0.80
Robert M. Kornreich tcw CLS re con. order	1/5/2009	0.30
Chet B. Waldman Rev'd. e-mails from CLS & defts' counsel re: timetable for confirmatory discovery & issues relating thereto; p/cs w/RMK, CLS re: resolution of Wolf Haldenstein's case (agreed to today)	1/6/2009	0.30
Carl L. Stine Emails re confid. agree., docs., depos., and 3rd pty discovery; tels w/RMK, CBW re NY case; emails re same; begin blocking out settlement agmt.	1/6/2009	4.20
Robert M. Kornreich tcw MR and emails re fee and tcw CLS re same; tcs w CLS, CBW re Brooklyn case	1/6/2009	1.10
Chet B. Waldman Rev'd. info. re: relevant fee application (in Anheuser-Busch case); e-mail from ADG, p/c w/CLS, RMK in this connection	1/7/2009	0.30
Carl L. Stine tel w/CBW, RMK re fee app	1/7/2009	0.10
Robert M. Kornreich tcw CBW, CLS	1/7/2009	0.10
Chet B. Waldman Rev'd. e-mail from CLS re: status update on confirmatory discovery	1/13/2009	0.20
Chet B. Waldman Rev'd. news of Wells Fargo lay-offs of ex-employees who now work at Wachovia	1/14/2009	0.10
Carl L. Stine Rev. draft confid. agmt.; tels re same	1/14/2009	1.20
Carl L. Stine Rev. final confid. order & email signed sig. page	1/15/2009	0.80
Carl L. Stine Emails re confid. agmt.	1/16/2009	0.50
Chet B. Waldman Mtg. w/CLS re: status of discovery & his p/c today w/P. Rowe in this regard	1/20/2009	0.20
Carl L. Stine Draft cast of characters; draft settlement stip.; draft scheduling order; tel w/P. Rowe & George Conway re docs. & schedule; meet w/CBW re same	1/20/2009	6.40
Carl L. Stine	1/21/2009	2.70

**Matter**

<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Date Worked</b>	<b>Hours</b>
<b>1768 / 3253 Irving Ehrenhaus (40) / Ehrenhaus v. John D. Baker II, et al. (Wachovia)</b>		
Drafting & revising settlement docs.		
Carl L. Stine	1/22/2009	1.30
Tel w/opposing counsel re doc. issues; emails re consent order and then Motion		
Carl L. Stine	1/23/2009	2.80
Draft & revise settlement papers; read Merrill Lynch Del. decision		
Carl L. Stine	1/26/2009	4.80
Tel w/opp. counsel re doc. discovery; rev. & revise settlement stip.; begin blocking out prelim. approval brief; rsch. re law on settlement		
Chet B. Waldman	1/27/2009	0.20
Rev'd. news of SEC investigation of Co.; mtg. w/CLS in this regard		
Carl L. Stine	1/27/2009	4.00
Rsch. re fees & cases for our prelim. approval brief; tel w/opp. counsel re timing of doc. production; draft revise prelim. approval brief; meet w/CBW re SEC investig.		
Carl L. Stine	1/28/2009	1.30
fee research		
Chet B. Waldman	1/29/2009	0.10
Rev'd. e-mail from CLS re: timing of defts' doc. production		
Carl L. Stine	1/29/2009	3.60
Fee research; email CBW re doc production		
Chet B. Waldman	1/30/2009	0.30
Mtg., e-mails w/CLS re: defts' production of docs. today & plan to commence review		
Carl L. Stine	1/30/2009	1.50
Tels w/opp counsel re doc. discovery; rev. disk & meet w/l.P. person re same; emails w/CBW & AG re same & meet w/CBW re same		
Chet B. Waldman	2/2/2009	0.10
P/c w/ADG re: rev'ing. docs. produced by defts.		
Anthony D. Green	2/2/2009	10.30
Document review; conference with CBW.		
Anthony D. Green	2/3/2009	10.20
Document review.		
Chet B. Waldman	2/4/2009	0.20
E-mail, p/c w/ADG re: timing of defts' further production of docs & his review thereof		
Anthony D. Green	2/4/2009	4.90
Document review; email to defense counsel; conference with CBW.		
Anthony D. Green	2/6/2009	0.20
Email with defense counsel.		
Chet B. Waldman	2/7/2009	0.20
E-mails to & from defts' counsel re: delivering add'l. docs. for review		
Anthony D. Green	2/9/2009	10.30
Conference with CLS; document review and indexing documents.		

**Matter**

<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Date Worked</b>	<b>Hours</b>
<b>1768 / 3253 Irving Ehrenhaus (40) / Ehrenhaus v. John D. Baker II, et al. (Wachovia)</b>		
Chet B. Waldman	2/9/2009	0.20
Mtgs. w/RMK, CLS re: confirmatory discovery & depositions in connection therewith		
Carl L. Stine	2/9/2009	4.60
Meets & tels w/AG re doc. rev. & depos; begin rev'ing Wachovia docs; meet w/RMK, CBW re same		
Robert M. Kornreich	2/9/2009	1.00
cw CBW, CLS re discovery		
Robert M. Kornreich	2/9/2009	2.00
R&R draft stip of stip, prep by CLS		
Anthony D. Green	2/10/2009	10.10
Document review; conference with CLS.		
Carl L. Stine	2/10/2009	7.00
Meet w/AG re docs.; tel w/Juan re same; rev. AG's list of Wachovia docs; email to opp. counsel re depos; rev. docs.		
Anthony D. Green	2/11/2009	8.90
Document review.		
Carl L. Stine	2/11/2009	8.20
Rev. docs.		
Anthony D. Green	2/12/2009	5.10
Document review; conference with CLS		
Carl L. Stine	2/12/2009	6.30
Rev. docs.; meet w/AG re same		
Anthony D. Green	2/13/2009	3.80
Document review.		
Carl L. Stine	2/13/2009	6.70
Rev. docs.; tel w/RMK re same		
Robert M. Kornreich	2/13/2009	1.00
tcw CLS re: discovery		
Carl L. Stine	2/17/2009	4.90
Rev. docs.; email to WF counsel re missing docs; meet w/AG, tel w/RMK re same		
Anthony D. Green	2/17/2009	0.20
Conference with CLS.		
Robert M. Kornreich	2/17/2009	1.00
tcw CLS re: docs discovery		
Carl L. Stine	2/18/2009	8.20
Rev. docs; tel w/RMK, PR, meet w/RMK re same		
Robert M. Kornreich	2/18/2009	0.50
tcw Paul R and CLS re: doc discovery		

**Matter**

<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Date Worked</b>	<b>Hours</b>
<b>1768 / 3253 Irving Ehrenhaus (40) / Ehrenhaus v. John D. Baker II, et al. (Wachovia)</b>		
Robert M. Kornreich cw CLS re same	2/18/2009	0.50
Carl L. Stine Rev. docs.; meet w/RMK re stip; revise same	2/19/2009	8.40
Robert M. Kornreich Edit draft stip of settlement	2/19/2009	1.50
Robert M. Kornreich cw CLS re same	2/19/2009	0.50
Carl L. Stine Revise final judgment & prelim. approval order; email & tel w/RMK; revise stip; rev. docs.	2/20/2009	6.80
Robert M. Kornreich tcw CLS re revision to Stip of Settlement	2/20/2009	0.50
Robert M. Kornreich Review same	2/20/2009	2.50
Chet B. Waldman Mtg. w/CLS re: status & confirmatory discovery update	2/23/2009	0.30
Carl L. Stine Meet w/CBW re case status; meet w/RMK re stip & exhibits; revise same & send to opp. counsel; rev. docs.	2/23/2009	8.00
Robert M. Kornreich Rev. and edit revised stip of settlement prep by CLS and draft order and FJ, and prelim approval order; cw CLS re: same	2/23/2009	4.00
Carl L. Stine Rev. docs; draft & rsch. preliminary approval brief	2/24/2009	8.60
Chet B. Waldman P/cs, e-mails w/CLS re: reported P.I. motion opinion, discovery status	2/25/2009	0.30
Carl L. Stine Rev. docs; draft & rsch. prelim. approval brief; emails, tels w/CBW re same	2/25/2009	8.00
Anthony D. Green Conference with CBW and CLS.	2/26/2009	0.60
Carl L. Stine Rsch. & draft prelim. approval brief; emails w/opp. counsel re status of discovery; meet w/RMK re same; meets w/CBW & AG re case	2/26/2009	6.20
Chet B. Waldman mtgs w/CLS, ADG re: upcoming depositions, stip of settlement timing, CLS's plead w/P. Rowe, began gathering materials to prepare for dep of R. Steele	2/26/2009	1.30
Robert M. Kornreich cw CLS re: discovery schedule	2/26/2009	0.50
Chet B. Waldman prepared to take dep of R.Steel, began drafting outline, reviewing relevant documents prepared in this connection	2/27/2009	3.80
Robert M. Kornreich	2/27/2009	0.50

**Matter**

<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Date Worked</b>	<b>Hours</b>
<b>1768 / 3253 Irving Ehrenhaus (40) / Ehrenhaus v. John D. Baker II, et al. (Wachovia)</b>		
tsw CLS re: discovery		
Carl L. Stine	2/27/2009	5.40
review docs & prep for bankers depositions, email w/counsel for bankers re: docs and depositions; tels w/RMK re same		
Chet B. Waldman	2/28/2009	0.80
continued preparing for Steel deposition, reviewed and edited latest draft of Dep outline, reviewed relevant case law		
Chet B. Waldman	3/2/2009	2.30
Continued preparing to take deposition of R. Steel. Received hsi affidavit & exhibits thereto, edited and drafted outline in this connection		
Anthony D. Green	3/2/2009	6.20
Document review; conference with CLS.		
Carl L. Stine	3/2/2009	5.50
review docs, prepare for bankers depositions, emails w/counsel for bankers & WF counsel re: discovery; meets w/RMK, AG re same		
Robert M. Kornreich	3/2/2009	1.00
csw CLS re discovery		
Anthony D. Green	3/3/2009	5.00
Document review; preparing set of documents for use in Steel deposition; conference with CBW, CLS		
Carl L. Stine	3/3/2009	6.50
review Goldman Sachs docs, emails re same; meets w/CBW, AG re same		
Chet B. Waldman	3/3/2009	4.40
Continued preparing to take deposition of R. Steel; continued drafting and editing deposition outline, reviewed relevant docs and affidavits; mtgs w/CLS and ADG in this regard.		
Carl L. Stine	3/4/2009	4.50
review GS docs, emails re: delays, review WF's draft motion, meet with RMK re: same, send edits to CBW		
Chet B. Waldman	3/4/2009	2.20
Reviewed drafts of request for extension of time on Order setting schedule w/CLS edits; emails to CLS, in this regard; continued preparing for deposition of R. Steel; reviewed publicly filed docs by Ds in this regard		
Robert M. Kornreich	3/4/2009	0.50
R&R emails re discovery		
Robert M. Kornreich	3/4/2009	0.50
R&R draft m/extension of time		
Robert M. Kornreich	3/4/2009	0.50
cw CLS re edits to draft motion for extension		
Chet B. Waldman	3/5/2009	2.40
Continued preparing for deposition of R. Steel. Edited deposition outline, reviewed S-4, reviewed relevant case law in this connection. Reviewed latest draft of order seeking extension of time to complete confirmatory discovery; p/c emails w/CLS, Ds counsel in this regard		
Robert M. Kornreich	3/5/2009	0.50
R&R revised m/extension		
Robert M. Kornreich	3/5/2009	0.50
cw CLS re same (m/extension)		
Robert M. Kornreich	3/5/2009	0.50

**Matter**

<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Date Worked</b>	<b>Hours</b>
<b>1768 / 3253 Irving Ehrenhaus (40) / Ehrenhaus v. John D. Baker II, et al. (Wachovia)</b>		
cw CBW re same		
Carl L. Stine	3/5/2009	4.20
Rev. docs.; prep. for banker depositions; emails, calls w/CBW re extension motion; meet w.RMK re same		
Chet B. Waldman	3/6/2009	0.10
Mtg w/RMK re order seeking extension of time to complete confirmatory discovery		
Robert M. Kornreich	3/6/2009	0.50
cw CLS re M/Extension		
Robert M. Kornreich	3/6/2009	0.10
cw CBW re same		
Carl L. Stine	3/6/2009	8.00
Prep. for banker's depositions; meet w/RMK re ext.		
Chet B. Waldman	3/9/2009	0.30
Mtg. w/CLS re: asking depositions for status of discovery now that defense counsel's trial has been resolved; rev'd. latest draft of dep. outline for Steel dep.		
Carl L. Stine	3/9/2009	7.80
Prep. for banker's depositions meet w/CBW re discovery issues		
Chet B. Waldman	3/10/2009	0.20
Mtg., e-mail from CLS re: depositions scheduling Wells Fargo dep.		
Anthony D. Green	3/10/2009	0.20
Emails with CLS re: depositions.		
Carl L. Stine	3/10/2009	4.70
Emails w/CBW, AG re status of docs. & depositions & scheduling; rev. docs. for banker's depositions; meet w/CBW re same		
Shirley Joseph	3/11/2009	0.50
Prep rpt for CLS		
Anthony D. Green	3/11/2009	1.60
Conference with CLS; preparation for deposition.		
Chet B. Waldman	3/11/2009	0.40
P/c w/depositions' counsel (P. Rowe), CLS re: scheduling R. Steel dep. & related issues; mtgs. w/CLS in this regard		
Robert M. Kornreich	3/11/2009	0.50
cw CLS re: WF dep		
Robert M. Kornreich	3/11/2009	0.50
cw CLS re fee decision		
Carl L. Stine	3/11/2009	5.00
Begin prepping for WF depositions; tel w/P. Rowe, CBW re depositions; meets w/RMK, AG, CBW re same; emails re same; make travel arrangements		
Anthony D. Green	3/12/2009	1.60
Preparing for deposition.		
Robert M. Kornreich	3/12/2009	1.00
cw CLS re depositions		

**Matter**

<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Date Worked</b>	<b>Hours</b>
<b>1768 / 3253 Irving Ehrenhaus (40) / Ehrenhaus v. John D. Baker II, et al. (Wachovia)</b>		
Carl L. Stine	3/12/2009	8.20
Prep. for WF depo; meet w/RMK re same		
Anthony D. Green	3/13/2009	2.60
Preparing for deposition; document review; conference with CLS.		
Chet B. Waldman	3/13/2009	0.30
P/c, e-mails w/CLS re: scheduling depos., including R. Steel's (date agreed to today)		
Carl L. Stine	3/13/2009	5.40
emails re: dates for depositions and GS docs, prep for WF depo; meet w/AG re same; emails, tels w/CBW re sched.		
Chet B. Waldman	3/16/2009	0.10
E-mails to & from depts' counsel (P. Rowe) re: upcoming Wells Fargo dep. in S.F.		
Anthony D. Green	3/16/2009	4.90
Preparation for deposition; drafting outline of questions; document review; conference with CLS.		
Carl L. Stine	3/16/2009	7.00
emails re: dep details, prep for WF depo; meet AG re same		
Anthony D. Green	3/17/2009	6.90
Drafting outline; document review.		
Carl L. Stine	3/17/2009	7.80
prep for WF depo, email re: investment bankers' depos; meet RMK re same		
Robert M. Kornreich	3/17/2009	0.50
tc Paul Rowe		
Robert M. Kornreich	3/17/2009	0.50
cw CLS re: same.		
Anthony D. Green	3/18/2009	10.40
Preparing for deposition; document review; drafting outline of questions and topics.		
Carl L. Stine	3/18/2009	6.40
prep for WF depo		
Anthony D. Green	3/19/2009	8.30
Document review; preparing for deposition; conference with CLS; email to CBW; preparing outline; reviewing latest proxy and other news.		
Carl L. Stine	3/19/2009	6.50
prep for WF depo; meet w/AG, tel w.CBW re same		
Chet B. Waldman	3/19/2009	0.20
P/c w/CLS, rev'd, e-mail from ADG re: Monday's dep. of Wells		
Anthony D. Green	3/20/2009	6.70
Document review; drafting outline; preparation for deposition; conference with CLS; reading about IRS Notice 2008-83.		
Carl L. Stine	3/20/2009	7.00
meet w/AG re: WF depo, review his outline & additional docs, emails and calls w/opp counsel re: tax docs, review same, prep for depo, meet w/RMK re same		



**Matter**

<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Date Worked</b>	<b>Hours</b>
<b>1768 / 3253 Irving Ehrenhaus (40) / Ehrenhaus v. John D. Baker II, et al. (Wachovia)</b>		
Robert M. Kornreich cw CLS re depo	3/20/2009	0.30
Chet B. Waldman Mtg. w/CLS re: tomorrow's dep. of WF & next week's dep. of R. Steel	3/23/2009	0.20
Anthony D. Green Conference with CLS; reviewing documents concerning tax issues; traveling to San Francisco for deposition of Bruce Hesel of Wells Fargo.	3/23/2009	9.10
Carl L. Stine Prep. for WF depo.; meet w/CBW; meet w/AG; travel to S.F. for Hesel depo.	3/23/2009	9.00
Chet B. Waldman Cont'd. prep. for dep. of R. Steel; rev'd. & edited outline; rev'd. docs. produced by defts. in this connection	3/24/2009	2.60
Anthony D. Green Deposition of Bruce Kessel; traveling from San Francisco to NY.	3/24/2009	12.30
Carl L. Stine Take depo. of Hesel	3/24/2009	4.00
Chet B. Waldman Cont'd. prep. to take dep. of R. Steel next week; rev'd. docs. produced by defts, p/cs w/RMK, ADG in this regard	3/25/2009	2.60
Anthony D. Green Conference with CBW; reviewing draft merger agreements.	3/25/2009	0.90
Carl L. Stine Return to NYC	3/25/2009	9.00
Robert M. Kornreich cw CBW re discovery	3/25/2009	0.30
Anthony D. Green Conference with CBW re deposition of R. Steel	3/26/2009	0.20
Carl L. Stine Meet w/RMK re: Hesel depo. & status of stip. & prelim. approval Motion; meet w/CBW re Hesel depo., upcoming Steel depo. & status of stip.; prep. for Investment Bankers' depo.	3/26/2009	5.40
Chet B. Waldman Mtg. w/RMK, CLS, ADG re: upcoming dep. of R. Steel & re: dep. of WF earlier this week	3/26/2009	0.40
Robert M. Kornreich cw CLS re: Dep of WF, status of settlement papers	3/26/2009	0.40
Robert M. Kornreich cw CBW re: Steele Dep	3/26/2009	0.50
Anthony D. Green Conference with CBW re exhibits for R Steel deposition	3/27/2009	0.20
Chet B. Waldman Cont'd. prep. for next week's dep. of R. Steel; rev'd. relevant docs., edited outline, p/cs w/ADG in this connection	3/27/2009	2.30
Carl L. Stine	3/27/2009	5.20

**Matter**

<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Date Worked</b>	<b>Hours</b>
<b>1768 / 3253 Irving Ehrenhaus (40) / Ehrenhaus v. John D. Baker II, et al. (Wachovia)</b>		
Emails w/opp. counsel re status of stip & details re Steel depo; email to bankers' counsel re docs. & depositions; revise prelim. approval motion		
Chet B. Waldman	3/28/2009	1.60
Cont'd. prep. for Steel Dep.; rev'd. docs. relevant thereto		
Chet B. Waldman	3/30/2009	2.90
Cont'd. prep. for Wed. dep. of R. Steel; rev'd. relevant docs., SEC filings, aff'ds.; mtgs. w/CLS, ADG, edited outline in this regard		
Anthony D. Green	3/30/2009	0.50
Collecting exhibits for deposition; conference with CBW.		
Robert M. Kornreich	3/30/2009	1.00
csw CLS re: depositions		
Robert M. Kornreich	3/30/2009	0.50
csw CLS re: settlement ntc		
Carl L. Stine	3/30/2009	8.40
Drafting prelim. approval brief; prep. for bankers' depositions; meet w/CBW re same; meet w/RMK re dep and notice of settle.		
Chet B. Waldman	3/31/2009	5.30
Cont'd. prep. for tomorrow's dep. of R. Steel; rev'd. relevant SEC filings, agmts. & other docs.; mtgs. w/CLS, ADG; edited outline in this connection		
Anthony D. Green	3/31/2009	4.20
Document review; conference with CLS, CBW; compiling exhibits for Steel deposition.		
Carl L. Stine	3/31/2009	7.80
Draft prelim. approval brief; meets w/CBW, AG re depo		
Chet B. Waldman	4/1/2009	7.10
Prep. for, & then traveled to & from Wachtell Lipton to take, dep. of R. Steel today; mtgs. w/CLS (who 2d chaired), depts' counsel in this regard		
Robert M. Kornreich	4/1/2009	0.50
cw CLS re: stip provision on dismissal of other actions		
Carl L. Stine	4/1/2009	7.40
Prep. for bankers' depositions; attend Steel depo; meet w/CBW re same; meet RMK re stip		
Chet B. Waldman	4/2/2009	0.20
P/cs w/CLS re: tomorrow's depositions.		
Anthony D. Green	4/2/2009	1.60
Conference with CLS; preparation for depositions.		
Carl L. Stine	4/2/2009	8.00
Prep. for bankers' depositions; meet w/AG, tals w/CBW re same		
Anthony D. Green	4/3/2009	8.50
Depositions of financial advisors; preparation for depositions; conference with CLS.		
Carl L. Stine	4/3/2009	7.50
Depos. of Perella Weinberg & Goldman Sachs bankers; meet w/AG re same		
Chet B. Waldman	4/6/2009	0.50
Mtgs., e-mails w/CLS re: Friday's dep. of investment bankers, finalizing stip. of settlement & papers relating to Prelim. Approval		

**Matter**

<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Date Worked</b>	<b>Hours</b>
<b>1768 / 3253 Irving Ehrenhaus (40) / Ehrenhaus v. John D. Baker II, et al. (Wachovia)</b>		
Carl L. Stine	4/6/2009	6.50
Draft Notice; emails, tels w/CBW re bankers' depts.		
Carl L. Stine	4/7/2009	7.50
Draft Notice & give draft to RMK		
Carl L. Stine	4/8/2009	7.30
Meet w/RMK re notice; revise; tel w/CBW and send same to CBW & revise per his edits; send revised notice, along w/stip. & other exhibits to depts.		
Carl L. Stine	4/8/2009	0.20
Email to CBW & AG re status of stip. & motion		
Chet B. Waldman	4/8/2009	1.40
Rev'd. & edited latest drafts of Class Notice; p/cs w/RMK, CLS, rev'd. e-mails to depts' counsel & to me from CLS in this regard		
Robert M. Kornreich	4/8/2009	0.30
cw CLS re discovery; tow CBW re same		
Chet B. Waldman	4/9/2009	0.40
P/cs w/RMK re: finalizing stip. of settlement & exhibits thereto; rev'd. news of good earnings for 1st Q by WF		
Robert M. Kornreich	4/9/2009	0.50
R&R 8k (4/9/09) of Wells Fargo prelim results Q1; tcs w CBW re stip of settle & exhs.		
Anthony D. Green	4/13/2009	4.20
Revising settlement papers with defendant's edits; email to defense and co-counsel; conference with CBW; letter to local counsel.		
Chet B. Waldman	4/13/2009	1.80
Rev'd. & edited latest drafts of Stip. of Settlement & exhibits thereto, e-mails to G. Jones, depts' counsel; mtgs. w/RMK, ADG, e-mails to & from depts' counsel in this regard		
Robert M. Kornreich	4/13/2009	1.20
cw CBW re: depts changes to papers		
Chet B. Waldman	4/14/2009	4.90
Finalized papers in supp. of prelim. approval motion; drafted ltr. to Ct., numerous p/cs w/RMK, ADG, P. Rowe, T. Cottingham; e-mails w/other counsel in this regard		
Anthony D. Green	4/14/2009	7.70
Finalizing and editing all documents to be filed in support of settlement; conference with CBW; emails with defense counsel and local counsel; telephone call to client.		
Robert M. Kornreich	4/14/2009	0.50
tc TC, PR and CBW re: Settlement papers and LT CT		
Robert M. Kornreich	4/14/2009	1.00
cw CBW re: LT to court and review same.		
Chet B. Waldman	4/15/2009	0.60
Rev'd. less redacted Bd minutes sent over yesterday by depts' counsel; mtgs. w/RMK, ADG in this connection		
Chet B. Waldman	4/15/2009	0.50
P/cs w/RMK, ADG, rev'd. numerous e-mails among counsel, p/cs w/Hunton & Williams atty. re: filing papers in supp. of prelim. approval of settlement; rev'd. & executed my Aff. in this regard		
Robert M. Kornreich	4/15/2009	1.00

**Matter**

<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Date Worked</b>	<b>Hours</b>
<b>1768 / 3253 Irving Ehrenhaus (40) / Ehrenhaus v. John D. Baker II, et al. (Wachovia)</b>		
cw CBW re: additional documents; tcs w CBW		
Anthony D. Green	4/15/2009	3.70
Editing settlement papers; coordinating filing of papers with local and defense counsel; drafting letter to defense counsel; conferences with CBW; emails with defense counsel.		
Robert M. Kornreich	4/16/2009	0.20
cw CBW re papers		
Chet B. Waldman	4/16/2009	0.30
Rec'd. & eye-balled copies of docs. filed w/Ct. yesterday sent by depts' N.C. counsel; mtg. w/RMK in this regard; rev'd. news of co-settlement w/SEC over ARS		
Robert M. Kornreich	4/17/2009	0.10
tcw CBW re settlement papers		
Anthony D. Green	4/17/2009	0.60
Email with CLS; conference with CBW; emails to local counsel.		
Chet B. Waldman	4/17/2009	0.20
P/cs w/ADG, RMK re: deleted misfilings of some of prelim. approval papers		
Carl L. Stine	4/17/2009	0.20
Emails w/Ct. reporter re transcripts; email from Ct. re filings; email w/AG re pltf.		
Anthony D. Green	4/20/2009	0.20
Email with local counsel.		
Chet B. Waldman	4/20/2009	0.10
Mtg. w/RMK re: prelim. approval order filing & things to do		
Robert M. Kornreich	4/20/2009	0.10
csw CBW re: settlement papers		
Anthony D. Green	4/21/2009	0.70
Emails with local counsel; drafting letter to Court.		
Anthony D. Green	4/22/2009	1.20
Drafting letter to the Court; emails to defense counsel.		
Chet B. Waldman	4/22/2009	0.10
P/c w/T. Rickey (defense counsel) re: other SH litig.		
Robert M. Kornreich	4/22/2009	1.50
tcw Paul R and his associates re: Brooklyn case		
Chet B. Waldman	4/23/2009	0.30
P/c w/Ct. re: misunderstanding over "Proposed" Final Order & Jdmt.; p/c w/RMK, depts' counsel over ltr. to Wolf Haldenstein re: extension of time to MTD their action		
Robert M. Kornreich	4/23/2009	1.00
Email, from AR re: Bklyn case letter; tcw CBW re: same		
Robert M. Kornreich	4/23/2009	0.50
tc AR re same		
Anthony D. Green	4/24/2009	0.90

**Matter**

<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Date Worked</b>	<b>Hours</b>
<b>1768 / 3253 Irving Ehrenhaus (40) / Ehrenhaus v. John D. Baker II, et al. (Wachovia)</b>		
Revising notice according to Court's order; reading preliminary approval order; conference with CBW; emails to defense counsel.		
Chet B. Waldman	4/24/2009	0.50
P/cs w/RMK, ADG, rev'd. e-mails from ADG to defts' counsel, sent e-mails to RMK, CLS re: Ct.'s signing Prelim. Approval Order today & scheduling Settlement Hearing for Aug. 20, as well as modifying the Notice as ordered by the Ct.		
Robert M. Kornreich	4/24/2009	0.50
tcw CBW, emails CBW re hearing		
Shirley Joseph	4/27/2009	0.50
Prep rpt for CBW		
Anthony D. Green	4/27/2009	5.50
Researching settlement cases in North Carolina; conference with CBW and RMK.		
Chet B. Waldman	4/27/2009	0.40
Rev'd. Ct.'s Prelim. Approval Order; mtgs., p/cs w/RMK, ADG re: fee issues & legal rsch. relating thereto raised by Ct.'s order; e-mails w/defts' counsel re: date Notice is to be mailed; p/c w/SJ, mtg. w/RMK re: current lodestar		
Robert M. Kornreich	4/27/2009	1.10
R&R Preliminary Approval; cw CBW re: preli. approval		
Robert M. Kornreich	4/27/2009	0.80
R&R Stuco decision; tcs w CBW, ADG re same		
Anthony D. Green	4/28/2009	2.30
Researching settlement cases in North Carolina.		
Chet B. Waldman	4/28/2009	0.20
P/c w/RMK re: brief in supp. of settlement & issues to be sensitive to		
Robert M. Kornreich	4/28/2009	0.20
tcw CBW re settl issues		
Anthony D. Green	4/29/2009	1.30
Researching settlement cases.		
Anthony D. Green	5/11/2009	0.70
Researching settlement cases in North Carolina; drafting memo in support of final approval of settlement and attorney's fees.		
Anthony D. Green	5/12/2009	6.80
Researching settlement cases in North Carolina; drafting brief for final approval of settlement.		
Chet B. Waldman	5/26/2009	0.20
P/c, e-mail w/CLS re: mailing of Class Notice (just occurred)		
Carl L. Stine	5/26/2009	2.50
Tels w/shareholders answering questions re notice; tel w/CBW re same		
Robert M. Kornreich	5/26/2009	1.00
SH calls		
Chet B. Waldman	5/27/2009	0.30
P/c w/class member concerning notice he rec'd.; brief p/c w/RMK turning call over to me		
Carl L. Stine	5/27/2009	5.00

**Matter**

<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Date Worked</b>	<b>Hours</b>
<b>1768 / 3253 Irving Ehrenhaus (40) / Ehrenhaus v. John D. Baker II, et al. (Wachovia)</b>		
Many tels w/shareholders		
Robert M. Kornreich SH calls; tw CBW	5/27/2009	0.80
Chet B. Waldman P/cs w/several Class members w/questions on the Notice; mtgs. w/CLS, RMK in this regard	5/28/2009	0.50
Carl L. Stine Tel w/shareholders; meet w/RMK, CBW re same	5/28/2009	3.70
Robert M. Kornreich SH calls; cw CBW, CLS re same	5/28/2009	1.50
Chet B. Waldman P/c w/class members re: questions raised by the Notice	5/29/2009	0.40
Shirley Joseph Field phone calls from class members re settlement notice	5/29/2009	3.50
Carl L. Stine Tels w/shareholders; cw RMK re same	5/29/2009	2.20
Robert M. Kornreich SH calls	5/29/2009	0.70
Robert M. Kornreich cw CLS re: same	5/29/2009	0.20
Chet B. Waldman Rec'd. objection to lawsuit from class member; mtg. w/CLS, SJ re: influx of calls from the Class	6/1/2009	0.30
Shirley Joseph Field phone calls from class members re settlement notice; conf w/CBW, CLS re same	6/1/2009	0.90
Carl L. Stine Tel w/shareholders; meet w/CBW, SJ re same	6/1/2009	3.50
Robert M. Kornreich SH calls	6/1/2009	0.50
Chet B. Waldman Rec'd. "opt-out" ltr., p/cs from class members re: Notice	6/2/2009	0.40
Carl L. Stine Tel w/shareholders	6/2/2009	2.40
Anthony D. Green Conference with CLS re return shareholder calls	6/3/2009	0.20
Chet B. Waldman Rev'd. objection ltrs.; mtgs. w/CLS, RMK in this connection	6/3/2009	0.30
Carl L. Stine tels w/shareholders and review letters from same, meet w/RMK, CBW re: same, meet with AG re: making calls	6/3/2009	6.00

**Matter**

<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Date Worked</b>	<b>Hours</b>
<b>1768 / 3253 Irving Ehrenhaus (40) / Ehrenhaus v. John D. Baker II, et al. (Wachovia)</b>		
Robert M. Kornreich	6/3/2009	0.60
R&R letter/objections for SH; cw CBW, CLS re same		
Anthony D. Green	6/4/2009	1.20
Returning calls of Wachovia shareholders; conference with CLS.		
Carl L. Stine	6/4/2009	3.00
tels w/shareholders, meet w/AG re: same, tel w/Bill Savitt re: deal status		
Anthony D. Green	6/5/2009	2.40
Calling shareholders about settlement		
Chet B. Waldman	6/5/2009	0.20
Rev'd. objection/opt-out ltrs. from Class members		
Carl L. Stine	6/5/2009	2.50
calls with shareholders; meet w/RMK re shareholder ltrs		
Robert M. Kornreich	6/5/2009	0.70
R&R LF SH; cw CLS re: same.		
Anthony D. Green	6/8/2009	3.00
Calling shareholders about the settlement notice		
Carl L. Stine	6/8/2009	1.80
tels w/shareholders		
Shirley Joseph	6/8/2009	5.50
Return calls from class members re settlement notice		
Chet B. Waldman	6/9/2009	0.30
Rev'd. corr. from class members & e-mails w/CLS, SJ in this regard		
Carl L. Stine	6/9/2009	0.80
tels w/shareholders; meet w/CBW, SJ re shareholder ltrs, emails		
Shirley Joseph	6/9/2009	6.20
Return calls from class members re settlement notice; conf w/CBW, CLS re corres, emails re notice		
Anthony D. Green	6/10/2009	0.40
Call from shareholders re: settlement.		
Shirley Joseph	6/10/2009	6.10
Return calls from class members re settlement notice		
Anthony D. Green	6/11/2009	0.40
Calls to shareholders.		
Carl L. Stine	6/11/2009	0.70
tels w/shareholders; meet w/RMK, CBW re settl brief		
Chet B. Waldman	6/11/2009	0.40
Mtg's., p/cs w/RMK, MB, CLS in connection w/prep. for settlement brief & potentially contacting N.C. AG's office		

**Matter**

<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Date Worked</b>	<b>Hours</b>
<b>1768 / 3253 Irving Ehrenhaus (40) / Ehrenhaus v. John D. Baker II, et al. (Wachovia)</b>		
Alexander Rand Returning Shareholder Phone Calls	6/11/2009	3.50
Robert M. Kornreich cw CBW, CLS re: brief	6/11/2009	0.30
Carl L. Stine tels w/shareholders	6/12/2009	1.30
Alexander Rand Returning Shareholder Phone Calls	6/12/2009	3.50
Anthony D. Green Telephone calls from shareholders re: settlement; conference with CLS, AR re same	6/15/2009	0.70
Alexander Rand Returning Shareholder Phone Calls; conf with CLS, ADG re calls	6/15/2009	6.00
Carl L. Stine Tel. w/shareholders; meet w/AR & AG re calls to shareholders	6/15/2009	2.50
Chet B. Waldman Rev'd. relevant case law, professional rules in connection w/prep. to write settlement brief	6/16/2009	1.20
Alexander Rand Returning Shareholder Phone Calls	6/16/2009	3.50
Carl L. Stine Tels w/shareholders	6/16/2009	2.20
Chet B. Waldman Mtg. w/MB, RMK re: settlement hearing & drafting corr. for N.C. Treasurer's office	6/17/2009	0.50
Alexander Rand Returning Wachovia Shareholder Calls	6/17/2009	3.00
Carl L. Stine Tels w/shareholders	6/17/2009	3.30
Robert M. Kornreich cw MB and CBW re briefing	6/17/2009	0.50
Chet B. Waldman Mtg. w/CLS to discuss settlement brief, hearing; responding to objections received thus far	6/18/2009	0.30
Alexander Rand Returning Wachovia Shareholder Calls; tel conf with CLS re same	6/18/2009	5.00
Carl L. Stine Tels w/shareholders; tel w/AR re status of his calls; meet w/CBW re briefing	6/18/2009	2.00
Alexander Rand Returning Shareholder Phone Calls	6/19/2009	6.00
Chet B. Waldman	6/19/2009	0.10



**Matter**

<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Date Worked</b>	<b>Hours</b>
<b>1768 / 3253 Irving Ehrenhaus (40) / Ehrenhaus v. John D. Baker II, et al. (Wachovia)</b>		
P/c w/RMK re: N.C. Treasurer potential ltr.		
Robert M. Kornreich tcw/CBW re NC ltr	6/19/2009	0.10
Carl L. Stine tels w/shareholders	6/19/2009	3.00
Shirley Joseph Return calls from class members re settlement notice; clean up call list	6/22/2009	4.60
Chet B. Waldman Rec'd. & rev'd. add'l. ltrs. from SHs, some objections, some confusion	6/22/2009	0.20
Robert M. Kornreich SH calls	6/22/2009	0.50
Alexander Rand Wachovia Settlement Phone Calls	6/22/2009	4.90
Shirley Joseph Return calls from class members re settlement notice	6/23/2009	7.00
Chet B. Waldman Rec'd. & rev'd. new ltrs. from class members; mtg. w/CLS in this regard	6/23/2009	0.20
Carl L. Stine tels w/shareholders; meet w/CBW re shareholders ltrs	6/23/2009	0.80
Alexander Rand Wachovia Settlement Phone Calls	6/23/2009	7.00
Shirley Joseph Return calls from class members re settlement notice	6/24/2009	5.80
Chet B. Waldman P/c w/RMK re: settlement brief prep.	6/24/2009	0.10
Robert M. Kornreich csw CBW and CLS; SH call	6/24/2009	0.40
Carl L. Stine tels w/shareholders; meet w/RMK	6/24/2009	1.80
Alexander Rand Wachovia Settlement Phone Calls	6/24/2009	7.00
Shirley Joseph Return calls from class members re settlement notice	6/25/2009	6.90
Carl L. Stine tels w/shareholders	6/25/2009	2.20
Alexander Rand Wachovia Settlement Phone Calls	6/25/2009	7.00

**Matter**

<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Date Worked</b>	<b>Hours</b>
<b>1768 / 3253 Irving Ehrenhaus (40) / Ehrenhaus v. John D. Baker II, et al. (Wachovia)</b>		
Shirley Joseph Return calls from class members re settlement notice	6/26/2009	5.00
Carl L. Stine tels w/shareholders	6/26/2009	3.40
Alexander Rand Wachovia Settlement Calls	6/26/2009	2.00
Shirley Joseph Return calls from class members re settlement notice	6/29/2009	1.00
Chet B. Waldman Mtg. w/CLS re: drafting settlement brief; mtg. w/RMK re: settlement hearing travel arrangements; p/c from Class member	6/29/2009	0.30
Robert M. Kornreich csw CBW, CLS re: settlement papers, hearing	6/29/2009	0.40
Carl L. Stine tels w/shareholders; meets w/RMK, CBW re brief	6/29/2009	3.00
Alexander Rand Wachovia Settlement Phone Calls	6/29/2009	7.00
Shirley Joseph Field calls from class members re settlement notice	6/30/2009	0.80
Robert M. Kornreich Cw CBW re hearing	6/30/2009	0.10
Carl L. Stine tel w/shareholders	6/30/2009	2.20
Chet B. Waldman p/cs w/RMK re:travel arrangements for settlement hearing	6/30/2009	0.10
Alexander Rand Wachovia Settlement Phone Calls	6/30/2009	7.00
Carl L. Stine tels w/shareholders	7/1/2009	1.30
Alexander Rand Wachovia Settlement Phone Calls	7/1/2009	7.00
Carl L. Stine tels w/shareholders	7/2/2009	0.50
Alexander Rand Wachovia Settlement Phone Calls	7/2/2009	7.00
Robert M. Kornreich Work on settlement brief	7/2/2009	5.50

**Matter**

<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Date Worked</b>	<b>Hours</b>
<b>1768 / 3253 Irving Ehrenhaus (40) / Ehrenhaus v. John D. Baker II, et al. (Wachovia)</b>		
Chet B. Waldman	7/6/2009	1.60
Group mtgs w/RMK, CLS, ADG, reviewed relevant case law, local rule, mtgs w/SJ in connection with preparation of settlement briefs, inquires from class members		
Anthony D. Green	7/6/2009	1.20
Conference with CLS, CBW and RMK re: settlement approval motion papers; research.		
Shirley Joseph	7/6/2009	5.50
Field calls re settlement notice; conf w/CBW re citecheck, shep brief		
Alexander Rand	7/6/2009	7.00
Wachovia Settlement Phone Calls		
Carl L. Stine	7/6/2009	2.50
Emails & tels w/shareholders; meet w/RMK, CBW & AG re settlement brief; follow-up meet w/CBW & AG		
Robert M. Kornreich	7/6/2009	1.00
cw AG CLS and CBW re: settlement brief		
Robert M. Kornreich	7/6/2009	2.60
Work on settlement brief.		
Shirley Joseph	7/7/2009	3.00
Field calls from class members re settlement notice		
Alexander Rand	7/7/2009	5.00
Wachovia Phone Calls		
Sandra Vidal Pellon	7/8/2009	5.00
Researching attorneys' fees (hourly rates in North Carolina) for CBW		
Anthony D. Green	7/8/2009	2.20
Research for settlement and fee approval application.		
Shirley Joseph	7/8/2009	5.70
Field calls from class members re settlement notice		
Alexander Rand	7/8/2009	5.00
Wachovia Phone Calls		
Robert M. Kornreich	7/8/2009	1.30
Work on settlement brief		
Anthony D. Green	7/9/2009	3.90
Drafting final approval of settlement brief; research for brief; conference with CBW and CLS.		
Shirley Joseph	7/9/2009	4.30
Field calls from class members re settlement notice		
Chet B. Waldman	7/9/2009	0.30
mtgs w/CLS, ADG re: relevant case law for Settlement Brief, email inquiry from class members which I forwarded to CLS from AR		
Alexander Rand	7/9/2009	5.00
Wachovia Phone Calls		
Carl L. Stine	7/9/2009	0.80

**Matter**

<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Date Worked</b>	<b>Hours</b>
<b>1768 / 3253 Irving Ehrenhaus (40) / Ehrenhaus v. John D. Baker II, et al. (Wachovia)</b>		
Calls w/shareholders; meet w/CBW, AG re brief		
Robert M. Kornreich	7/9/2009	2.00
Work on settlement brief.		
Shirley Joseph	7/10/2009	5.90
Field calls from class members re settlement notice; conf w/CLS re same		
Anthony D. Green	7/10/2009	3.40
Drafting settlement and fee brief; research.		
Carl L. Stine	7/10/2009	1.30
Meet w/SJ re calls; calls w/shareholders		
Chet B. Waldman	7/11/2009	1.30
reviewed relevant NC notes and took notes in prep for writing relevant sections of settlement brief		
Sandra Vidal Pellon	7/13/2009	0.50
Researching Attorneys' fees in North Carolina for CBW		
Anthony D. Green	7/13/2009	12.30
Drafting settlement brief; research; conferences with CLS & CBW.		
Chet B. Waldman	7/13/2009	0.40
p/cs w/CLS, ADG re: settlement brief and relevant case law, as well as staffing massive amounts of class member calls		
Carl L. Stine	7/13/2009	2.40
Tels w/shareholders; tels w/CBW, AG re hiring temp paralegals to make calls		
Shirley Joseph	7/13/2009	4.70
Field calls; update lists of callers		
Sandra Vidal Pellon	7/14/2009	2.50
researching attorneys' fees in North Carolina for CBW		
Anthony D. Green	7/14/2009	10.20
Drafting settlement brief; research; conferences with CLS, RMK and Jenna Onusko; drafting motion to expand word limit of settlement brief; email to defense counsel.		
Chet B. Waldman	7/14/2009	0.20
reviewed ADG emails & response from Ds counsel re: filing motion for overlength settlement fee brief; email re: return of temp paras to process stl calls		
Carl L. Stine	7/14/2009	3.40
Prep. for mtg. w/new paralegals; train paralegals to call shareholders; tels w/shareholders; meet w/RMK AG re brief; meet w/RMK re temps		
Shirley Joseph	7/14/2009	6.00
Field calls; update lists of callers; prep call sheets for Sam & Randi		
Samuel Thacker	7/14/2009	7.00
Respond to shareholder inquiries		
Randi Wershba	7/14/2009	7.00
Returning phone calls to Wachovia shareholders, explaining settlement, answering their questions		
Robert M. Kornreich	7/14/2009	0.50
cw CLS re: temp para		

**Matter**

<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Date Worked</b>	<b>Hours</b>
<b>1768 / 3253 Irving Ehrenhaus (40) / Ehrenhaus v. John D. Baker II, et al. (Wachovia)</b>		
Robert M. Kornreich SH calls	7/14/2009	0.50
Robert M. Kornreich cw CLS, AG re M/Expand word in brief	7/14/2009	0.50
Sandra Vidal Pellon researching North Carolina attorneys' hourly fees for CBW	7/15/2009	1.00
Anthony D. Green Drafting brief; research; conference with RMK, CLS and CBW	7/15/2009	11.90
Carl L. Stine Tels w/shareholders; meets w/CBW, RMK, & AG re brief; re-read Senergy case	7/15/2009	4.40
Shirley Joseph Field calls; update lists of callers; prep call sheets for Sam & Randi; disc w/RMK	7/15/2009	2.20
Chet B. Waldman Rev'd. ltrs. sent by class members re: settlement; mtgs. w/RMK, CLS, ADG re: settlement brief & relevant case law & arguments; rev'd. articles, cases filings given to me by SG & gave & discussed them w/ADG	7/15/2009	0.60
Samuel Thacker Respond to shareholder inquiries	7/15/2009	7.00
Randi Wershba Returning phone calls to Wachovia shareholders, explaining settlement, answering their questions	7/15/2009	7.00
Robert M. Kornreich csw CBW, CLS, ADG re; legal issues to be discussed in Settlement Brief.	7/15/2009	0.50
Robert M. Kornreich cw SJ re shareholder calls	7/15/2009	0.50
Sandra Vidal Pellon researching attorneys' fees in North carolina	7/16/2009	0.50
Anthony D. Green Drafting settlement portion of brief; research; conference with CLS	7/16/2009	9.00
Alexander Rand Wachovia Settlement Calls	7/16/2009	1.00
Carl L. Stine Tels w/shareholders; meets w/AG re brief issues	7/16/2009	2.80
Shirley Joseph Field calls; update lists of callers; prep call sheets for Sam & Randi	7/16/2009	3.90
Samuel Thacker Respond to shareholder inquiries	7/16/2009	7.00
Randi Wershba Returning phone calls to Wachovia shareholders, explaining settlement, answering their questions	7/16/2009	7.00

**Matter**

<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Date Worked</b>	<b>Hours</b>
<b>1768 / 3253 Irving Ehrenhaus (40) / Ehrenhaus v. John D. Baker II, et al. (Wachovia)</b>		
Sandra Vidal Pellon Researching attorneys' fees in North Carolina for CBW	7/17/2009	3.00
Sandra Vidal Pellon comparing attorneys' fees and expenses and rolls for settlement declaration for LLL and EM	7/17/2009	3.50
Anthony D. Green Drafting settlement brief; research.; conferences and emails with CBW	7/17/2009	5.50
Shirley Joseph Field calls; update lists of callers; prep call sheets for Sam & Randi	7/17/2009	5.60
Chet B. Waldman Rev'd., edited & drafted portion of settlement brief; p/cs, e-mails w/ADG, rev'd. relevant case law in this regard	7/17/2009	1.70
Carl L. Stine Ltr. to shareholder re: non-opt-out; tels w/shareholder	7/17/2009	1.20
Samuel Thacker Respond to shareholder inquiries	7/17/2009	6.00
Randi Wershba Returning phone calls to Wachovia shareholders, explaining settlement, answering their questions	7/17/2009	2.50
Anthony D. Green Drafting settlement brief; research.	7/18/2009	4.60
Shirley Joseph Field calls; update caller lists	7/20/2009	4.80
Anthony D. Green Conference w/ RMK & CLS; drafting settlement brief; research.	7/20/2009	10.30
Carl L. Stine Rev. draft settlement brief; tel & meet w/RMK re same; meet w/RMK & AG re same; tels w/shareholders	7/20/2009	2.80
Robert M. Kornreich Work on settlement portion of brief; cw CLS, ADG	7/20/2009	4.00
Shirley Joseph Field calls; update caller lists	7/21/2009	6.40
Anthony D. Green Drafting settlement brief; research.	7/21/2009	9.30
Chet B. Waldman Rev'd. e-mails reflecting court's granting our motion to file a joint Fee & Settlement brief over word limit for one brief	7/21/2009	0.20
Sandra Vidal Pellon Researching attorneys' fees in NC for CBW	7/22/2009	1.00
Anthony D. Green Drafting settlement brief	7/22/2009	3.70
Shirley Joseph	7/22/2009	5.00

**Matter**

<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Date Worked</b>	<b>Hours</b>
<b>1768 / 3253 Irving Ehrenhaus (40) / Ehrenhaus v. John D. Baker II, et al. (Wachovia)</b>		
	Field calls; update caller lists	
Anthony D. Green	7/23/2009	4.00
	Conference with RMK; revising settlement brief.	
Shirley Joseph	7/23/2009	0.50
	Prep rpt for CLS	
Shirley Joseph	7/23/2009	5.00
	Field calls; update caller lists	
Sandra Vidal Pellon	7/23/2009	1.50
	Researching attorneys' fees in NC for CBW	
Robert M. Kornreich	7/23/2009	5.60
	Work on settlement brief; cw AG; cw CLS	
Carl L. Stine	7/23/2009	0.50
	meet w/RMK re: various brief issues	
Shirley Joseph	7/24/2009	4.00
	Field calls; update caller lists; conf w/CLS re same	
Anthony D. Green	7/24/2009	8.20
	Revising settlement brief; research; conference with RMK	
Randi Wershba	7/24/2009	5.00
	Returning phone calls to Wachovia shareholders, explaining settlement, answering their questions	
Carl L. Stine	7/24/2009	0.80
	meet w/SJ re: status of calls, tel w/a shareholder	
Anthony D. Green	7/25/2009	2.00
	Revising settlement brief; research.	
Anthony D. Green	7/27/2009	4.40
	Drafting settlement brief; conference with CBW & RMK; research.	
Sandra Vidal Pellon	7/27/2009	4.50
	Researching attorneys' fees in NC for CBW; disc w/CBW	
Chet B. Waldman	7/27/2009	0.80
	Mtgs. w/RMK, CLS, ADG, SG re: settlement brief; p/c w/class member re: settlement	
Shirley Joseph	7/27/2009	6.00
	Field calls; update caller lists	
Robert M. Kornreich	7/27/2009	2.30
	Work on draft of 7.27 of settlement brief and cw CBW, AG re; same.	
Carl L. Stine	7/27/2009	0.40
	meet w/CBW re: brief status and arguments	
Sandra Vidal Pellon	7/28/2009	2.50
	Researching attorneys' fees in NC for CBW; disc w/CBW	

**Matter**

<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Date Worked</b>	<b>Hours</b>
<b>1768 / 3253 Irving Ehrenhaus (40) / Ehrenhaus v. John D. Baker II, et al. (Wachovia)</b>		
Chet B. Waldman	7/28/2009	2.40
Rev'd. & edited latest draft of settlement brief; mtg. w/SG, rev'd. relevant case law in this connection		
Shirley Joseph	7/28/2009	0.60
Field calls; update caller lists		
Sandra Vidal Pellon	7/29/2009	1.50
researching North Carolina's attorneys' fees CBW, AG		
Chet B. Waldman	7/29/2009	0.30
Mtgs. w/ADG re: my edits to draft settlement brief		
Anthony D. Green	7/29/2009	0.80
Conferences with RMK and CBW on settlement brief.		
Shirley Joseph	7/29/2009	4.50
Field calls; update caller lists		
Robert M. Kornreich	7/29/2009	1.00
Review CBW edits in settlement brief; cw AG re: same.		
Samuel Thacker	7/29/2009	7.00
Respond to shareholder inquiries		
Shirley Joseph	7/30/2009	3.30
Field calls; update caller lists		
Anthony D. Green	7/30/2009	5.20
Revising settlement brief; conferences with RMK & CBW.		
Sandra Vidal Pellon	7/30/2009	3.00
researching North Carolina's attorneys' fees		
Chet B. Waldman	7/30/2009	3.20
Rev'd. & edited (significantly) fee portion of Settlement Brief; p/cs, e-mails w/RMK, ADG, rev'd. relevant case law, new objection ltrs., public filing excerpts in this regard		
Chet B. Waldman	7/30/2009	0.40
P/cs w/P. Rowe, corr. w/his assoc., p/cs w/RMK re: inquiry from Bernstein re: scope of release & potential impact on another securities case, ltrs. to be sent to class members giving them class notice & cover ltr. to Ct. attaching said ltrs. (which I rev'd.)		
Samuel Thacker	7/30/2009	6.00
Respond to shareholder inquiries		
Robert M. Kornreich	7/30/2009	3.30
Review CBW edits re: settlement brief and tow CBW re: same.		
Robert M. Kornreich	7/30/2009	0.10
cw CBW re: his tow/ PR re: class bar issue.		
Robert M. Kornreich	7/30/2009	0.10
cw CBW re: Kummer objection		
Robert M. Kornreich	7/30/2009	0.50
cw AG re: same.		



**Matter**

<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Date Worked</b>	<b>Hours</b>
<b>1768 / 3253 Irving Ehrenhaus (40) / Ehrenhaus v. John D. Baker II, et al. (Wachovia)</b>		
Sandra Vidal Pellon researching North Carolina's attorneys' fees	7/31/2009	4.00
Anthony D. Green Revising settlement brief; conference with CBW	7/31/2009	4.90
Chet B. Waldman Rev'd. & edited latest drafts of settlement brief, plif's Aff., co-counsel's Aff.	7/31/2009	5.30
Shirley Joseph Field calls; update caller lists	7/31/2009	6.00
Shirley Joseph Field calls; update caller lists; conf w/RMK, CBW, ADG re exhibits to brief	8/3/2009	6.00
Anthony D. Green Conferences with RMK, CBW, CLS, SJ; email to local counsel; drafting affidavits for local counsel & plaintiff; revising brief.	8/3/2009	0.80
Chet B. Waldman Rev'd. & edited form of lodestar chart as exhibits to aff'ds.; mtgs. w/RMK, ADG, SJ in this regard; mtgs. w/RMK, CLS, ADG re: aff'd. for plif. & co-counsel, settlement brief	8/3/2009	1.30
Robert M. Kornreich R&R revised draft; csw CBW, CLS, ADG, SJ re same	8/3/2009	4.00
Carl L. Stine meet w/RMK re: Status of brief	8/3/2009	0.30
Shirley Joseph Field calls; update caller lists	8/4/2009	6.50
Anthony D. Green Drafting Waldman Affidavit; conference with CBW; send draft affidavit to client	8/4/2009	1.50
Chet B. Waldman Rev'd. e-mails re: objection rec'd. today; p/cs w/CLS, ADG, from P. Rowe in this regard & re: settlement papers	8/4/2009	0.30
Robert M. Kornreich Review/edit settl. brief; cw CLS re: same	8/4/2009	1.00
Carl L. Stine tels w/shareholders, review draft settlement brief; meet CBW	8/4/2009	2.30
Robert M. Kornreich Review current draft of settlement brief; csw CBW, CLS re: same; tcw Greg J	8/5/2009	3.00
Anthony D. Green Reading objection filed with the court; conference with CBW.	8/5/2009	0.60
Chet B. Waldman Conf'd. editing latest draft of Wachovia Settlement Brief; lengthy mtgs. w/RMK, CLS, p/cs w/ADG, G. Jones in this connection	8/5/2009	2.70
Shirley Joseph Work on lodestar by categories	8/5/2009	2.50

**Matter**

<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Date Worked</b>	<b>Hours</b>
<b>1768 / 3253 Irving Ehrenhaus (40) / Ehrenhaus v. John D. Baker II, et al. (Wachovia)</b>		
Shirley Joseph	8/5/2009	2.30
Field calls; update caller lists		
Carl L. Stine	8/5/2009	4.20
meet w/RMK & CBW re: discussion w/Paul Rowe, meet w/CBW re: my edits to brief, meet w/CBW & RMK re: RMK comments & charts, begin revising parts fo brief; email to client re affidavit		
Anthony D. Green	8/6/2009	1.60
Drafting affidavit of CBW; conference with CBW		
Shirley Joseph	8/6/2009	2.50
Work on lodestar by categories; confs w/CBW, CLS re same		
Shirley Joseph	8/6/2009	3.20
Field calls; update caller lists		
Chet B. Waldman	8/6/2009	1.60
Edited portions of settlement brief, rev'd. relevant case law, edited lodestar charts, mailing of Notice, Aff.; p/cs, e-mails w/CLS, ADG, depts' counsel, SJ re: above & re: new objection		
Carl L. Stine	8/6/2009	0.60
review revised charts, email & tel w/CBW re same, meet w/SJ re same		
Shirley Joseph	8/7/2009	5.70
Recode time entries to reflect appropriate work codes; redo lodestars by categories for CBW		
Chet B. Waldman	8/7/2009	3.70
Cont'd. rev'ing., editing & drafting portions of Settlement brief; mtg. w/CLS, e-mails w/depts' counsel, SJ; rev'd. relevant case law, objections in this regard		
Carl L. Stine	8/7/2009	0.40
meet w/CBW re: papers		
Shirley Joseph	8/10/2009	2.50
Field calls; update caller lists		
Anthony D. Green	8/10/2009	3.20
Drafting Waldman's Affidavit; emails with CBW, CLS re settlement brief, etc.		
Chet B. Waldman	8/10/2009	0.20
Rev'd. e-mails b/n CLS, P. Rowe, ADG re: finalizing settlement papers		
Carl L. Stine	8/10/2009	3.00
calls w/shareholders; emails w/CBW, AG re brief		
Chet B. Waldman	8/11/2009	6.80
Rev'd., edited & drafted portions of CBW Aff. in supp. of settlement; edited brief also in supp. of settlement; mtgs. w/CLS, ADG, SJ, rev'd. objections, relevant case law, depts' draft brief; p/c w/RMK in this connection		
Shirley Joseph	8/11/2009	3.00
Field calls; update caller lists		
Shirley Joseph	8/11/2009	3.00
Begin shep, citecheck, etc settlement brief; prep TOA; prep expense chart; conf w/CBW re same		
Anthony D. Green	8/11/2009	0.70
Conference with CBW and CLS.		

**Matter**

<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Date Worked</b>	<b>Hours</b>
<b>1768 / 3253 Irving Ehrenhaus (40) / Ehrenhaus v. John D. Baker II, et al. (Wachovia)</b>		
Carl L. Stine	8/11/2009	7.30
	review defendants draft brief, review objections, revise objection section of brief, tel w/Greg Jones re: his aff. meets w/CBW, ADG re: brief, affidavit; email to client re settlement	
Chet B. Waldman	8/12/2009	6.40
	Cont'd. rev'ing., editing & drafting portions of plt's papers in supp. of Settlement (including Mem. of Law, CBW Aff., Jones Aff.); rev'd. relevant news releases, article, objection; numerous p/cs w/CLS, ADG; e-mails, conf. call w/P. Rowe & his colleague along with CLS in this regard	
Shirley Joseph	8/12/2009	6.50
	Cont. shep, citecheck, etc settlement brief	
Anthony D. Green	8/12/2009	1.00
	Proofreading brief and affidavit; conference with Sandra Ginsburg re: compiling exhibits.	
Sandra Vidal Pellon	8/12/2009	3.00
	putting together the exhibits for Waldman affidavit, disc w/ADG; emailing to NC counsel to be filed electronically	
Carl L. Stine	8/12/2009	8.20
	Revise affidavit & review & revise brief, draft motion, emails & tels w/P Rowe, CBW	
Anthony D. Green	8/13/2009	2.10
	Filing papers in support of settlement; conference with Sandra Ginsberg, CBW & CLS.	
Sandra Vidal Pellon	8/13/2009	0.20
	Disc w/CBW, CLS ADG re settlement papers	
Carl L. Stine	8/13/2009	11.00
	review revise and finalize all settlement papers; meets w/CBW, ADG, SG	
Shirley Joseph	8/13/2009	7.00
	Cont. work on settlement papers	
Chet B. Waldman	8/13/2009	9.30
	Finalized papers in supp. of settlement & served them today, incl. brief, CBW Aff., & Exhibits thereto; mtgs. w/CLS, ADG, SG in this connection; began prep. outline for Hearing argument	
Carl L. Stine	8/14/2009	4.80
	emails re filing papers, review and edit aff re: tech glitch, tels w/CBW, ADG re: argue, review objections and filings, tels and emails re same	
Anthony D. Green	8/14/2009	0.30
	Conference with CLS.	
Chet B. Waldman	8/14/2009	10.40
	Prep. for oral argument; drafted lengthy outline; rev'd. plt's papers, exhibits, SEC filings, defts' papers, Dec. 5 Order; numerous p/cs w/CLS, conf. call w/P.Rowe/CLS, rev'd. new objections, request for TV cameras in the Courthouse, e-mails among counsel re: these issues	
Anthony D. Green	8/15/2009	0.60
	Drafting proposal orders; conference with CBW.	
Chet B. Waldman	8/15/2009	7.90
	Cont'd. prep. for next week's presentation of the Settlement Hearing; edited & drafted part of outline, rev'd. relevant case law, SEC filings, p/cs, e-mails w/ADG, practiced presentation in this regard	
Chet B. Waldman	8/16/2009	3.90
	Cont'd. prep. for Settlement Hearing presentation; read 3 dep. transcripts, edited & practiced presentation in this regard	
Shirley Joseph	8/17/2009	3.50
	Field calls; update caller lists	

**Matter**

<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Date Worked</b>	<b>Hours</b>
<b>1768 / 3253 Irving Ehrenhaus (40) / Ehrenhaus v. John D. Baker II, et al. (Wachovia)</b>		
Anthony D. Green	8/17/2009	1.20
Revising orders; email to Jenna Onnsko; conference with CBW & RMK.		
Chet B. Waldman	8/17/2009	7.20
Cont'd. prep. to make presentation at Settlement Hearing; p/cs w/RMK, ADG; e-mails w/defts' counsel, ADG re: Final Stip. & Order; rev'd. relevant objections, Steel Dep.Tr., edited outline & practiced presentation in this connection		
Robert M. Kornreich	8/17/2009	3.60
R&R papers in support of settlement and objections		
Robert M. Kornreich	8/17/2009	0.40
tcs w CBW, ADG re: organization issues		
Shirley Joseph	8/18/2009	6.00
Field calls; update caller lists; tel w/CBW re objector		
Anthony D. Green	8/18/2009	1.20
Conference with CBW and RMK; researching Laffey Matrix.		
Chet B. Waldman	8/18/2009	9.80
Cont'd. prep. for Settlement Hearing presentation; rev'd. numerous relevant cases, new objections; p/cs w/objector, RMK, SJ, ADG; rev'd. other mat'ls.; edited outline; practiced presentation in this regard		
Robert M. Kornreich	8/18/2009	6.00
Prep. for hearing 8/20; tcs CBW, cw ADG		
Shirley Joseph	8/19/2009	1.00
Field calls; update caller lists; conf w/CBW re same		
Anthony D. Green	8/19/2009	0.50
Monitoring new developments on docket sheets; conference with RMK & LLL.		
Chet B. Waldman	8/19/2009	10.70
Cont'd. prep. for tomorrow's Settlement Hearing presentation; rev'd. & edited outline, practiced speech; rev'd. relevant case law, case opinion & order; travelled to Charlotte, N.C. w/RMK, p/cs w/CLS, ADG, SJ, depts' counsel in this connection		
Robert M. Kornreich	8/19/2009	5.00
Travel to NC for hearing		
Shirley Joseph	8/20/2009	1.50
field calls		
Carl L. Stine	8/20/2009	0.20
Call w/CBW re hearing		
Chet B. Waldman	8/20/2009	9.90
Prep. for & then travelled to Ct. for Settlement Hearing at which I made presentation; mtgs. w/RMK, G. Jones, depts' counsel, certain objector's counsel, reporters; travelled from N.C. to N.Y., p/c w/CLS in this regard		
Robert M. Kornreich	8/20/2009	8.00
Settlement hearing, csw CBW, Jones; travel to NYC		
Anthony D. Green	8/21/2009	1.40
Researching Bear Stearns case; conference with RMK		
Shirley Joseph	8/21/2009	0.30

**Matter**

<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Date Worked</b>	<b>Hours</b>
<b>1768 / 3253 Irving Ehrenhaus (40) / Ehrenhaus v. John D. Baker II, et al. (Wachovia)</b>		
Field calls		
Chet B. Waldman	8/21/2009	2.50
P/cs w/RMK, LLL, e-mails to & from BLBG, Wachtell re: outstanding issues; rev'd. news stories re: yesterday's hearing		
Robert M. Kornreich	8/21/2009	0.50
csw CBW, LLL and AG re: hearing issues		
Carl L. Stine	8/24/2009	2.00
Respond to shareholder emails; emails re release language; meet w/RMK re settlement hearing		
Robert M. Kornreich	8/24/2009	0.50
cw CLS re: hearing; tcw Rowe re: objection issues		
Shirley Joseph	8/25/2009	6.00
Field calls		
Carl L. Stine	8/25/2009	0.50
Respond to S.H. emails		
Anthony D. Green	8/26/2009	0.80
Conference with RMK; email to Jenna Onusko; preparing amended exhibits.		
Shirley Joseph	8/26/2009	6.00
Field calls		
Carl L. Stine	8/26/2009	0.50
Respond to shareholder emails		
Robert M. Kornreich	8/26/2009	0.50
cw ADG re amend exhs		
Anthony D. Green	8/27/2009	0.40
Emails with Jenna Onusho re: filing amended exhibits.		
Shirley Joseph	8/27/2009	6.00
Field calls		
Carl L. Stine	8/27/2009	2.30
Emails re release language; respond to S.H. emails		
Robert M. Kornreich	8/27/2009	3.50
R&R email, email to PR and RF, R&R draft response to objection - tcw PR re: same		
Anthony D. Green	8/28/2009	0.50
Conference with RMK re amended exhibits		
Shirley Joseph	8/28/2009	5.00
Field calls		
Carl L. Stine	8/28/2009	1.00
Respond to S.H. emails		
Robert M. Kornreich	8/28/2009	0.50
cw AG re: amended exhibits		

**Matter****Timekeeper****Date Worked****Hours****1768 / 3253 Irving Ehrenhaus (40) / Ehrenhaus v. John D. Baker II, et al. (Wachovia)**

Shirley Joseph	8/31/2009	6.00
Field calls		
Carl L. Stine	8/31/2009	1.20
Respond to S.H. emails		
Robert M. Kornreich	8/31/2009	0.50
SH call		
Chet B. Waldman	9/1/2009	0.40
Rev'd. motion filed by objectors seeking dep. transcripts & their corr. to depts' counsel in this regard; mtg. w/CLS re: last week's events		
Robert M. Kornreich	9/1/2009	1.50
R&R email to Freeman; cw CLS		
Robert M. Kornreich	9/1/2009	1.00
R&R request for depts and tcw CLS re: same.		
Carl L. Stine	9/1/2009	1.20
Rev. motion re transcripts; tels w/RMK re same; tel w/P. Rowe re same; email w/P. Rowe re same; meet w/CBW		
Shirley Joseph	9/1/2009	6.00
Field calls and update lists		
Shirley Joseph	9/2/2009	6.10
Field calls and update lists		
Shirley Joseph	9/3/2009	6.20
Field calls and update lists		
Chet B. Waldman	9/4/2009	0.20
Rev'd. corr. b/n RMK & depts' counsel re: objector's issues		
Shirley Joseph	9/4/2009	5.50
Field calls and update lists		
Chet B. Waldman	9/8/2009	0.30
Mtgs. w/RMK, CLS re: new objector's brief making new objections		
Robert M. Kornreich	9/8/2009	1.50
R&R additional objections; cw CBW re same		
Chet B. Waldman	9/9/2009	0.10
Rev'd. e-mails b/n depts' counsel & objectors sent by CLS		
Robert M. Kornreich	9/9/2009	0.50
TC PR		
Robert M. Kornreich	9/9/2009	1.00
R&R Emails and cw CLS re: same		
Robert M. Kornreich	9/10/2009	1.00
TC PR and MM re: strategy		

**Matter**

<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Date Worked</b>	<b>Hours</b>
<b>1768 / 3253 Irving Ehrenhaus (40) / Ehrenhaus v. John D. Baker II, et al. (Wachovia)</b>		
Shirley Joseph Field calls and update call lists	9/14/2009	5.10
Chet B. Waldman Rev'd. defts' brief opposing objectors' attempt to see dep. transcript	9/15/2009	0.30
Robert M. Kornreich R&R defts' brief re access to depts	9/15/2009	1.50
Shirley Joseph Field calls and update call lists	9/15/2009	3.00
Shirley Joseph Field calls and update call lists	9/16/2009	2.90
Carl L. Stine Email & tel w/def's counsel re status of negotiations w/objectors; tels w/RMK re same	9/16/2009	0.60
Robert M. Kornreich tcw PR, CLS	9/16/2009	0.50
Robert M. Kornreich tcw CLS	9/16/2009	0.50
Shirley Joseph Field calls and update call lists; conf w/RMK	9/17/2009	4.00
Robert M. Kornreich cw SJ re calls status	9/17/2009	0.50
Shirley Joseph Field calls and update call lists	9/18/2009	5.50
Shirley Joseph Field calls and update call lists	9/21/2009	5.50
Robert M. Kornreich TC PR and MM re: objectors	9/21/2009	0.60
Shirley Joseph Field calls and update call lists	9/22/2009	5.50
Shirley Joseph Field calls and update lists	9/23/2009	4.00
Chet B. Waldman P/cs, e-mails w/RMK, CLS, found relevant draft of Final Judgment & Order which needs to be submitted in light of recent happenings w/objectors	9/24/2009	0.40
Robert M. Kornreich Review proposed amended J and Stip.; csw CBW, CLS re: same.	9/24/2009	1.50
Carl L. Stine Emails re objector stip. & revised judgment; rev. same; meets & tels w/RMK, CBW re same; emails w/def's counsel re same	9/24/2009	1.40
Shirley Joseph	9/24/2009	5.50

**Matter**

<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Date Worked</b>	<b>Hours</b>
<b>1768 / 3253 Irving Ehrenhaus (40) / Ehrenhaus v. John D. Baker II, et al. (Wachovia)</b>		
Field calls and update lists		
Robert M. Kornreich	9/25/2009	0.50
cw CLS re: stip and Final J		
Carl L. Stine	9/25/2009	0.50
Meet w/RMK re stip. & judgment; emails re same		
Chet B. Waldman	9/29/2009	0.10
Rev'd. ltr. from certain objectors who continue to press objections		
Robert M. Kornreich	9/29/2009	1.00
cw CLS re: order and Final J; rev emails		
Carl L. Stine	9/29/2009	0.50
Rev. email from objector; meet w/RMK re same		
Shirley Joseph	9/30/2009	2.00
Field calls and update lists		
Robert M. Kornreich	9/30/2009	2.00
cw CLS re: Judgment email re: same; R&R final revised J		
Carl L. Stine	9/30/2009	1.40
Emails re filing of stip. & judgment; rev. final of same; tel w/local counsel re ltr. from objector; meet w/RMK re same & emails re same		
Shirley Joseph	10/6/2009	0.70
field calls from class members		
Chet B. Waldman	10/6/2009	0.10
P/c, e-mail w/CLS re: objectors (who were released) filing a lawsuit		
Shirley Joseph	10/7/2009	0.40
field calls from class members		
Robert M. Kornreich	10/7/2009	0.50
email.		
Shirley Joseph	10/8/2009	0.60
field calls from class members		
Chet B. Waldman	10/8/2009	0.10
Rev'd. news of Court's denial of objector's motion to rev. dep. transcripts		
Robert M. Kornreich	10/8/2009	0.50
R&R order denying M for deps.		
Shirley Joseph	10/12/2009	0.80
Field calls, update list		
Shirley Joseph	10/13/2009	0.90
Field calls		
Chet B. Waldman	10/14/2009	0.20
Rev'd. Notice of Withdrawal of Objection, p/cs to & from Ct. Reporter re: obtaining Settlement Hearing Tr.		



**Matter**

<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Date Worked</b>	<b>Hours</b>
<b>1768 / 3253 Irving Ehrenhaus (40) / Ehrenhaus v. John D. Baker II, et al. (Wachovia)</b>		
Robert M. Kornreich R&R Notice of Withdrawal of Objection.	10/14/2009	0.50
Chet B. Waldman Rev'd. objections filed w/Ct., mtg. w/LLL re: status	10/15/2009	0.20
Carl L. Stine Rev. filed objections; meet w/RMK re same	10/15/2009	0.30
Robert M. Kornreich cw CLS re: withdrawal notice	10/15/2009	0.50
Shirley Joseph field calls; conf w/RMK re same	10/16/2009	0.40
Robert M. Kornreich Rev notice of W; cw SJ re calls	10/16/2009	0.50
Shirley Joseph Field calls	10/19/2009	0.30
Chet B. Waldman Rec'd. transcript of settlement hearing; mtgs. w/RMK, ADG re: transcript & possible appeal	10/21/2009	0.30
Anthony D. Green Conference with CBW re: objections.	10/21/2009	0.30
Robert M. Kornreich cw CBW re: withdrawal of objection; review same; review transcript	10/21/2009	1.00
Shirley Joseph Field calls	10/28/2009	0.90
Shirley Joseph Field calls	10/29/2009	0.50
Shirley Joseph Field calls	10/30/2009	1.00
Chet B. Waldman Rev'd. recent relevant fed. case handling objectors	11/2/2009	0.40
Shirley Joseph Field calls	11/4/2009	2.20
Anthony D. Green Conference with CBW re status of Bear Stearn	11/5/2009	0.10
Chet B. Waldman P/cs w/RMK, ADG, mtg. w/CLS re: J. Diaz's nomination to 4th Circuit & Bear Stearns case status	11/5/2009	0.40
Shirley Joseph Field calls	11/5/2009	0.20

**Matter**

<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Date Worked</b>	<b>Hours</b>
<b>1768 / 3253 Irving Ehrenhaus (40) / Ehrenhaus v. John D. Baker II, et al. (Wachovia)</b>		
Carl L. Stine Meet w/CBW re Diaz nom. to 4th Cir.; BS status	11/5/2009	0.20
Robert M. Kornreich tcw CBW re: BS status.	11/5/2009	0.20
Anthony D. Green Conference with CBW re Bear Stearn appeal	11/6/2009	0.10
Chet B. Waldman P/cs w/RMK, ADG re: Bear Stearns appeal status	11/6/2009	0.20
Shirley Joseph Field calls	11/6/2009	0.20
Robert M. Kornreich tcw CBW re: BS appeal status.	11/6/2009	0.10
Shirley Joseph Field calls	11/9/2009	0.10
Shirley Joseph Field calls	11/10/2009	0.40
Shirley Joseph Field calls	11/11/2009	0.20
Shirley Joseph Field calls	11/12/2009	0.30
Shirley Joseph Field calls	11/13/2009	0.20
Chet B. Waldman Mtg. w/RMK, CLS re: status	11/18/2009	0.10
Carl L. Stine Meet w/RMK, CBW re status	11/18/2009	0.10
Robert M. Kornreich cw CBW, CLS re status	11/18/2009	0.10
Robert M. Kornreich R&R Notice of Appeal	11/23/2009	0.50
Shirley Joseph Field calls, update caller list	11/30/2009	1.00
Shirley Joseph Field calls	12/1/2009	0.40
Shirley Joseph Field calls	12/2/2009	0.50
Shirley Joseph	12/3/2009	0.40

**Matter**

<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Date Worked</b>	<b>Hours</b>
<b>1768 / 3253 Irving Ehrenhaus (40) / Ehrenhaus v. John D. Baker II, et al. (Wachovia)</b>		
	Field calls	
Shirley Joseph	12/4/2009	0.60
	Field calls	
Shirley Joseph	12/7/2009	0.40
	Field calls	
Shirley Joseph	12/8/2009	0.40
	Field calls	
Shirley Joseph	12/14/2009	0.10
	Field calls	
Shirley Joseph	12/15/2009	0.10
	Field calls	
Shirley Joseph	12/16/2009	0.20
	Field calls	
Chet B. Waldman	12/16/2009	0.20
	Conf. call w/RMK, defts' counsel seeking intelligence on timing of settlement decision	
Robert M. Kornreich	12/16/2009	0.20
	tcw CBW, dfts' counsel re Ct decision	
Chet B. Waldman	12/22/2009	0.40
	Rev'd. relevant case law to possible appeal; mtg. w/CLS re: expected timing on Ct.'s opinion	
Carl L. Stine	12/22/2009	0.10
	Meet w/CBW re Ct dec.	
Chet B. Waldman	12/24/2009	0.30
	Rev'd. relevant N.C. deriv. settlement notice	
Shirley Joseph	1/5/2010	0.60
	Field calls	
Chet B. Waldman	1/6/2010	0.40
	Rev'd. e-mails b/n Ct. clerk & objectors re: status of their appeal; p/cs w/RMK, CLS & M. Merritt in this regard	
Carl L. Stine	1/6/2010	0.20
	tel w/CBW re objectors, appeal	
Robert M. Kornreich	1/6/2010	0.50
	cw CBW re: email fr. Diaz's law clerk; cw CBW re: tcw/ MM	
Shirley Joseph	1/7/2010	0.80
	Field calls	
Chet B. Waldman	1/7/2010	0.20
	Mtg. w/RMK re: responding to potential objector, J. Diaz 4th Cir. nomination; mtg. w/PE re: the latter	
Robert M. Kornreich	1/7/2010	0.20
	cw CBW re: objector	

**Matter**

<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Date Worked</b>	<b>Hours</b>
<b>1768 / 3253 Irving Ehrenhaus (40) / Ehrenhaus v. John D. Baker II, et al. (Wachovia)</b>		
Shirley Joseph Field calls	1/8/2010	0.50
Chet B. Waldman P/cs w/PE re: J. Diaz status	1/8/2010	0.20
Chet B. Waldman Rev'd. ltr. from class member's counsel; mtg. w/CLS in this regard	1/11/2010	0.20
Carl L. Stine Meet w/CBW re ltr from class member atty	1/11/2010	0.10
Chet B. Waldman Wrote ltr. from atty. seeking case status update; rev'd. e-mail from depts' counsel encl. draft motion to dismiss appeal from objectors; mtg. w/CLS re: said papers	1/12/2010	0.40
Carl L. Stine Rev. email from depts' counsel re objector appeal & draft papers attached; meet w/CBW re same	1/12/2010	0.70
Chet B. Waldman P/cs, e-mails w/R. Fuller, RMK re: whether to make motion to dismiss appeal on dep. transcript access issue by objector & eventually filing of said motion	1/13/2010	0.40
Robert M. Kornreich tcw CBW re: m/dismiss appeal	1/13/2010	0.50
Chet B. Waldman Rev'd. filing of depts' MTD appeal	1/14/2010	0.20
Shirley Joseph Tcw/class members	1/18/2010	0.70
Chet B. Waldman Rev'd. & edited "me too" brief support depts' MTD appeal; mtgs. w/RMK, SG in this connection	1/18/2010	0.80
Sandra Vidal Pellon drafting answer to motion to dismiss appeal; disc w/CBW	1/18/2010	0.50
Robert M. Kornreich cw CBW M/Dismiss appeal	1/18/2010	0.50
Chet B. Waldman Filed response to depts' MTD Appeal of Order Refusing Objectors' late request to review dep. transcripts; p/c w/G. Jones, e-mails w/his office, RMK, CLS, mtg. w/SG in this regard	1/19/2010	0.40
Sandra Vidal Pellon Disc w/CBW re answer to motion to dismiss appeal	1/19/2010	0.20
Chet B. Waldman Rev'd. news on J. Diaz sent from PE; p/c w/RMK in this regard	1/20/2010	0.20
Robert M. Kornreich tcw CBW re: Judge Diaz	1/20/2010	0.10
Robert M. Kornreich R&R LF objectors to GO and CLS	1/21/2010	0.50

**Matter**

<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Date Worked</b>	<b>Hours</b>
<b>1768 / 3253 Irving Ehrenhaus (40) / Ehrenhaus v. John D. Baker II, et al. (Wachovia)</b>		
Shirley Joseph	1/22/2010	1.60
Respond to shareholder inquiries; field calls		
Chet B. Waldman	1/22/2010	2.70
Rev'd. ltr. sent by objectors & drafted responsive ltr.; p/cs, e-mails w/RMK, CLS, G. Jones, rev'd. relevant background mat'ls. in this connection; also rev'd. draft Stip. to N.Y. Ct. further staying action until settlement is ruled upon		
Robert M. Kornreich	1/22/2010	1.00
Edit LT objector; cw CBW, emails re same		
Carl L. Stine	1/22/2010	0.10
Tel w/CBW re ltr to obj.; emails re same		
Shirley Joseph	1/25/2010	0.40
Field calls		
Robert M. Kornreich	1/25/2010	1.00
edit draft of lt objectors		
Shirley Joseph	1/27/2010	0.70
Field class members inquiries		
Chet B. Waldman	1/28/2010	0.20
E-mails among PE, RMK, CLS & me, p/c w/RMK re: J. Diaz's Congressional Committee approval for 4th Civ. appointment		
Robert M. Kornreich	1/28/2010	0.10
Email, tcw CBW re Diaz		
Shirley Joseph	1/28/2010	0.70
Field class members inquiries		
Shirley Joseph	2/1/2010	0.50
Field class member calls		
Chet B. Waldman	2/5/2010	1.10
Rev'd. Ct.'s opinion on Settlement & Fee App.; p/cs w/CLS, RMK, e-mails w/G. Jones in this connection		
Carl L. Stine	2/5/2010	1.80
Read judge's decision; tels & meets w/CBW & RMK re same; email to defs' counsel		
Shirley Joseph	2/5/2010	0.30
Field class member calls		
Robert M. Kornreich	2/5/2010	1.50
R&R Order re: settlement fee		
Robert M. Kornreich	2/5/2010	0.50
cw CLS, tcw CBW re: same;		
Chet B. Waldman	2/8/2010	0.30
Rev'd. e-mails b/n CLS, LLL, mtgs. w/LLL, RMK re: fee award & potential of appeal		
Carl L. Stine	2/8/2010	0.10
Emails, tel w/CBW re appeal		
Lester L. Levy	2/8/2010	0.10

**Matter**

<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Date Worked</b>	<b>Hours</b>
<b>1768 / 3253 Irving Ehrenhaus (40) / Ehrenhaus v. John D. Baker II, et al. (Wachovia)</b>		
WACHOVIA (3253) - emails, tel with CBW re appeal status		
Shirley Joseph Field class member calls	2/8/2010	0.50
Robert M. Kornreich Cw CBW re appeal	2/8/2010	0.10
Chet B. Waldman E-mails w/G. Jones re: time for objectors to appeal; figured out time period in this regard	2/9/2010	0.20
Shirley Joseph Field class member calls	2/23/2010	0.50
Chet B. Waldman P/c w/RMK re: settlement op.	2/24/2010	0.20
Robert M. Kornreich tc CBW re opin.	2/24/2010	0.20
Shirley Joseph Field class members calls	2/26/2010	0.60
Shirley Joseph Tcw/class members	3/1/2010	0.60
Chet B. Waldman Rev'd. notice of appeal; mtgs. w/RMK, CLS; e-mails w/G. Jones, defts' counsel in this regard	3/8/2010	0.50
Carl L. Stine meet w/CBW re appeal	3/8/2010	0.20
Robert M. Kornreich cw CBW re: appeal	3/8/2010	0.30
Chet B. Waldman Began rev'ing. N.C. State Ct. appellate rules	3/9/2010	0.40
Chet B. Waldman Lengthy conf. call w/R. Fuller, M. Merritt, RMK re: N.C. appellate procedure, responding to appeal; e-mails w/RF, MM in this regard	3/11/2010	0.70
Robert M. Kornreich Tel. conf. defts counsel, CBW re appeal	3/11/2010	0.50
Chet B. Waldman Rev'd. e-mail from RF, which I sent to RMK, CLS, which follows up on issues raised yesterday on our p/c	3/12/2010	0.30
Carl L. Stine Review email forwarded by CBW re appeal	3/12/2010	0.20
Robert M. Kornreich Rev email re appeal	3/12/2010	0.10
Shirley Joseph Research court filings re Norwood Robinson ltr dated Jun 2009; email to CLS re same; tcw/class members re final settlement; emails to class members re final settlement; conf w/CBW & emails re same	3/15/2010	3.40

**Matter****Timekeeper****Date Worked****Hours****1768 / 3253 Irving Ehrenhaus (40) / Ehrenhaus v. John D. Baker II, et al. (Wachovia)**

Matter	Timekeeper	Date Worked	Hours
	Chet B. Waldman	3/15/2010	0.30
	Mtgs. w/CLS, SJ, e-mails w/them & w/R. Fuller re: finding certain docs. relevant to Robinson objection to determine whether they are part of the record		
	Carl L. Stine	3/15/2010	0.20
	Meet, emails w/CBW re Robinson obj.		
	Shirley Joseph	3/16/2010	0.40
	Tcsw/class members		
	Chet B. Waldman	3/17/2010	0.20
	Rev'd. news article re: money laundering allegation against Wachovia sent by GJ; sent to RMK, CLS		
	Shirley Joseph	3/17/2010	0.50
	Field class member calls		
	Chet B. Waldman	3/19/2010	0.20
	Rec'd. notice of appellants ordering the transcript documentation; rev'd. R. Fuller e-mail in this regard		
	Shirley Joseph	3/22/2010	0.60
	Field class member calls		
	Shirley Joseph	3/24/2010	0.50
	Field class from class members		
	Shirley Joseph	3/26/2010	0.30
	Field calls from class members		
	Shirley Joseph	3/29/2010	0.40
	Field class member calls		
	Shirley Joseph	3/30/2010	0.50
	Field class member calls		
	Shirley Joseph	3/31/2010	0.50
	Field class member calls		
	Robert M. Kornreich	3/31/2010	0.10
	R&R email re: dismissal of related case.		
	Shirley Joseph	4/1/2010	0.60
	Field class member inquiries		
	Carl L. Stine	4/1/2010	0.20
	Meet w/RMK re status		
	Robert M. Kornreich	4/1/2010	0.50
	Rec'd ck, cw CLS, Vera		
	Shirley Joseph	4/5/2010	0.50
	Field class member inquiries		
	Chet B. Waldman	4/5/2010	0.20
	Rev'd. case excerpt relevant to fee part of appeal		

<b>Matter</b>	<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Date Worked</b>	<b>Hours</b>
<b>1768 / 3253 Irving Ehrenhaus (40) / Ehrenhaus v. John D. Baker II, et al. (Wachovia)</b>			
	Shirley Joseph	4/8/2010	0.40
	Field class member inquiries		
	Shirley Joseph	4/9/2010	0.50
	Field class member inquiries		
	Shirley Joseph	4/12/2010	0.50
	Field class member inquiries		
	Shirley Joseph	4/13/2010	0.50
	Field class member inquiries		
	Shirley Joseph	4/14/2010	0.50
	Field class member inquiries		
	Chet B. Waldman	4/14/2010	0.60
	Rev'd. ltr. from appellants & drafted response thereto; e-mails to RMK, G. Jones, p/cs w/RMK, CLS in this regard		
	Carl L. Stine	4/14/2010	0.40
	Rev. ltr. from objector; tel w/CBW re same		
	Robert M. Kornreich	4/14/2010	0.50
	R&R LF appellant; cw CBW re response		
	Shirley Joseph	4/15/2010	0.30
	Field class member inquiries		
	Chet B. Waldman	4/15/2010	0.30
	P/c w/RMK, e-mails w/G. Jones re: responding to objectors' ltr.		
	Robert M. Kornreich	4/15/2010	0.20
	tcw CBW re obj.		
	Shirley Joseph	4/16/2010	0.40
	Field class member inquiries		
	Shirley Joseph	4/19/2010	0.40
	Field class member inquiries		
	Shirley Joseph	4/20/2010	0.30
	Field class member inquiries		
	Shirley Joseph	4/21/2010	0.30
	Field class member inquiries		
	Shirley Joseph	4/22/2010	0.30
	Field class member inquiries		
	Shirley Joseph	4/23/2010	0.40
	Field class member inquiries		
	Shirley Joseph	4/26/2010	0.50
	Field class member inquiries		
	Chet B. Waldman	4/26/2010	0.40



**Matter**

<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Date Worked</b>	<b>Hours</b>
<b>1768 / 3253 Irving Ehrenhaus (40) / Ehrenhaus v. John D. Baker II, et al. (Wachovia)</b>		
Rev'd. e-mails from objectors, G. Jones re: their seeking discovery & threatening to go to Bar Ass'n.; p/cs w/RMK, CLS in this connection		
Carl L. Stine Tel w/CBW re objector	4/26/2010	0.10
Robert M. Kornreich tcw CBW re obj	4/26/2010	0.10
Chet B. Waldman Rev'd. G. Jones ltr. to Robinson (objector); e-mail to RMK, CLS in this connection	4/28/2010	0.20
Robert M. Kornreich R&R LF G.Jones to appellants; email CBW	4/28/2010	0.50
Shirley Joseph Field class member calls	4/29/2010	0.30
Shirley Joseph Prep ltr in response to class member inquiry	5/4/2010	0.20
Shirley Joseph Field clas member inquiries	5/5/2010	0.20
Shirley Joseph Field class member inquiries	5/6/2010	0.40
Chet B. Waldman Rev'd. G. Jones follow-up ltr. to objectors & e-mail from Ct. reporter re: completion of appellate transcript; p/c, e-mails w/RMK in this connection	5/6/2010	0.30
Shirley Joseph Field class member inquiries	5/7/2010	0.30
Shirley Joseph Field class member inquiries	5/10/2010	0.30
Chet B. Waldman Rev'd. portions of Settlement Hearing Transcript sent by Ct. Rptr.; e-mails w/R. Fuller to schedule conf. call to discuss appeal process; e-mails to RMK, CLS re: above; e-mail to LLL re: case status	5/10/2010	0.30
Shirley Joseph Field class member inquiries	5/11/2010	0.30
Chet B. Waldman Participated in p/c w/R. Fuller, rev'd. his subsequent e-mails re: timing of appeal; p/c w/LLL in this regard; sent RF's e-mails to CLS, RMK	5/11/2010	0.50
Shirley Joseph Field calls from class members	5/12/2010	0.30
Chet B. Waldman Rev'd. objector Robinson's latest ltr.; e-mails to & from G. Jones re: his response thereto	5/12/2010	0.30
Chet B. Waldman Rev'd. e-mails from local counsel to Ct. resending a previously-filed doc.; p/c w/CLS in this regard	5/13/2010	0.20
Shirley Joseph Field calls from class members	5/13/2010	0.20

**Matter****Timekeeper****Date Worked****Hours****1768 / 3253 Irving Ehrenhaus (40) / Ehrenhaus v. John D. Baker II, et al. (Wachovia)**

Carl L. Stine	5/13/2010	0.20
Emails re corrupted exhibit; tel w/CBW re same		
Shirley Joseph	5/14/2010	0.30
Field calls from class members		
Shirley Joseph	5/17/2010	0.20
Field calls from class members		
Shirley Joseph	5/18/2010	0.30
Field calls from class members		
Shirley Joseph	5/19/2010	0.30
Field calls from class members		
Shirley Joseph	5/20/2010	0.30
Field calls from class members		
Shirley Joseph	5/24/2010	0.30
Field calls from class members		
Shirley Joseph	5/27/2010	0.50
Field class member calls		
Shirley Joseph	5/28/2010	0.50
Field class member calls		
Shirley Joseph	6/1/2010	0.30
Field calls from class members		
Shirley Joseph	6/2/2010	0.30
Field calls from class members		
Shirley Joseph	6/3/2010	0.10
Field calls from class members		
Shirley Joseph	6/4/2010	0.30
Field calls from class members		
Chet B. Waldman	6/10/2010	0.30
E-mails w/DF, G. Jones, RMK, p/cs w/RMK re: Appellants' time to perfect the record		
Robert M. Kornreich	6/10/2010	0.20
cw CBW re record on app.		
Shirley Joseph	6/16/2010	0.30
Field class member calls		
Chet B. Waldman	6/17/2010	0.10
Mtg. w/CLS re: rev'ing. record on appeal		
Robert M. Kornreich	6/17/2010	0.10
tcw CLS re rec on app.		

**Matter**

<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Date Worked</b>	<b>Hours</b>
<b>1768 / 3253 Irving Ehrenhaus (40) / Ehrenhaus v. John D. Baker II, et al. (Wachovia)</b>		
Carl L. Stine Meet w/CBW re record on appeal; tel w/RMK re same	6/17/2010	0.30
Chet B. Waldman Rev'd. objector's prop. record on appeal; e-mails w/SJ in this regard	6/18/2010	0.40
Shirley Joseph Conf w/CBW re assign regarding record on appeal	6/21/2010	0.20
Chet B. Waldman Mtg. w/RMK, CLS, SJ re: rev'd. preferred record on appeal	6/21/2010	0.30
Robert M. Kornreich cw CBW re record.	6/21/2010	0.10
Carl L. Stine Meet w/CBW re record on appeal	6/21/2010	0.10
Shirley Joseph Field calls from class members	6/22/2010	0.50
Shirley Joseph Rev appellants' proposed record on appeal docs	6/23/2010	5.80
Chet B. Waldman P/c w/SJ re: her review of appellant's record on appeal	6/24/2010	0.10
Shirley Joseph Rev appellants' proposed record on appeal docs; disc same w/CBW	6/24/2010	5.70
Shirley Joseph Rev appellants' proposed record on appeal docs; disc same w/CBW	6/25/2010	2.00
Chet B. Waldman E-mails w/R. Fuller, CLS, p/c w/SJ re: time to object to appellant's prop. record on appeal, scheduling a call for Monday in this regard	6/25/2010	0.30
Chet B. Waldman Rev'd. relevant presentation on appellate brief writing	6/26/2010	0.30
Chet B. Waldman Conf. call w/R. Fuller, e-mails w/G. Jones, brief mtg. w/CLS re: challenging preferred record on appeal & process going forward	6/29/2010	0.40
Carl L. Stine Meet w/CBW re record on appeal	6/29/2010	0.10
Carl L. Stine Meet w/CBW re status	6/30/2010	0.10
Chet B. Waldman Mtg. w/CLS re: my call w/R. Fuller & corr. w/G. Jones yesterday	6/30/2010	0.10
Chet B. Waldman E-mails w/defts' counsel re: procedurally responding to objector's record on appeal	7/1/2010	0.30
Robert M. Kornreich	7/1/2010	1.00

**Matter**

<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Date Worked</b>	<b>Hours</b>
<b>1768 / 3253 Irving Ehrenhaus (40) / Ehrenhaus v. John D. Baker II, et al. (Wachovia)</b>		
Email and review record re appeal		
Chet B. Waldman	7/6/2010	1.80
Rev'd. docs., index docket sheet in connection w/putting in Appellee's alternative record on appeal; mtgs. w/SJ, CLS, RMK in this regard		
Shirley Joseph	7/6/2010	0.30
Field class member calls; conf w/CBW, CLS re record on appeal		
Robert M. Kornreich	7/6/2010	0.10
cw CBW re status		
Carl L. Stine	7/6/2010	0.20
meet w/CBW & SJ re record		
Shirley Joseph	7/7/2010	0.30
Field class member calls		
Chet B. Waldman	7/7/2010	1.40
Rev'd. relevant docket sheets, numerous e-mails w/defts' counsel, p/cs w/CLS, SJ re: finalizing Record on Appeal & issues relating thereto		
Carl L. Stine	7/7/2010	0.50
calls and emails re: record on appeal		
Chet B. Waldman	7/8/2010	0.50
Drafted, edited & finalized ltr. to Objectors re: Record on Appeal; mtgs. w/CLS, e-mails to & from depts' counsel in this regard		
Shirley Joseph	7/8/2010	0.50
Field calls from class members; answer corresp from class member		
Carl L. Stine	7/8/2010	0.20
Meet w/CBW re record		
Chet B. Waldman	7/14/2010	0.30
make sure letter re: reconciling the record was sent by certified mail, email w/Ds counsel in this regard		
Shirley Joseph	7/16/2010	0.40
Field calls from class members		
Chet B. Waldman	7/19/2010	0.40
Rev'd. Norwood Robinson's e-mail response to alternate record proposed by the parties; p/c w/A. Drerr, e-mails w/RF, RMK in this regard		
Robert M. Kornreich	7/19/2010	0.50
cw CBW re: NR Letter		
Chet B. Waldman	7/21/2010	0.50
Rev'd. new ltr. from N. Robinson; p/cs w/RMK, AD, e-mails to same; rev'd. Ct. docket sheet, brief in opp. to objectors' request to rev. dep. transcripts		
Robert M. Kornreich	7/21/2010	0.60
R&R LT NR from Doerr; cw CBW		
Shirley Joseph	7/22/2010	0.30
Field class member calls		
Chet B. Waldman	7/22/2010	0.30
Rv'd. ltr. from depts' counsel to Appellant re: the record; mtgs. w/CLS, p/c w/RMK in this regard		

**Matter**

<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Date Worked</b>	<b>Hours</b>
<b>1768 / 3253 Irving Ehrenhaus (40) / Ehrenhaus v. John D. Baker II, et al. (Wachovia)</b>		
Carl L. Stine Meets w/CBW re record	7/22/2010	0.10
Robert M. Kornreich R&R LT NR for AD; cw CBW re record	7/22/2010	0.20
Shirley Joseph Field class member calls, respond to email	7/26/2010	0.20
Shirley Joseph Field class member calls	7/26/2010	0.50
Shirley Joseph Field class member calls	7/27/2010	0.50
Chet B. Waldman P/c w/RMK, rev'd. e-mails as between Judge's clerk & other parties' counsel re: scheduling a hearing to reconcile the record on appeal	7/27/2010	0.40
Robert M. Kornreich TC CW re: appeal.	7/27/2010	0.20
Shirley Joseph Field class member calls	7/28/2010	0.20
Chet B. Waldman Rev'd. numerous e-mails as between the Ct.'s clerk & parties' counsel re: scheduling a hearing on reconciling the record on appeal	7/28/2010	0.30
Carl L. Stine Emails re hearing re record; rev. objector & def's submissions; meet w/RMK re same	7/28/2010	0.80
Robert M. Kornreich Emails re LT Conf.; cw CLS	7/28/2010	0.50
Shirley Joseph Field class member calls	7/29/2010	0.30
Chet B. Waldman Conf. call w/CLS, RMK, p/cs, e-mails among Ct. clerk & parties re: tomorrow's conf. to settle the record before J. Diaz	7/29/2010	0.40
Carl L. Stine Emails re hearing, re record; tel w/CBW & RMK re same	7/29/2010	1.20
Robert M. Kornreich tcw CBW, CLS re record issues conf.	7/29/2010	0.30
Shirley Joseph Field class member calls	7/30/2010	0.30
Chet B. Waldman Prep. for & then participated in Ct. hearing to settle the record; p/cs w/D. Fuller, CLS, e-mails w/G. Jones, rev'd. defts' brief in supp. of their position in this connection	7/30/2010	2.70
Carl L. Stine Tels w/CBW before hearing & after	7/30/2010	0.80

**Matter**

<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Date Worked</b>	<b>Hours</b>
<b>1768 / 3253 Irving Ehrenhaus (40) / Ehrenhaus v. John D. Baker II, et al. (Wachovia)</b>		
Chet B. Waldman	8/2/2010	0.30
	Mtg. w/RMK re: Friday's Ct. hearing; p/c w/RMK, e-mails w/RF, AD re: briefing on appeal	
Shirley Joseph	8/2/2010	0.30
	Field class member calls	
Robert M. Kornreich	8/2/2010	0.20
	ow CBW re hearing last friday	
Robert M. Kornreich	8/2/2010	0.50
	R&R emails	
Chet B. Waldman	8/3/2010	0.20
	Rev'd. Charlotte Observer news article re: Friday's hearing	
Shirley Joseph	8/3/2010	0.10
	Field class member calls	
Shirley Joseph	8/4/2010	0.20
	Field class member calls	
Shirley Joseph	8/5/2010	0.10
	Field class member calls	
Chet B. Waldman	8/6/2010	0.20
	Rev'd. ltr./fed ex. pkg. sent by depts' counsel w/Amended Prop. Alternative Record on Appeal & Supplement	
Shirley Joseph	8/6/2010	0.40
	Field class member calls	
Chet B. Waldman	8/10/2010	0.20
	E-mails w/CD, rev'd. news report re: decision in Wachovia ERISA case	
Chet B. Waldman	8/11/2010	0.40
	Rev'd. Ct.'s Opinion denying objector's prop. record on appeal; e-mails w/CD re: obtaining Wachovia ERISA opinion which I rev'd.	
Chet B. Waldman	8/12/2010	0.30
	P/c w/A. Doerr, e-mails w/RF & AD re: next steps, appellants likely new motion & scheduling another call for tomorrow	
Chet B. Waldman	8/13/2010	0.30
	Conf. call w/depts' counsel re: lit. strategy, N.C. app. procedure	
Shirley Joseph	8/16/2010	0.10
	Field class member call	
Shirley Joseph	8/17/2010	0.20
	Field call from class member	
Shirley Joseph	8/23/2010	0.10
	Field class member call	
Shirley Joseph	8/24/2010	0.10
	Field call from class member	
Carl L. Stine	8/24/2010	0.80

**Matter**

<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Date Worked</b>	<b>Hours</b>
<b>1768 / 3253 Irving Ehrenhaus (40) / Ehrenhaus v. John D. Baker II, et al. (Wachovia)</b>		
Rev. draft stip.; emails re same & tel w/RMK re same		
Robert M. Kornreich	8/24/2010	0.20
tcw CLS re stip		
Carl L. Stine	8/25/2010	0.40
Tel w/defs' counsel re stip. & email to co-counsel re same		
Chet B. Waldman	8/31/2010	0.10
Rev'd. corr. from N. Robinson encl. record on appeal to Ct. of Appeals		
Chet B. Waldman	9/5/2010	0.20
Rev'd. case law relevant to appeal		
Shirley Joseph	9/7/2010	0.20
ltr to shareholder re status		
Chet B. Waldman	9/7/2010	0.30
E-mails w/defts' counsel, e-mails to RMK, CLS re: briefing schedule for appeal		
Shirley Joseph	9/14/2010	0.10
Field class member call		
Shirley Joseph	9/15/2010	0.20
Field class member calls		
Shirley Joseph	9/16/2010	0.10
Field class member calls		
Shirley Joseph	9/17/2010	0.20
Field class member calls		
Shirley Joseph	9/20/2010	0.10
Field calls from class members		
Shirley Joseph	9/21/2010	0.10
Field calls from class members		
Shirley Joseph	9/22/2010	0.10
Field calls from class members		
Shirley Joseph	9/23/2010	0.30
Field class member calls		
Shirley Joseph	9/24/2010	0.20
Field calls from class members		
Shirley Joseph	9/27/2010	0.20
Field calls from class members		
Shirley Joseph	9/28/2010	0.20
Field calls from class members		
Chet B. Waldman	10/4/2010	0.10
Brief mtg. w/CLS re: Appeal Brief		

**Matter**

<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Date Worked</b>	<b>Hours</b>
<b>1768 / 3253 Irving Ehrenhaus (40) / Ehrenhaus v. John D. Baker II, et al. (Wachovia)</b>		
Carl L. Stine Meet w/CBW re brief	10/4/2010	0.10
Chet B. Waldman Brief pc w/CLS re Appeal Brief	10/5/2010	0.10
Carl L. Stine Quick review of appeal brief; tel w/CBW re same	10/5/2010	0.50
Shirley Joseph Field class member calls	10/6/2010	0.10
Carl L. Stine Meet w/RMK re appeal brief	10/6/2010	0.50
Robert M. Kornreich R&R appellants brief; cw CLS	10/6/2010	3.00
Chet B. Waldman Rev'd. Objector's appeal brief; e-mails w/RF in this regard	10/7/2010	1.30
Shirley Joseph Field class member calls	10/7/2010	0.10
Chet B. Waldman Scheduled conf. call for Monday w/def's counsel	10/8/2010	0.10
Shirley Joseph Field class member calls	10/8/2010	0.20
Chet B. Waldman Mtg. w/RMK, CLS; conf. call w/RF, CLS, e-mails w/them re: responding to Appellants' opening brief; rev'd. portions of said brief in this connection	10/11/2010	1.40
Carl L. Stine Meet w/CBW & RMK re appeal; conf. call w/def's counsel re same	10/11/2010	1.00
Robert M. Kornreich cw CBW and CLS re appeal brief.	10/11/2010	0.70
Shirley Joseph Field class member calls	10/12/2010	0.20
Chet B. Waldman Began drafting "Facts" section of our Appellate Opp. Brief; rev'd. Ct.'s Feb. 5, 2010 Order, plif's briefs, Appellants' brief, e-mails from CLS, RF in this regard	10/12/2010	3.20
Carl L. Stine Meet w/RMK re call w/def's counsel & arguments for our brief; email w/CBW re same	10/12/2010	0.50
Robert M. Kornreich review appellants brief; cw CLS re appeal brief.	10/12/2010	2.00
Shirley Joseph Field class member calls	10/13/2010	0.20



**Matter**

<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Date Worked</b>	<b>Hours</b>
<b>1768 / 3253 Irving Ehrenhaus (40) / Ehrenhaus v. John D. Baker II, et al. (Wachovia)</b>		
Chet B. Waldman	10/13/2010	3.30
Cont'd. drafting facts section of our App. Opp. Brief; rev'd. Ct.'s PI motion & settlement approval opinions & other docs.; p/c w/RMK in this connection		
Robert M. Kornreich	10/13/2010	0.30
tcw CBW re brief		
Shirley Joseph	10/15/2010	0.20
Field calls from class members		
Chet B. Waldman	10/15/2010	0.10
E-mails w/RF re: defts' draft appellate brief		
Shirley Joseph	10/18/2010	0.40
Field lengthy call from class member		
Chet B. Waldman	10/18/2010	0.20
P/c w/SHA re: responding to Appellants' brief		
Sheryl H. Altwerger	10/18/2010	1.30
Review briefs in preparation for meeting with CBW, CLS re opposition to objectors brief tel with CBW re same		
Chet B. Waldman	10/19/2010	0.40
Mtg. w/SHA, CLS, p/c w/LLL, re: SHA's drafting section of brief in opp. to appeal		
Sheryl H. Altwerger	10/19/2010	1.30
Review briefs and settlement hearing transcript; meeting with CBW, CLS re drafting part of reply to objectors brief		
Carl L. Stine	10/19/2010	0.50
meet w/CBW and SA re SA assignments		
Chet B. Waldman	10/20/2010	0.10
Rev'd. e-mails w/CLS re: appellate brief		
Carl L. Stine	10/20/2010	2.20
begin reviewing materials to draft one part of appeal brief; emails to CBW re same		
Carl L. Stine	10/21/2010	3.40
research and draft brief section		
Shirley Joseph	10/22/2010	0.40
Field calls from class members		
Chet B. Waldman	10/22/2010	1.30
Rev'd. defts' draft brief in opp. to Objection		
Sheryl H. Altwerger	10/22/2010	9.50
Review pleadings, briefs settlement hearing transcripts; attn to research re reply to objectors brief.		
Carl L. Stine	10/22/2010	6.00
draft brief section, research for same		
Sheryl H. Altwerger	10/24/2010	3.50
Review pleadings, briefs settlement hearing transcripts; attn to research re reply to objectors brief.		
Chet B. Waldman	10/25/2010	0.90

**Matter**

<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Date Worked</b>	<b>Hours</b>
<b>1768 / 3253 Irving Ehrenhaus (40) / Ehrenhaus v. John D. Baker II, et al. (Wachovia)</b>		
Mtgs. w/CLS, SHA re: our appellate brief; rev'd. & edited latest draft of facts section; obtained & rev'd. relevant docs. in this connection		
Shirley Joseph	10/25/2010	0.40
Field class member calls		
Sheryl H. Altwerger	10/25/2010	10.50
review briefs, settlement hearing transcript, and pleadings in order to outline argument; research re argument; meeting with CBW re same		
Carl L. Stine	10/25/2010	3.00
draft brief section, meets w/CBW re whole brief, facts		
Shirley Joseph	10/26/2010	0.80
Legal research re appeal brief for SHA		
Shirley Joseph	10/26/2010	0.30
Field calls from class members		
Sheryl H. Altwerger	10/26/2010	12.00
Draft section of opposition to objectors brief research re same.		
Carl L. Stine	10/26/2010	2.80
draft section of appeal brief		
Chet B. Waldman	10/27/2010	1.80
Rev'd. & edited SHA section of pltf.-App. brief; mtgs. w/CLS, SHA in this connection		
Shirley Joseph	10/27/2010	0.30
Field calls from class members; prep ltr in response to inquiry of status of settlement		
Sheryl H. Altwerger	10/27/2010	12.00
Draft and revise section of a brief opposition objectors brief, attn to research re same; meeting with CBW re his edits		
Carl L. Stine	10/27/2010	3.80
research and draft brief section; meet w/CBW re same		
Chet B. Waldman	10/28/2010	2.20
Rev'd. & edited CLS draft section, & my fact section; rev'd. relevant background mat'ls. in this regard; e-mails w/CLS, SHA, SJ in this connection		
Sheryl H. Altwerger	10/28/2010	10.50
Revise brief opposing objectors' brief, research re same; review CBW edits		
Carl L. Stine	10/28/2010	0.50
send draft brief section to CBW and review his edits		
Chet B. Waldman	10/29/2010	3.80
Rev'd. & edited latest draft of Wachovia Opp. to Appeal brief; rev'd. relevant mat'ls. in this regard		
Shirley Joseph	10/29/2010	0.40
Field class member calls		
Shirley Joseph	11/1/2010	0.10
Field call from class member		
Chet B. Waldman	11/1/2010	2.70
Cont'd. rev'ing. & editing latest draft of pltf's Opp. to Appeal Brief; mtgs. w/CLS, conf. call w/CLS & depts' counsel in this regard		

**Matter**

<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Date Worked</b>	<b>Hours</b>
<b>1768 / 3253 Irving Ehrenhaus (40) / Ehrenhaus v. John D. Baker II, et al. (Wachovia)</b>		
Carl L. Stine	11/1/2010	0.80
	Meet w/CBW re brief status; rev. rules re brief requirements; conf call w/defts counsel	
Shirley Joseph	11/2/2010	5.00
	Work on record references to Plf Appellee's brief; disc w/CBW	
Chet B. Waldman	11/2/2010	2.30
	Rev'd. & edited latest draft of brief in opp. to Appeal; mtgs. w/CLS, SJ, rev'd. relevant docs., p/c, e-mails w/RMK re: above	
Carl L. Stine	11/2/2010	3.00
	Meet w/CBW re brief; tel w/CBW re discussion w/RMK; rev. rules & email local counsel re printing; rev. & revise draft brief	
Shirley Joseph	11/3/2010	7.60
	Work on record references to Plf Appellee's brief; disc w/CBW	
Chet B. Waldman	11/3/2010	3.90
	Cont'd. rev'ing. & editing latest draft of appeal brief; p/cs, e-mails w/CLS, RMK, SJ in this regard; e-mails w/defts' counsel, G. Jones re: finalizing brief, pro hac vice application	
Carl L. Stine	11/3/2010	1.00
	Rev. brief draft; meet w/RMK, tel w/CBW re same	
Robert M. Kornreich	11/3/2010	5.00
	Review draft appeal brief and revise same	
Robert M. Kornreich	11/3/2010	0.50
	tcw CBW re Org.; cw CLS re same	
Shirley Joseph	11/4/2010	6.10
	Work on appeal brief; disc w/CBW	
Chet B. Waldman	11/4/2010	4.80
	Cont'd. rev'ing. & editing latest draft of pltf's Appellate Brief; lengthy mtgs. w/CLS to go through record for cites; mtgs. w/SJ, p/cs w/RMK, defts' counsel, G. Jones in this regard; rev'd., edited & executed pro hac vice motion	
Carl L. Stine	11/4/2010	2.00
	Work w/CBW re revising appeal brief	
Robert M. Kornreich	11/4/2010	3.00
	Work on appeal brief; tcw CBW	
Shirley Joseph	11/5/2010	1.50
	Finalize TOA to brief; disc w/CBW	
Chet B. Waldman	11/5/2010	3.40
	Rev'd., edited & finalized latest drafts of the brief; mtgs. w/CLS, SJ; p/cs, e-mails w/defts' counsel. e-mails to GJ in this regard	
Carl L. Stine	11/5/2010	0.20
	Meet w/CBW re brief status	
Robert M. Kornreich	11/5/2010	2.80
	work on appeal brief	
Chet B. Waldman	11/8/2010	0.40
	E-mails w/G. Jones' office, defts. re: filing of our briefs in opp. to appeal; mtg. w/RMK, CLS in this regard	

**Matter**

<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Date Worked</b>	<b>Hours</b>
<b>1768 / 3253 Irving Ehrenhaus (40) / Ehrenhaus v. John D. Baker II, et al. (Wachovia)</b>		
Shirley Joseph Field calls from class members	11/8/2010	0.70
Carl L. Stine Mtgs. w/RMK, CBW re brief	11/8/2010	0.40
Robert M. Kornreich Review case; cw CLS re brief	11/8/2010	0.50
Robert M. Kornreich edit appeal brief; cw CLS and CBW	11/8/2010	1.00
Chet B. Waldman E-mails w/G. Jones' office, RMK, CLS, depts' counsel re: service of our brief in opp. to Appeal	11/9/2010	0.30
Shirley Joseph Ltr to class member re status	11/9/2010	0.30
Shirley Joseph Field calls, etc. from class members	11/16/2010	0.20
Chet B. Waldman Rev'd. appellate court's granting my pro hac vice application	11/17/2010	0.10
Shirley Joseph Field class member calls; disc calls during Thanksgiving	11/18/2010	2.30
Chet B. Waldman Rev'd. news of Wells Fargo/Citigroup settlement over Wachovia sale	11/19/2010	0.20
Chet B. Waldman Received Objectors' Reply Brief; e-mails from depts' counsel re: moving to strike; p/c w/RMK in this regard	11/23/2010	0.20
Robert M. Kornreich tcw CBW re M/strike	11/23/2010	0.10
Chet B. Waldman P/c w/RMK re: responding to Reply Brief of Appellant	11/24/2010	0.10
Robert M. Kornreich R&R Reply from and cw CBW re same.	11/24/2010	1.00
Chet B. Waldman Rev'd. depts' Brief in Opp. to Objector's filing Reply Brief; rev'd. draft of pltf's brief in opp. to same; mtg. w/CLS in this regard	11/29/2010	0.40
Carl L. Stine Rev. Objector reply briefs; emails re same; meet w/CBW re same; draft motion to strike	11/29/2010	2.20
Carl L. Stine Revise & finalize motion to strike; emails, mtg w/CBW re same	11/30/2010	0.80
Chet B. Waldman Mtgs., e-mails w/CLS re: finalizing motion opposing objector's reply brief	11/30/2010	0.30

**Matter**

<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Date Worked</b>	<b>Hours</b>
<b>1768 / 3253 Irving Ehrenhaus (40) / Ehrenhaus v. John D. Baker II, et al. (Wachovia)</b>		
Chet B. Waldman	12/1/2010	0.10
Rev'd. e-mails b/n CLS & RF re: expected scheduling of Appellate argument		
Carl L. Stine	12/6/2010	0.50
Rev. Objector's response to Motion to Strike; mtg. w/RMK re same		
Robert M. Kornreich	12/6/2010	1.00
R&R reply		
Robert M. Kornreich	12/6/2010	0.20
cw CLS re same.		
Chet B. Waldman	12/7/2010	0.40
Rev'd. objector's brief in supp. of their right to file a reply brief		
Chet B. Waldman	12/8/2010	0.20
Rev'd. Appellate Court Order sending Appellants' reply brief request to judicial Panel; emails w/defts' counsel in this regard		
Robert M. Kornreich	12/8/2010	0.10
R&R order re: reply brief.		
Shirley Joseph	12/9/2010	0.20
Field class member calls		
Shirley Joseph	12/10/2010	0.30
Field class member calls		
Shirley Joseph	12/13/2010	0.30
Field class member calls		
Shirley Joseph	12/14/2010	0.20
Field class member calls		
Shirley Joseph	1/6/2011	0.50
Field class member calls re settlement		
Chet B. Waldman	1/7/2011	0.20
Began prep. stmt. needed for my N.C. appellate pro hac vice application		
Chet B. Waldman	1/10/2011	0.20
Filled out requested form from pro hac vice app.; mtg. w/RMK in this regard		
Robert M. Kornreich	1/10/2011	0.10
cw CBW re: pro hac vice app		
Chet B. Waldman	1/12/2011	0.40
Rev'd. news of Ct. setting oral argument date; p/cs w/RF, RMK, CLS, rev'd. Ct. notice in this regard		
Carl L. Stine	1/12/2011	0.10
Tel w/CBW re hearing		
Robert M. Kornreich	1/12/2011	0.80
R&R email fr. Clark		
Robert M. Kornreich	1/12/2011	0.30

**Matter**

<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Date Worked</b>	<b>Hours</b>
<b>1768 / 3253 Irving Ehrenhaus (40) / Ehrenhaus v. John D. Baker II, et al. (Wachovia)</b>		
tcw CBW re appeal hearing		
Chet B. Waldman	1/13/2011	0.10
Emails w/G. Jones re: appellate argument & my pro hac vice application		
Chet B. Waldman	1/14/2011	0.10
Email from G. Jones showing my pro hac vice app. has been filed		
Matthew Insley-Pruitt	1/18/2011	0.50
Researching point of law for appeal; conf w/CBW re same		
Chet B. Waldman	1/18/2011	5.30
Began to prep. for appellate argument; rev'd. Appellant's prop. reply briefs, our appellate brief, relevant statute and legal rsch.; p/c w/RMK, mtgs. w/CLS, MIP, began drafting outline in this regard		
Carl L. Stine	1/18/2011	0.50
Mtg w/CBW re prep for appeal argument		
Robert M. Kornreich	1/18/2011	0.10
cw CBW re hearing		
Shirley Joseph	1/19/2011	0.20
Respond to Barbara Johnson ltr re status of action		
Chet B. Waldman	1/19/2011	2.40
Rev'd., edited & drafted early version of Appellate argument outline; rev'd. relevant N.C. statute, MIP memo in this regard		
Chet B. Waldman	1/20/2011	0.70
Rev'd. & edited argument outline; p/c w/A. Doerr, emails w/RF re: Appellate Argument		
Chet B. Waldman	1/21/2011	2.80
Cont'd. prep. for appellate argument; edited & drafted portions of outline, rev'd. relevant briefs, emails w/AD in this connection		
Chet B. Waldman	1/24/2011	0.50
Conf. call w/RF, AD, mtgs. w/RMK re: appellate oral argument		
Robert M. Kornreich	1/24/2011	0.30
cw CBW re appeal argument		
Robert M. Kornreich	1/24/2011	1.70
Review briefs		
Chet B. Waldman	1/25/2011	1.40
Cont'd. editing & prep. argument outline		
Shirley Joseph	1/25/2011	0.30
Field calls, respond to email inquires		
Shirley Joseph	1/26/2011	0.80
Field calls, respond to email inquires		
Chet B. Waldman	1/26/2011	1.40
Cont'd. rev'ing., editing & drafting argument outline		
Chet B. Waldman	1/27/2011	0.80
Cont'd. prep. for upcoming appellate argument; edited outline, practiced it, in this regard		

**Matter**

<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Date Worked</b>	<b>Hours</b>
<b>1768 / 3253 Irving Ehrenhaus (40) / Ehrenhaus v. John D. Baker II, et al. (Wachovia)</b>		
Chet B. Waldman	1/28/2011	0.30
Gathered mat'ls. for oral argument prep.		
Chet B. Waldman	1/29/2011	2.90
Cont'd. prep. for appeal; rev'd. portions of relevant brief, drafted & edited argument outline, practiced presentation in this regard		
Carl L. Stine	1/31/2011	0.50
Meet w/CBW re argument		
Chet B. Waldman	1/31/2011	2.70
Cont'd. prep. for Appellate Argument; mtgs. w/CLS, rev'd. record documents, edited outline, rev'd. Ct. opinions in this regard		
Chet B. Waldman	2/1/2011	1.40
Cont'd. prep. for next week's oral argument on Appeal; edited outline, did some case rsch. & gathered relevant docs.		
Shirley Joseph	2/2/2011	0.20
Respond to ltr inquiry		
Matthew Insley-Pruitt	2/2/2011	1.20
Researching issues for oral argument.		
Chet B. Waldman	2/2/2011	3.40
Cont'd. prep. for next week's Appellate argument; rev'd. & edited outline, rev'd. case law, Ct. orders, briefs, email to depts' counsel in this regard		
Chet B. Waldman	2/3/2011	1.60
Cont'd. prep. for Appellate argument; edited outline, ran through presentation, rev'd. relevant case law in this connection; p/c w/RMK re: argument		
Robert M. Kornreich	2/3/2011	0.20
tcw CBW re argument		
Chet B. Waldman	2/4/2011	1.80
Cont'd. prep. for appellate argument; gathered record docs., rev'd. relevant case law, edited outline, emails w/depts' counsel in this regard		
Shirley Joseph	2/4/2011	0.50
field class member calls		
Chet B. Waldman	2/5/2011	5.60
Cont'd. prep. for upcoming appellate argument; rev'd. relevant case law, docs. from record, emails, edited outline & went thru presentation in this connection; emails w/MIP re: certain cases I needed		
Matthew Insley-Pruitt	2/7/2011	0.20
Tel call w/CBW re upcoming argument		
Chet B. Waldman	2/7/2011	2.70
continued preparing for Appellate Argument, reviewed relevant briefs, evidence, case law, edited presentation outline, ran through presentation, conf call w/ RF, AD, p/cs w/CLS, MIP, RMK, emails w/GJ in this regard		
Shirley Joseph	2/7/2011	0.50
field class member calls		
Carl L. Stine	2/7/2011	0.10
Tel w/CBW re argument		
Robert M. Kornreich	2/7/2011	0.10
cw CBW re status		

**Matter**

<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Date Worked</b>	<b>Hours</b>
<b>1768 / 3253 Irving Ehrenhaus (40) / Ehrenhaus v. John D. Baker II, et al. (Wachovia)</b>		
Chet B. Waldman	2/8/2011	8.90
continued preparing for tomorrow's appellate argument. Reviewed relevant briefs, practiced presentation, reviewed relevant Ct opinions, settlement hearing transcript, travelled from NY to Raleigh, NC, dinner mtg w/Ds counsel in this regard		
Shirley Joseph	2/8/2011	0.50
field class member calls		
Chet B. Waldman	2/9/2011	8.20
prepared for and then conducted appellate argument, mtg with GJ, Ds counsel, p/c w/RMK, travelled from Raleigh, NC to NY in this connection		
Shirley Joseph	2/9/2011	0.50
field class member calls		
Robert M. Kornreich	2/9/2011	0.50
TC CBW re arg		
Chet B. Waldman	2/10/2011	0.40
p/cs w/RMK, mtg w/CLS reviewed news article re: yesterday's oral arguement		
Carl L. Stine	2/10/2011	0.20
Meet w/CBW re article		
Robert M. Kornreich	2/10/2011	0.10
tcw CBW re status		
Shirley Joseph	2/11/2011	0.50
field class member calls		
Shirley Joseph	2/16/2011	0.50
field class member calls		
Shirley Joseph	2/17/2011	0.50
field class member calls		
Shirley Joseph	2/18/2011	0.50
field class member calls		
Shirley Joseph	3/1/2011	0.20
Field call from class member		
Shirley Joseph	3/10/2011	0.30
Field calls from class members		
Shirley Joseph	3/11/2011	0.30
Field calls from class members		
Shirley Joseph	3/15/2011	0.20
Field calls from class members		
Chet B. Waldman	3/15/2011	0.10
Emails w/G. Jones re: status update		
Shirley Joseph	3/22/2011	0.20
Field calls from class members		



**Matter**

<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Date Worked</b>	<b>Hours</b>
<b>1768 / 3253 Irving Ehrenhaus (40) / Ehrenhaus v. John D. Baker II, et al. (Wachovia)</b>		
Shirley Joseph Field calls from class members	3/23/2011	0.10
Chet B. Waldman Rec'd. supplemental authority submission by Objector; mtgs. w/, emails to, RMK, CLS; emails w/RF, AD re: whether to respond to same	3/28/2011	0.40
Carl L. Stine Meet CBW re obj supp submission	3/28/2011	0.10
Robert M. Kornreich R&R email re submission by appellant, cw CBW re same.	3/28/2011	0.50
Shirley Joseph Field calls from class members	3/29/2011	0.30
Shirley Joseph Field calls from class members	3/30/2011	0.20
Shirley Joseph Field calls from class members	3/31/2011	0.30
Shirley Joseph Field calls from class members	4/1/2011	0.30
Chet B. Waldman Rev'd. news of objector's other case being dismissed	4/4/2011	0.10
Shirley Joseph Field class member calls	4/4/2011	0.20
Shirley Joseph Field calls from class members	4/5/2011	0.30
Shirley Joseph Field calls from class members; fax settlement stip & final judgement to class member Morton Deets	4/7/2011	0.30
Shirley Joseph Field calls from class members	4/8/2011	0.30
Shirley Joseph Filed calls from class members	4/11/2011	0.30
Shirley Joseph Field class member calls; draft response ltr to class member	4/12/2011	0.50
Shirley Joseph Field calls from class members	4/13/2011	0.30
Shirley Joseph Field class member calls; draft response ltr to class member; respond to email inquiry re settlement	4/19/2011	0.50
Shirley Joseph Field calss member call	4/22/2011	0.10
Shirley Joseph	4/25/2011	0.10

Matter	Timekeeper	Date Worked	Hours
1768 / 3253	Irving Ehrenhaus (40) / Ehrenhaus v. John D. Baker II, et al. (Wachovia)		
	Respond to class member inquiry		
	Shirley Joseph Field call from class member	4/26/2011	0.20
	Shirley Joseph Field call from class member	4/27/2011	0.10
	Chet B. Waldman Emails w/defits' counsel; mtg.w/RMK re: status of appeal	4/28/2011	0.20
	Robert M. Kornreich cw CBW re status	4/28/2011	0.10
	Shirley Joseph Field class member call	5/5/2011	0.30
	Shirley Joseph Respond to email inquiry re settlement	5/6/2011	0.20
	Shirley Joseph Field class member call	5/10/2011	0.10
	Shirley Joseph Field class member call	5/10/2011	0.20
	Shirley Joseph Respond to email inquiry re settlement	5/11/2011	0.10
	Shirley Joseph Respond to email inquiry re settlement	5/18/2011	0.10
	Shirley Joseph Respond to email inquiry re settlement	5/19/2011	0.30
	Shirley Joseph Respond to email inquiry	5/23/2011	0.20
	Shirley Joseph Field class member call; respond to email inquiry re settlement	5/24/2011	0.20
	Shirley Joseph Field class member call	5/25/2011	0.30
	Shirley Joseph Field class member call	5/26/2011	0.10
	Shirley Joseph Field call from class member	6/1/2011	0.10
	Shirley Joseph Tcw/Egon Kahn (847.433.5332) re status of settlement	6/3/2011	0.20
	Shirley Joseph Field class member call	6/7/2011	0.10

**Matter**

<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Date Worked</b>	<b>Hours</b>
<b>1768 / 3253 Irving Ehrenhaus (40) / Ehrenhaus v. John D. Baker II, et al. (Wachovia)</b>		
Shirley Joseph Field class member call	6/8/2011	0.10
Shirley Joseph Field call from class member	6/9/2011	0.70
Shirley Joseph Field call from class member	6/10/2011	0.20
Shirley Joseph Field call from class member	6/15/2011	0.20
Shirley Joseph field class member call	6/29/2011	0.10
Chet B. Waldman Emails w/defts' counsel, mtg. w/LLL, emails to RMK, CLS re: update	7/5/2011	0.30
Carl L. Stine Email CBW re meet w/defts' counsel	7/5/2011	0.10
Robert M. Kornreich rev CBW email	7/5/2011	0.10
Chet B. Waldman Emails w/RMK, defts' counsel, p/c w/LLL re: appellate court recent actions for intelligence on when a ruling on our case may come about	7/6/2011	0.30
Shirley Joseph Field call from class member	7/8/2011	0.20
Shirley Joseph Tcw Matthew Mcmanus Fidelity re inquiry for client re status of case; emailed add'l info re same ('matthew.mcmanus@fidelity.com')	7/12/2011	0.10
Shirley Joseph Field call from class member; respond to email inquiry re settlement	7/22/2011	0.30
Shirley Joseph Field class member call	8/5/2011	0.20
Chet B. Waldman Rev'd. news of settlement of Fed. class action	8/8/2011	0.20
Shirley Joseph Respond to email inquiries re settlement	8/9/2011	0.40
Shirley Joseph Field call from class member	8/17/2011	0.20
Chet B. Waldman Emails w/defts' counsel to RMK re: status of appeal	8/31/2011	0.20
Robert M. Kornreich Emails CBW re dfts' counsel	8/31/2011	0.10

**Matter**

<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Date Worked</b>	<b>Hours</b>
<b>1768 / 3253 Irving Ehrenhaus (40) / Ehrenhaus v. John D. Baker II, et al. (Wachovia)</b>		
Chet B. Waldman	9/1/2011	0.20
mtg w/CLS, emails from Lawyer re potential claim against Wachovia Ds		
Carl L. Stine	9/1/2011	0.10
Meet w/CBW re pot claim against WB defts		
Shirley Joseph	9/13/2011	0.20
Field class member call		
Shirley Joseph	9/14/2011	0.20
Prep ltr in response to ltr inquiry re settlement		
Shirley Joseph	9/20/2011	0.20
Field class member call		
Shirley Joseph	9/23/2011	0.20
Field calls from class members		
Shirley Joseph	9/27/2011	0.30
Field call from class member		
Shirley Joseph	9/28/2011	0.30
Field class member calls		
Shirley Joseph	9/30/2011	0.10
Field class member calls		
Shirley Joseph	10/3/2011	0.20
Field class member calls		
Chet B. Waldman	10/4/2011	0.60
Rev'd. portions of App. Ct.'s Op. (on my iphone); emails w/CLS, RMK, LLL from defts' counsel, G. Jones; p/cs w/RMK, CLS in this connection		
Carl L. Stine	10/4/2011	5.00
Read appellate decision; email & tels w/G. Jones, CBW & RMK re same; rev. Stip. settlement papers, lower Court's decision; tel w/RMK & CBW re same		
Robert M. Kornreich	10/4/2011	0.20
Tcs emails CBW, CLS		
Shirley Joseph	10/5/2011	0.50
Prep rpt for CLS		
Chet B. Waldman	10/5/2011	0.60
Participated in conf. call w/RMK, CLS, RF re: next steps, N.C. procedure, lit. strategy		
Carl L. Stine	10/5/2011	2.60
Rsch. re renewed fee application; conf. call w/R. Fuller, CBW, RMK re process; meet w/RMK re strategy		
Robert M. Kornreich	10/5/2011	3.00
Review opinion of C of H and read cases cited; conf call CBW, CLS, RF; cw CLS		
Shirley Joseph	10/6/2011	4.60
Rev time records		
Carl L. Stine	10/6/2011	0.30

**Matter**

<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Date Worked</b>	<b>Hours</b>
<b>1768 / 3253 Irving Ehrenhaus (40) / Ehrenhaus v. John D. Baker II, et al. (Wachovia)</b>		
	Tel w/client re status of case & appeal decision	
Shirley Joseph	10/7/2011	5.60
	Rev time records; conf w/CBW	
Chet B. Waldman	10/7/2011	0.30
	Mtgs. w/LLL, MIP, p/c w/SJ re: new fee application & App. Ct.'s decision	
Shirley Joseph	10/10/2011	0.10
	Field class member call	
Shirley Joseph	10/10/2011	5.50
	Rev time records	
Carl L. Stine	10/10/2011	1.20
	Tel w/RMK re assigning an associate & argument; begin blocking out brief; meet w/RMK re time records	
Robert M. Kornreich	10/10/2011	0.80
	csw CLS re fee papers, strategies	
Chet B. Waldman	10/11/2011	1.40
	Rev'd. App. Ct.'s Op. on settlement & fee; mtgs. w/CLS re: papers in support of Fee App. to be submitted & strategy relating thereto	
Shirley Joseph	10/11/2011	6.50
	Rev time records	
Carl L. Stine	10/11/2011	0.70
	Meets w/CBW re decision & motion re fees	
Shirley Joseph	10/12/2011	6.00
	Rev time records	
Shirley Joseph	10/12/2011	0.20
	Field class member calls	
Chet B. Waldman	10/13/2011	0.40
	Did factual rsch. for relevant info. which we may submit in connection w/renewed fee application; mtg. w/CLS in this regard	
Shirley Joseph	10/13/2011	6.00
	Rev time records	
Shirley Joseph	10/13/2011	0.10
	Filed class member call	
Robert S. Plosky	10/13/2011	3.90
	Discussing case and assignment w/Carl; discuss same w/RMK; downloading case docs. & beginning to review them & familiarize myself w/case; beginning rsch. on "vacated" decision issue	
Carl L. Stine	10/13/2011	0.50
	Meet w/R. Plosky re case & assignments; tel re same; meet CBW re same	
Robert M. Kornreich	10/13/2011	0.50
	cw R. Plosky re research	
Chet B. Waldman	10/17/2011	0.10

**Matter**

<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Date Worked</b>	<b>Hours</b>
<b>1768 / 3253 Irving Ehrenhaus (40) / Ehrenhaus v. John D. Baker II, et al. (Wachovia)</b>		
	Mtg. w/LLL re: fee app. preparation	
Shirley Joseph	10/18/2011	3.50
	Cont. rev of time records	
Shirley Joseph	10/18/2011	0.10
	Field class member call	
Robert S. Plosky	10/18/2011	4.50
	Reviewing all case docs, appellate and lower court decision, stipulations entered, our lower court brief, transcript of argument in lower court	
Shirley Joseph	10/19/2011	0.10
	Field class member call	
Chet B. Waldman	10/19/2011	0.10
	Rev'd. emails from CLS re: lit. strategy	
Robert S. Plosky	10/19/2011	4.50
	Researching and reviewing cases about contractually agreed-to settlement agreements and courts approving them without alteration; researching and reviewing cases about the effect of vacated decisions	
Robert M. Kornreich	10/19/2011	0.50
	cw CLS re mandate.	
Carl L. Stine	10/19/2011	5.20
	Rev. revised business court rules; rsch. & draft renewed fee motion; meet w/R. Plosky re rsch. issues; meet RMK re mandate; emails to CBW re same	
Shirley Joseph	10/20/2011	1.50
	Rev time records, field class member call	
Robert S. Plosky	10/20/2011	0.50
	Discuss w/CLS re rescheduling issues	
Carl L. Stine	10/20/2011	0.50
	Meet w/R. Plosky re rsch. issues	
Carl L. Stine	10/21/2011	1.50
	Draft renewed fee motion	
Shirley Joseph	10/24/2011	0.10
	Field class member calls	
Shirley Joseph	10/24/2011	3.00
	Rev time records	
Carl L. Stine	10/24/2011	0.30
	Emails re mandate issuing & timing	
Shirley Joseph	10/25/2011	3.00
	Rev time records	
Shirley Joseph	10/25/2011	0.20
	Field class member calls	
Chet B. Waldman	10/25/2011	0.10
	Rev'd. CLS email re: docket sheet check; brief mtg. w/RMK in this regard	

**Matter**

<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Date Worked</b>	<b>Hours</b>
<b>1768 / 3253 Irving Ehrenhaus (40) / Ehrenhaus v. John D. Baker II, et al. (Wachovia)</b>		
Robert S. Plosky	10/25/2011	1.50
Drafting short section of law for upcoming brief dealing with the consequence of a "vacated judgment" and showing/discussing w/CLS		
Carl L. Stine	10/25/2011	3.50
Draft fee brief; rsch.; meet RP re vacate dec. research		
Chet B. Waldman	10/26/2011	0.20
Rev'd. emails from CLS, AD re: issuance of the Mandate by the Ct.		
Robert M. Kornreich	10/26/2011	0.50
CW CLS re mandate.		
Carl L. Stine	10/26/2011	1.20
Draft fee brief; meet w/RMK re mandate; email CBW re same		
Shirley Joseph	10/26/2011	0.50
Prep rpt for CLS		
Carl L. Stine	10/27/2011	6.30
Draft renewed fee brief, rsch. for same		
Chet B. Waldman	10/28/2011	0.10
Rev'd. CLS email re: local counsel fee issue		
Carl L. Stine	10/28/2011	4.00
Draft renewed fee brief; email CBW re same		
Chet B. Waldman	10/31/2011	0.10
Mtg. w/RMK re: appeal deadline; mtg w/CBW re same		
Robert M. Kornreich	10/31/2011	0.50
CW CBW re appeal.		
Carl L. Stine	10/31/2011	7.00
Draft fee motion; meet w/CBW re same		
Chet B. Waldman	11/1/2011	0.60
Mtg. w/CLS re: renewed fee application, potential exhibits thereto & strategy		
Robert M. Kornreich	11/1/2011	0.50
CW CLS re fee application		
Shirley Joseph	11/1/2011	0.50
Edit chart for CLS		
Robert S. Plosky	11/1/2011	4.80
Researching for Carl the ethical rules for attorneys in North Carolina and New York. tel call w/CLS re same, and also researching Lodestar rates cases		
Carl L. Stine	11/1/2011	2.10
Meets w/CBW, RMK re fee application; draft same; tel w/Rob P. re status of assignments & new assignments		
Chet B. Waldman	11/2/2011	0.40
Rev'd. relevant case law; p/c w/CLS re: new fee app.		

**Matter**

<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Date Worked</b>	<b>Hours</b>
<b>1768 / 3253 Irving Ehrenhaus (40) / Ehrenhaus v. John D. Baker II, et al. (Wachovia)</b>		
Robert S. Plosky	11/2/2011	1.50
Researching hourly atty's fees cases		
Carl L. Stine	11/2/2011	2.10
Draft fee brief; tel w/CBW re same		
Chet B. Waldman	11/3/2011	0.20
Emails w/CLS re: fee app. & relevant docs. to be submitted		
Robert S. Plosky	11/3/2011	4.00
Researching fee issues, including the meaning of "fee customary charged in the locality" in Rule 1.5 of Professional Responsibility and typical hourly rates of NC counsel, including Robinson, Bradshaw & Hinson; searching cases on Lexis, and Bankruptcy cases on PACER and filings on NC Business Court dockets		
Carl L. Stine	11/3/2011	3.30
Rsch. for brief; tel w/Rob P. re rsch; tel w/RMK re same; draft same		
Robert M. Kornreich	11/3/2011	0.50
TCs CLS re his email re fee application		
Shirley Joseph	11/4/2011	0.20
Field class member calls		
Chet B. Waldman	11/4/2011	0.40
Rev'd. relevant case news; p/cs w/CLS in this connection & re: fee application		
Robert S. Plosky	11/4/2011	2.60
Reviewing cases regarding meaning of "fee customary charged in the locality" and putting together section for Carl, and putting together section on customary NC attorney's fees from bankruptcy fee applications		
Carl L. Stine	11/4/2011	5.00
Rsch. for brief & draft same; tel w/CBW re same		
Chet B. Waldman	11/7/2011	0.50
Mtg. w/CLS rev'd. decision dismissing Objector's litigation, re: fee app.		
Shirley Joseph	11/7/2011	0.10
Field class member call; email info re 10b5 litig suit		
Robert S. Plosky	11/7/2011	1.60
Putting together law firm fee research for Carl, pulling data from National Law Journal reports on NC fees since 2008 and from bankruptcy court fee petitions		
Robert M. Kornreich	11/7/2011	1.00
Read dec. re dismissal of obj. and cw CLS re same.		
Carl L. Stine	11/7/2011	6.00
Rsch. & draft fee brief; rev. dismissal of objector's neg misrep case; send to RMK & CBW; meets w/CBW, RMK re same		
Chet B. Waldman	11/8/2011	1.40
Rev'd. Norwood's appeal to Supreme Ct.; rev'd. his brief summary, mtgs. w/CLS, emails w/defts' counsel, CLS in this connection		
Carl L. Stine	11/8/2011	6.80
Rsch. & draft fee brief; emails re objector appeal; rev. & meets & tels re same; rsch. re NC Supreme Ct. rules; emails re same; outline possible argument; rev. objector appeal papers & emails mtgs CBW re same		
Chet B. Waldman	11/9/2011	2.30
Participated in conf. call w/RMK, CLS, AD, RF; subsequent mtgs. w/CLS, gathered relevant mat'ls. in connection w/responding to Objector's requested appeal to N.C. Sup. Ct.		



**Matter**

<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Date Worked</b>	<b>Hours</b>
<b>1768 / 3253 Irving Ehrenhaus (40) / Ehrenhaus v. John D. Baker II, et al. (Wachovia)</b>		
Robert M. Kornreich R&R appeal and petition; cw CLS and CBW	11/9/2011	2.00
Carl L. Stine Set up call w/def's counsel; meets & emails re same; attend call; meet w/CBW, RMK re same	11/9/2011	1.50
Robert M. Kornreich Tcw Fuller, Doern, CBW, CLS	11/9/2011	0.60
Chet B. Waldman Began drafting fact & prelim. stmt. sections of Pltf's Response to Objectors-Appellants' Petition to Appeal to N.C. Sup. Ct.; p/cs w/CLS, rev'd. relevant briefs, emails, case law in this connection	11/10/2011	3.40
Robert S. Plosky Researching the relationship of class counsel to individuals in the class vs. class as a whole; discus w/CLS	11/10/2011	4.50
Carl L. Stine Tels w/CBW, RMK re response; tels w/Rob P. re rsch.; draft argument section of response	11/10/2011	3.30
Robert M. Kornreich cw CLS	11/10/2011	0.50
Robert M. Kornreich Work on response to Ct	11/10/2011	2.50
Robert S. Plosky Continuing to research relationship of class counsel to individuals in the class vs. class as a whole, and drafting paragraph for Carl with case authority	11/11/2011	2.50
Chet B. Waldman Cont'd. rev'ing. & editing drafts of Prelim. Stmt. & fact sections of Response to Appeal Petition; also rev'd. N.C. law review article on constitutional rationale for review by N.C. Sup. Ct. sent by AD & emails from him & RF in this regard	11/11/2011	2.20
Robert M. Kornreich Email, work on response to Pet.	11/11/2011	3.00
Chet B. Waldman Mtg. w/CLS, RMK re: response to Objectors' petition to appeal to N.C. Sup. Ct.	11/14/2011	0.50
Robert M. Kornreich cw CLS and CBW	11/14/2011	0.60
Carl L. Stine Rev. & edit CBW's section; draft my sections; meet CBW, RMK re same	11/14/2011	6.60
Chet B. Waldman Rev'd. & edited latest drafts of Response to Objector's Petition to Appeal to N.C. Sup. Ct.; p/cs, emails w/CLS, RMK, defts' counsel re: scheduling a call for tomorrow to discuss	11/15/2011	2.30
Robert M. Kornreich Email, cw CBW re response to PDR	11/15/2011	0.50
Robert M. Kornreich Edit Response; cw CLS re same.	11/15/2011	2.50
Carl L. Stine Revise brief & send to CBW; rev. his edits; meet w/RMK; give RMK draft	11/15/2011	2.20

**Matter**

<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Date Worked</b>	<b>Hours</b>
<b>1768 / 3253 Irving Ehrenhaus (40) / Ehrenhaus v. John D. Baker II, et al. (Wachovia)</b>		
Chet B. Waldman	11/16/2011	1.20
Participated in conf. call w/RMK, CLS, RF, AD; mtgs. w/CLS, RMK, rev'd. RF emails in connection w/finalizing & modifying response to Objectors' Petition to the N.C. Sup. Ct.		
Robert M. Kornreich	11/16/2011	4.10
Review/revise response; cw Co-Counsel; cw CBW and CLS re same; tcw Fuller, Doern w/CBW and CLS re response		
Carl L. Stine	11/16/2011	2.50
Revise & circulate draft brief; tel conf w/RMK, CBW, Fuller, AD; meet RMK, CBW re same		
Chet B. Waldman	11/17/2011	4.60
Rev'd., edited & drafted portions of plf's. & defts' Responses to Objectors' Petition to N.C. Sup. Ct.; mtgs. w/CLS, SJ, p/cs w/RMK, emails w/defts' counsel, rev'd. relevant case law in this connection		
Shirley Joseph	11/17/2011	6.00
Citecheck, shep, quotecheck, etc appeal reply brief for CBW; prep TOA to same		
Robert M. Kornreich	11/17/2011	0.60
tcw Fuller, Doern w/CBW and CLS re response		
Carl L. Stine	11/17/2011	0.20
Emails w/local counsel re filing papers; meet CBW re same		
Chet B. Waldman	11/18/2011	3.10
Rev'd., edited & finalized Response to Objectors' Petition to Appeal to N.C. Sup. Ct. (filed today); numerous p/cs, emails w/RMK, CLS, AD, emails w/S. Chase in this regard		
Robert M. Kornreich	11/18/2011	2.50
Edit/revision of Response; tcw CBW re same; email CBW		
Carl L. Stine	11/18/2011	5.80
Tels, email w/CBW; rev. & edit draft response		
Shirley Joseph	11/29/2011	0.50
Field class member calls		
Chet B. Waldman	12/2/2011	0.20
Emails w/A. Doerr, to CLS, RMK re: recent N.C. fee decision		
Chet B. Waldman	12/5/2011	0.10
Rev'd. news of settlement of securities fraud case		
Shirley Joseph	12/29/2011	0.10
Field class member call; email info re same		
Shirley Joseph	1/3/2012	0.10
Field class member call		
Shirley Joseph	1/6/2012	0.20
Field class member call		
Chet B. Waldman	1/17/2012	0.50
Emails w/Ct. seeking to schedule conf. call re: status; mtgs. w/RMK, CLS, emails w/RF in this regard		
Shirley Joseph	1/17/2012	0.20
Field class member call via email response		

**Matter**

<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Date Worked</b>	<b>Hours</b>
<b>1768 / 3253 Irving Ehrenhaus (40) / Ehrenhaus v. John D. Baker II, et al. (Wachovia)</b>		
Carl L. Stine	1/17/2012	0.80
Email from Ct.; meet w/CBW re same; email to defts' counsel & emails re same; meet w/RMK re fee application		
Robert M. Kornreich	1/17/2012	0.40
Emails re PTC, cw CBW		
Robert M. Kornreich	1/17/2012	0.30
cw CLS re fee app		
Shirley Joseph	1/24/2012	0.10
Responded to email inquiry by class member re settlement		
Shirley Joseph	1/25/2012	0.10
Field class member call; email info re same		
Chet B. Waldman	1/27/2012	0.30
Emails w/A. Doerr, CLS, RMK re: N.C. Sup. Ct.'s not reviewing our case yet & related questions		
Shirley Joseph	2/1/2012	0.10
Field class member call		
Chet B. Waldman	2/10/2012	0.20
Rev'd. filing by R. Fuller; email, p/c w/CLS in this regard		
Carl L. Stine	2/10/2012	0.10
Tel w/CBW, email re filing		
Chet B. Waldman	2/14/2012	0.30
Mtg. w/CLS re: upcoming revised fee application		
Carl L. Stine	2/14/2012	0.30
Mtg. w/CBW re status		
Shirley Joseph	2/15/2012	0.20
Field class member call		
Shirley Joseph	2/17/2012	0.20
Tcw/class member		
Shirley Joseph	3/2/2012	0.10
Field class member calls		
Shirley Joseph	3/8/2012	1.00
Field calls from class members re Wachovia Equity case		
Chet B. Waldman	3/9/2012	0.10
Email from A. Drerr re: fact that our case was not one of newly issued petition rulings by N.C. Sup. Ct.		
Chet B. Waldman	3/12/2012	0.30
Mtg. w/CLS, emails to CLS, RMK re: Sup. Ct.'s not yet rev'ing. appeal petition		
Carl L. Stine	3/12/2012	0.30
Mtg. w/CBW, RMK re appeal		

**Matter**

<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Date Worked</b>	<b>Hours</b>
<b>1768 / 3253 Irving Ehrenhaus (40) / Ehrenhaus v. John D. Baker II, et al. (Wachovia)</b>		
Robert M. Kornreich cw CLS, CBW re status of appeal.	3/12/2012	0.50
Shirley Joseph Respond to Wachovia Equity class member calls; forward info to Eric Schacter @ Rust Consulting	3/13/2012	0.50
Chet B. Waldman Rev'd. news of fed. case settlement	3/14/2012	0.10
Shirley Joseph Respond to Wachovia Equity class member calls; forward info to Eric Schacter @ Rust Consulting	3/14/2012	0.60
Shirley Joseph Respond to Wachovia Equity class member calls; forward info to Eric Schacter @ Rust Consulting	3/15/2012	0.40
Shirley Joseph Respond to Wachovia Equity class member calls; forward info to Eric Schacter @ Rust Consulting	3/16/2012	0.50
Shirley Joseph Respond to Wachovia Equity class member calls; forward info to Eric Schacter @ Rust Consulting	3/19/2012	0.70
Shirley Joseph Field Wachovia Equity class member calls	3/28/2012	0.20
Shirley Joseph Respond to Wachovia Equity class member calls; forward info to Eric Schacter @ Rust Consulting	3/30/2012	0.50
Shirley Joseph Field Equity class member calls	4/3/2012	0.40
Shirley Joseph Respond to Wachovia Equity class member calls; forward info to Eric Schacter @ Rust Consulting	4/4/2012	0.50
Shirley Joseph Field call from class member in equity case	4/9/2012	0.10
Shirley Joseph Field call from class members	4/10/2012	0.20
Shirley Joseph Field call from class members	4/11/2012	0.20
Shirley Joseph Field ERISA class member call (Sharon Harris 404.762.1851); tcw/Keller Rohrback re same	4/16/2012	0.20
Shirley Joseph Respond to Wachovia Equity & ERISA class member calls; forward info to Eric Schacter @ Rust Consulting	4/16/2012	0.40
Chet B. Waldman Emails w/AD, DF, to RMK; mtgs. w/CLS, LLL re: Sup. Ct.'s failure to review Cert. petition on Friday	4/16/2012	0.30
Carl L. Stine Mtg w/CBW re cert pet.	4/16/2012	0.10
Shirley Joseph Field calls from Wachovia Equity class members	4/24/2012	0.30

**Matter**

<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Date Worked</b>	<b>Hours</b>
<b>1768 / 3253 Irving Ehrenhaus (40) / Ehrenhaus v. John D. Baker II, et al. (Wachovia)</b>		
Shirley Joseph	4/25/2012	0.10
	Field call from Wachovia Equity class member; emailed info to Claims admin	
Shirley Joseph	4/26/2012	0.30
	Field 2 calls from Wachovia Equity class members John Masso 856.625.8369, Thomas Richardson 336.391.7233); emailed info to Claims admin	
Shirley Joseph	5/1/2012	0.50
	Field calls from Wachovia Equity class members; emailed info to Claims admin	
Shirley Joseph	5/3/2012	0.40
	Field calls from Wachovia Equity class members; emailed info to Claims admin	
Shirley Joseph	5/11/2012	0.30
	Field calls from Wachovia Equity settlement class member	
Shirley Joseph	5/14/2012	0.10
	Field call from Wachovia Equity settlement class member	
Chet B. Waldman	5/14/2012	0.20
	Emails w/defts' N.C. counsel; mtgs. w/RMK, CLS re: N.C. Sup. Ct. cert. status	
Carl L. Stine	5/14/2012	0.20
	Mtg w/CBW, RMK re cert pet.	
Robert M. Kornreich	5/14/2012	0.20
	cw CBW, CLS.	
Shirley Joseph	5/17/2012	0.20
	Field calls from Equity class members and forward to claims admin	
Shirley Joseph	5/21/2012	0.20
	Field calls from Equity class members and forward to claims admin	
Shirley Joseph	6/6/2012	0.10
	Field call from Wachovia Equity settlement class member; email info to claims admin	
Shirley Joseph	6/7/2012	0.10
	Field call from Wachovia Equity settlement class member;	
Shirley Joseph	6/11/2012	0.10
	Field call from Wachovia Equity settlement class member; email info to claims admin	
Shirley Joseph	6/12/2012	0.10
	Field call from Wachovia Equity settlement class member; email info to claims admin	
Chet B. Waldman	6/14/2012	0.20
	emails b/n CLS & A. Doerr re: fact S. Ct still didnt rule on petition	
Carl L. Stine	6/14/2012	0.20
	check NC Sup Ct docket and email re same	
Shirley Joseph	6/15/2012	0.90
	Field class member call; rev var Wachovia class actions and email inof re same	

**Matter**

<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Date Worked</b>	<b>Hours</b>
<b>1768 / 3253 Irving Ehrenhaus (40) / Ehrenhaus v. John D. Baker II, et al. (Wachovia)</b>		
Shirley Joseph Field class member call	6/20/2012	0.10
Shirley Joseph Field equity class member calls	6/26/2012	0.30
Shirley Joseph Field class member calls	7/12/2012	0.20
Shirley Joseph Field class member calls	7/13/2012	0.30
Shirley Joseph Field class member calls	7/18/2012	0.30
Chet B. Waldman Emails w/AD, to CLS, RMK re: check of Ct. & confirmation that it still hasn't ruled on the appeal	8/24/2012	0.30
Shirley Joseph Respond to class member ltr re settlement	9/28/2012	0.30
Chet B. Waldman Emails w/LLL, RMK, CLS re: Friday's calendar on cert. petitions	10/1/2012	0.10
Chet B. Waldman Emails w/CLS, N.C. counsel, p/c w/RMK re: N.C. Sup. Ct.'s failure to deal w/outstanding cert. petition	10/5/2012	0.30
Robert M. Kornreich cw CBW.	10/5/2012	0.10
Shirley Joseph Field class member call	10/10/2012	0.10
Shirley Joseph Field class member Lucerezia Whitehead's call and per request mail copy of Judge's final order re settlement w/cover ltr	10/11/2012	0.50
Shirley Joseph Field class member call; email info re ERISA settlement	10/16/2012	0.10
Shirley Joseph Field class member call re status	10/22/2012	0.10
Shirley Joseph field call from class member	11/12/2012	0.10
Shirley Joseph Forward inquiry info to claims admin	12/4/2012	0.10
Chet B. Waldman Rec'd. N.C. Sup. Ct. Order denying Objector's Cert. petition; p/cs, emails w/CLS, emails from depts' counsel in this connection	12/14/2012	0.30
Carl L. Stine Emails re Sup. Ct. decision; tel w/RMK re same; rev. status of draft brief; tel. w/CBW	12/14/2012	1.80
Robert M. Kornreich	12/14/2012	0.30

**Matter**

<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Date Worked</b>	<b>Hours</b>
1768 / 3253 Irving Ehrenhaus (40) / Ehrenhaus v. John D. Baker II, et al. (Wachovia) cw CLS re decision		

Totals for 1768 / 3253 Irving Ehrenhaus (40) / Ehrenhaus v. John D. Baker II, et al. (Wachovia

W:\PROVANTAGE\REPORTS\CRYSTALWIP\Fees Listing.rpt